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Week Ending Friday, December 13, 1991

Remarks to the Pearl Harbor Survivors
Association in Honolulu, Hawaii
December 7, 1991

The President. Please be seated, every-
body. And, Jerry Glaubitz, thank you, sir.
Thank you for your dedication. Thank you
for your leadership to this wonderful orga-
nization.

May I salute Secretary Ed Derwinski,
Reverend Morgan, and most of all, fellow
veterans.

From this sacred ground near the waters
of Pearl Harbor, we remember the moment
when the Pacific Ocean erupted in a storm
of fire and blood. We remember a morning
when America, where some thought isola-
tion meant security, awoke wounded, and
reeling, plunged into a desperate fight for
world freedom.

I remember the crackle of the radio and
the voice of our President. "We are going
to win the war," FDR told us, "and we are
going to win the peace that follows." We
won the war and secured the peace because
American men and women responded
bravely and instinctively to their Nation's
call. Within hours after the cruel surprise
attack began, many died, having done what
came naturally: They fought for their family
and friends, defending the land they loved.
They did not set out to become heroes, but
they did.

When torpedoes crippled the U.S.S. Cali-
fornia's ammunition hoists, Warrant Officer
Thomas Reeves stood in a smoke-filled pas-
sageway and organized a human supply
chain to move the ammunition. He worked
with all his might till the smoke overcame
him. He died that day aboard California,
and he rests today in this cemetery.

During the attack, Chief Boatswain Eddie
Hill of the U.S.S. Nevada swam from the
dock back out to his ship, ignoring the
bombs falling all around him. He, too, died
in the attack and rests here.

The Bible says, "Love is strong as death."
To die for country, for family: that is the
truth whispered by these rows of markers.

I remember Ernie Pyle, and I'll bet ev-
erybody behind me and in front of me re-
members Ernie Pyle, too. The greatest of
war correspondents, he fell to the enemy
machinegun fire on Ie Shima7 He lies here
in this cemetery among the GI's he loved
and honored so well. His plain-spoken news
dispatches from the front reminded us that
behind the battle statistics were true-life
stories of how boys became men and men
became heroes.

He told us what was happening in the
war, how our men were fighting. And by
telling the stories of our servicemen to their
hometowns and neighborhoods, he helped
us understand why we were fighting, how
our men at arms defended with all their
hearts America's deepest ideals.

Americans did not wage war against na-
tions or races. We fought for freedom and
human dignity against the nightmare of to-
talitarianism. The world must never forget
that the dictatorships we fought, the Hitler
and Tojo regimes, committed war crimes
and atrocities. Our servicemen struggled
and sacrificed not only in defense of our
free way of life, but also in the hope that
the blessings of liberty some day might
extend to all peoples.

Our cause was just and honorable, but not
every American action was fully fair. This
ground embraces many American veterans
whose love of country was put to the test
unfairly by our own authorities. These and
other natural-born American citizens faced
wartime internment, and they committed
no crime. They were sent to internment
camps simply because their ancestors were
Japanese. Other Asian-Americans suffered
discrimination, and even violence, because
they were mistaken for Japanese. And they,
too, were innocent victims, who committed
no offense.

Here lie valiant servicemen of the 442d
Regimental Combat Team and of the Mili-
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tary Intelligence Service, Americans of Jap-
anese ancestry who fought to defeat the
Axis in Europe and in the Pacific. Among
these, the late Senator Spark Matsunaga, a
combat hero and survivor who went on to
help lead postwar Hawaii to American
statehood.

I remember sharing danger and friend-
ship in these skies and on this ocean. Some
of my closest friends, like many people
here, your closest friends, never came
home. Perhaps because of this experience, I
can better understand what you survivors of
Pearl Harbor are sensing and feeling here
today. As all the veterans here know, when
a friend or comrade in arms falls in battle,
war grabs a part of your soul.

My roommate aboard the carrier San Ja-
cinto, CVL-30, was a guy named Jim
Wykes. And as we were about to go into
combat for the first time, a strike over
Wake Island, Jim Wykes and his crew were
sent out on a search mission from which
they never returned.

Many more from our little torpedo squad-
ron were to give their lives. And the names
of many of these, and more than 18,000
other World War II servicemen lost in
action in the Pacific, are engraved in the
walls of this magnificent memorial.

During every passage of my life, I've
often thought of those who never returned.
Some left children behind, and today those
children, like my own kids, are raising chil-
dren of their own. And thank God, each
surviving generation has honored the
memory of our heroes of the Second World
War. Each new generation has risen to
meet the challenge of winning the peace.

After vanquishing the dictators of Japan
and Germany and Italy, America's war gen-
eration helped those countries rebuild and
grow strong in the exercise of democracy
and free enterprise. They affirmed again
that our quarrel had not been with races or
nations.

The American victors welcomed the new
leaders of Japan and Germany and Italy
into alliances that won the cold war and
helped prevent the third world war. Amer-
ica and our wartime allies joined hands with
the liberated peoples of our former foes to
create and nurture international organiza-
tions aimed at protecting human rights, col-
lective security, and economic growth.

Winning the peace, then as now, de-
mands preparedness. The cause of harmony
among nations is not a call for pacifism. We
avoided a third world war because we were
prepared to defend the free world against
aggressors. The Pearl Harbor generation
saw its younger brothers go to Korea, its
sons to Vietnam to resist communism. Pearl
Harbor's grandchildren answered the call to
the Persian Gulf to reverse Saddam's ag-
gression against Kuwait.

How fitting it is that this great cemetery
holds so many who died for the cause of
Korean and Vietnamese freedom. How hon-
ored we are to stand on this ground, conse-
crated with the remains of Marine Lance
Corporal Frank Allen of Hawaii, who gave
his life just 10 months ago in the battle to
free Kuwait.

Every soldier and sailor and airman
buried here offered his life so that others
might be free. Not one of them died in
vain. Our men and women who served in
Korea and Vietnam, whose sacrifices too
often have been forgotten or even reviled,
are nearing their day of greatest vindica-
tion. For I have confidence that the tragedy
of totalitarianism has entered its final scene
everywhere on this Earth.

This morning's sun will course the Pacific
skies and illuminate the lands of Asia. And
just as certainly, the movement of human
freedom will supplant dictatorships that
now hold sway in Pyongyang and Rangoon
and Hanoi, and yes, in China, too. For a
billion yearning men and women, the
future means freedom and democracy.

This fair December dawn breaks on a
world ready for renewal. A high tide of
hope swells for those that are committed to
peace and freedom. The nations pushed by
tyrants into war against us half a century
ago join us today as free and constructive
partners in the effort for peace. The Soviet
Communists' designs for world domination
have collapsed before the free world's re-
solve.

We've reached this morning because gen-
eration after generation of Americans kept
faith with our founders and our heroes.
From the snows of Valley Forge, to the
fiery seas of Midway and Pearl Harbor, to
the sands of Iraq and Kuwait, Americans
lived and died true to their ideals. They
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have prepared the way for a world of un-
precedented freedom and cooperation. And
thank God you Pearl Harbor survivors are
here today to see this come to pass.

Today, as we remember the sacrifices of
our countrymen, I salute all of you, the sur-
vivors of Pearl Harbor. And I ask all Ameri-
cans to join me in a prayer: Lord, give our
rising generations the wisdom to cherish
their freedom and security as hard-won
treasures. Lord, give them the same cour-
age that pulsed in the blood of their fathers.

May God bless you all, and may God bless
the United States of America. Thank you
very much.

Note: The President spoke at 6:53 a.m. at
the National Cemetery of the Pacific. In his
remarks, he referred to Gerald Glaubitz,
president of the Pearl Harbor Survivors As-
sociation; and Reverend Joseph Morgan, a
member of the Pearl Harbor Survivors Asso-
ciation.

Remarks at a Ceremony
Commemorating the 50th Anniversary
of Pearl Harbor
December 7, 1991

Thank you, Captain Ross. Thank you, sir.
To our Secretary of Defense and our Chair-
man of our Joint Chiefs; members of our
Cabinet; distinguished Governors here; and
so many Members of the United States Con-
gress; Admiral Larson; members of our
Armed Forces, then and now; family and
friends of the Arizona and Utah; fellow vet-
erans. Thank you very much for that intro-
duction, Don, and thank you all for that
welcome.

It was a bright Sunday morning. Thou-
sands of troops slept soundly in their bunks.
Some who were awake looked out and sa-
vored the still and tranquil harbor.

And on the stern of the U.S.S. Nevada, a
brass band prepared to play "The Star
Spangled Banner." On other ships, sailors
readied for the 8 a.m. flag raising. Ray
Emory, who was on the Honolulu, read the
morning newspaper. Aboard California,

yeoman Durell Connor wrapped Christmas
presents. On the West Virginia, a machin-
ist's mate looked at the photos just received
from his wife. And they were of his 8-
month-old son whom he had never seen.

On the mainland, people listened to the
football games on the radio, turned to songs
like the "Chattanooga Choo-Choo," comics
like "Terry and the Pirates," movies like
"Sergeant York." In New York, families
went window-shopping. Out West, it was
late morning, many families still at church.

At first, to the American sailors at Pearl,
the hum of engines sounded routine, and
why not? To them, the idea of war seemed
palpable but remote. And then, in one hor-
rible instant, they froze in disbelief. The
abstract threat was suddenly real.

But these men did not panic. They raced
to their stations, and some strapped pistols
over pajamas, and fought and died. And
what lived was the shock wave that soon
swept across America, forever immortaliz-
ing December 7th, 1941. Ask anyone who
endured that awful Sunday. Each felt like
the writer who observed: "Life is never
again as it was before anyone you love has
died; never so innocent, never so gentle,
never so pliant to your will."

Today we honor those who gave their
lives at this place, half a century ago. Their
names were Bertie and Gomez and Dough-
erty and Granger. And they came from
Idaho and Mississippi, the sweeping farm-
land of Ohio. And they were of all races
and colors, native-born and foreign-born.
And most of all, of course, they were Amer-
icans.

Think of how it was for these heroes of
the Harbor, men who were also husbands,
fathers, brothers, sons. Imagine the chaos of
guns and smoke, flaming water, and ghastly
carnage. Two thousand, four hundred and
three Americans gave their lives. But in this
haunting place, they live forever in our
memory, reminding us gently, selflessly,
like chimes in the distant night.

Every 15 seconds a drop of oil still rises
from the Arizona and drifts to the surface.
As it spreads across the water, we recall the
ancient poet: "In our sleep, pain that
cannot forget falls drop by drop upon the
heart, and in our own despair against our
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will comes wisdom through the awful grace
of God." With each drop, it is as though
God Himself were crying. He cries, as we
do, for the living and the dead: men like
Commander Duncan Curry, firing a .45 at
an attacking plane as tears streamed down
his face.

We remember machinist's mate Robert
Scott, who ran the air compressors power-
ing the guns aboard California. And when
the compartment flooded, the crew evacu-
ated; Scott refused. "This is my station," he
said, "I'm going to stay as long as the guns
are going." And nearby, aboard New Orle-
ans, the cruiser, Chaplain Forgy assured his
troops it was all right to miss church that
day. His words became legend: "You can
praise the Lord and pass the ammunition."

Captain Ross, right here, then a warrant
officer or was it a chief, was awarded the
Congressional Medal of Honor for his hero-
ism aboard Nevada that day. I salute him,
the other Congressional Medal winners
with us today, wherever they may be also.

For the defenders of Pearl, heroism came
as naturally as breath. They reacted instinc-
tively by rushing to their posts. They knew
as well that our Nation would be sustained
by the nobility of its cause.

So did Americans of Japanese ancestry
who came by the hundreds to give wound-
ed Americans blood, and the thousands of
their kinsmen all across America who took
up arms for their country. Every American
believed in the cause.

The men I speak of would be embar-
rassed to be called heroes. Instead, they
would tell you, probably with defiance:
"Foes can sink American ships, but not the
American spirit. They may kill us, but
never the ideals that made us proud to
serve."

Talk to those who survived to fight an-
other day. They would repeat the Navy
hymn that Barbara and I sing every Sunday
in the lovely little chapel up at Camp
David: "Eternal Father, strong to save,
Whose arm hath bound the restless wave

0 hear us when we cry to Thee, For
those in peril on the sea."

Back in 1942, June of '42, I remember
how Henry Stimson, the Secretary of War,
defined the American soldier, and how that
soldier should be, and I quote: "Brave with-
out being brutal, self-confident without

boasting, being part of an irresistible might
without losing faith in individual liberty."

The heroes of the Harbor engraved that
passage on every heart and soul. They
fought for a world of peace, not war, where
children's dreams speak more loudly than
the brashest tyrant's guns. Because of them,
this memorial lives to pass its lessons from
one generation to the next, lessons as clear
as this Pacific sky.

One of Pearl Harbor's lessons is that to-
gether we could "summon lightness against
the dark"; that was Dwight Eisenhower.
Another, that when it comes to national de-
fense, finishing second means finishing last.

World War II also taught us that isolation-
ism is a bankrupt notion. The world does
not stop at our water's edge. And perhaps
above all, that real peace, real peace, the
peace that lasts, means the triumph of free-
dom, not merely the absence of war.

And as we look down at-Barbara and I
just did-at Arizona's sunken hull, tomb to
more than 1,000 Americans, the beguiling
calm comforts us, reminds us of the might
of ideals that inspire boys to die as men.
Everyone who aches at their sacrifice
knows America must be forever vigilant.
And Americans must always remember the
brave and the innocent who gave their lives
to keep us free.

Each Memorial Day, not far from this
spot, the heroes of Pearl Harbor are hon-
ored. Two leis are placed upon each grave
by Hawaiian Boy Scouts and Girl Scouts.
We must never forget that it is for them,
the future, that we must apply the lessons
of the past.

In Pearl Harbor's wake, we won the war
and, thus, the peace. In the cold war that
followed, Americans also shed their blood,
but we used other means as well. For
nearly half a century, patience, foresight,
personal diplomacy helped America stand
fast and firm for democracy.

But we've never stood alone. Beside us
stood nations committed to democracy and
free markets and free expression and free-
dom of worship, nations that include our
former enemies, Germany, Italy, and Japan.
This year these same nations stood with us
against aggression in the Persian Gulf.

You know, the war in the Gulf was so
different: different enemy, different cir-
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cumstances, the outcome never in doubt. It
was short; thank God our casualties merci-
fully few. But I ask you veterans of Pearl
Harbor and all Americans who remember
the unity of purpose that followed that mo-
mentous December day 50 years ago:
Didn't we see that same strength of nation-
al spirit when we launched Desert Storm?

The answer is a resounding "yes." Once
the war for Kuwait began, we pulled to-
gether. We were united, determined, and
we were confident. And when it was over,
we rejoiced in exactly the same way that
we did in 1945-heads high, proud, and
grateful. And what a feeling. Fifty years had
passed, but, let me tell you, the American
spirit is as young and fresh as ever.

This unity of purpose continues to inspire
us in the cause of peace among nations. In
their own way, amidst the bedlam and the
anguish of that awful day, the men of Pearl
Harbor served that noble cause, honored it.
They knew the things worth living for but
also worth dying for: Principle, decency, fi-
delity, honor.

And so, look behind you at battleship
row-behind me, the gun turret still visible,
and the flag flying proudly from a truly
blessed shrine.

Look into your hearts and minds: You will
see boys who this day became men and
men who became heroes.

Look at the water here, clear and quiet,
bidding us to sum up and remember. One
day, in what now seems another lifetime, it
wrapped its arms around the finest sons any
nation could ever have, and it carried them
to a better world.

May God bless them. And may God bless
America, the most wondrous land on Earth.

Note: The President spoke at 8:10 a.m. from
the US.S. Arizona Memorial at Pearl
Harbor, Hawaii. He was introduced by Cap-
tain Donald K. Ross, retired US. Navy, a
surviving crewmember of the US.S. Nevada
and Congressional Medal of Honor recipi-
ent. During his remarks, the President re-
ferred to Admiral Charles Larson, Com-
mander in Chief, US. Pacific Command.
Following his remarks, the President met
with survivors of the Pearl Harbor attack.

Remarks to World War II Veterans and
Families in Honolulu, Hawaii
December 7, 1991

Mrs. Rickert, thank you for that wonder-
ful tale of how it was at Hospital Point.
Thank you for that warm and generous in-
troduction. And now I have a favor to ask of
you. I hope you and everyone else will take
a deep breath for me too, please. [Laugh-
ter] You didn't need it, but I might; this is a
very emotional day.

I would like to salute the members of my
Cabinet that are here today, particularly
Dick Cheney, our able Secretary of Defense
who's done so much for the military, so
much in terms of leadership for our Nation.
I want to salute General Powell, the Chair-
man of our Joint Chiefs of Staff, and again
take this opportunity on this historic day to
thank him for his leadership, his inspiration-
al leadership, for all the men and women
that serve in the Armed Forces. I want to
thank the commander in chief of the Pacific
Fleet, Admiral Larson. And I especially
want to single out all the fellow veterans
here, particularly those who are the survi-
vors, the survivors of this historic day.

I expect if we went around the room, all
of us would remember. I remember exactly
when I first heard the news about Pearl
Harbor. I was 17 years old, walking across
the green at school. And my thoughts in
those days didn't turn to world events, but
mainly to simpler things, more mundane
things, like making the basketball team or
entering college. And that walk across the
campus marked an end of innocence for
me.

When Americans heard the news, they
froze in shock. But just as quickly we came
together. Like all American kids back then,
I was swept up in it. I decided that very
day to go into the Navy to become a Navy
pilot. And so on my 18th birthday, June
12th, 1942, I was sworn into the Navy as a
seaman second class.

And I was shocked, I was shocked at my
first sight of Pearl Harbor several months
later, April of '44. We came into port on the
CVL-30, on the carrier San Jacinto.
Nearby, the Utah was still on her side; parts
of the Arizona still stood silent in the water.
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Everywhere the skeletons of ships reached
out as if to demand remembrance and warn
us of our own mortality.

Over 2,000 men died in a matter of min-
utes on this site, a half a century ago. Many
more died that same day as Japanese forces
assaulted the Philippines and Guam and
Wake Island, Midway, Malaya, Thailand,
Singapore, Hong Kong. On that day of
infamy, Pearl Harbor propelled each of us
into a titanic contest for mankind's future.
It galvanized the American spirit as never,
ever before into a single-minded resolve
that could produce only one thing: victory.

Churchill knew it as soon as he heard the
news. He'd faced the Nazi conquest of
Europe, the blitz of London, the terror of
the U-boats. But when America was at-
tacked, he declared there was "no more
doubt about the end." He knew then that
the American spirit would not fail the cause
of freedom. The enemy mistook our diversi-
ty, our Nation's diversity, for weakness. But
Pearl Harbor became a rallying cry for men
and women from all walks of life, all colors
and creeds. And in the end, this unity of
purpose made us invincible in war and now
makes us secure in peace.

The next day, President Roosevelt pro-
claimed the singular American objective:
"With confidence in our Armed Forces,
with the unbounding determination of our
people, we will gain the inevitable triumph,
so help us, God." It was the steadfastness of
the American people that would "win the
war" and "win the peace that follows."

We triumphed in both, despite the fact
that the American people did not want to
be drawn into the conflict; "the unsought
war," it's been called. Ironically, isolationists
gathered together at what was known in
those days as an "American First" rally in
Pittsburgh at precisely the moment the first
Americans met early, violent deaths right
here at Pearl Harbor. The isolationists failed
to see that the seeds of Pearl Harbor were
sown back in 1919, when a victorious
America decided that in the absence of a
threatening enemy abroad, we should turn
all of our energies inward. That notion of
isolationism flew escort for the very bomb-
ers that attacked our men 50 years ago.

Again, in 1945, some called for America's
return to isolationism, as if abandoning
world leadership was the prerequisite for

dealing with pressing matters back home.
And they were rudely awakened by the
brutal reality of the Iron Curtain, the Soviet
blockade of Berlin, and the Communist in-
vasion of South Korea.

And now we stand triumphant, for the
third time this century, this time in the
wake of the cold war. As in 1919 and 1945,
we face no enemy menacing our security.
And yet we stand here today on the site of
a tragedy spawned by isolationism. And we
must learn, and this time avoid, the dangers
of today's isolationism and its economic ac-
complice, protectionism. To do otherwise,
to believe that turning our backs on the
world would improve our lot here at home,
is to ignore the tragic lessons of the 20th
century.

The fact is, this country has enjoyed its
most lasting growth and security when we
rejected isolationism, both political and eco-
nomic, in favor of engagement and leader-
ship. We're a Pacific nation. And next
month in Asia, I'll discuss with our Pacific
friends and allies their responsibility to
share with us the challenges and burdens of
leadership in the post-cold war world.

The time has come for America's trading
partners, in Europe, Asia, and around the
world, to resolve that economic isolationism
is wrong. To the leaders of Japan in particu-
lar, I say: This solemn occasion should rein-
force our determination to join together in
a future energized by free markets and free
people. And so I'll continue to speak out
against the voices of isolationism and pro-
tectionism, both at home and abroad.

Fifty years ago, we paid a heavy price for
complacency and overconfidence. That too
is a lesson we shall never forget. To those
who have defended our country, from the
shores of Guadalcanal to the hills of Korea,
from the jungles of Vietnam to the sands of
Kuwait, I say this: We will always remem-
ber; we will always be prepared, prepared
to take on aggression, prepared to step for-
ward in reconciliation, and prepared to
secure the peace.

In remembering, it is important to come
to grips with the past. No nation can fully
understand itself or find its place in the
world if it does not look with clear eyes at
all the glories and disgraces, too, of the past.
We in the United States acknowledge such
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an injustice in our own history: The intern-
ment of Americans of Japanese ancestry
was a great injustice, and it will never be
repeated.

Today, all Americans should acknowledge
Japan's Prime Minister Miyazawa's national
statement of deep remorse concerning the
attack on Pearl Harbor. It was a thoughtful,
it was a difficult expression much appreciat-
ed by the people of the United States of
America.

The values we hold dear as a Nation-
equality of opportunity, freedom of religion
and speech and assembly, free and vigorous
elections-are now revered by many na-
tions. Our greatest victory in World War II
took place not on the field of battle, but in
nations we once counted as foes. The ideals
of democracy and liberty have triumphed
in a world once threatened with conquest
by tyranny and despotism.

Today as we celebrate the world's evolu-
tion toward freedom, we commemorate de-
mocracy's fallen heroes, the defenders of
freedom as well as the victims of dictator-
ship who never saw the light of liberty. Ear-
lier this year, when former adversaries
joined us in the stand against aggression in
the Persian Gulf, we affirmed the values
cherished by the heroes of the Harbor.

The friends I lost, that all of us lost,
upheld a great and noble cause. Because of
their sacrifice, the world now lives in great-
er freedom and peace than ever before. It
is right that all of us are here today. And it
is right that we go on from here.

As you know, I just paid my respects at
the Arizona, where it all began. And behind
us stands the Missouri, where it came to an
end. But the Missouri was also a beginning.
Soon after that, Emperor Hirohito went to
call on General MacArthur, who later noted
that the Emperor "played a major role in
the spiritual regeneration of Japan." Their
meeting made history, and a hopeful future
for a democratic Japan began to take shape.

I thought of that meeting with MacAr-
thur when I attended the Emperor's funer-
al in 1989. I thought of it this morning, too,
at the National Cemetery of the Pacific and
then at the Arizona Memorial.

As you look back on life and retrace the
steps that made you the person you are,
you pick out the turning points, the defin-
ing moments. Over the years, Pearl Harbor

still defines a part of who I am. To every
veteran here, and indeed to all Americans,
Pearl Harbor defines a part of who you are.

Recently a letter arrived from the son of
a Pearl Harbor survivor, a Navy man
named Bill Leu, who is with us here today.
His son writes from his home, now in
Tokyo, saying: "'A half century ago, my fa-
ther's thoughts were on surviving the attack
and winning the war. He could not have
envisioned a future where his son would
study and work in Japan. But he recognizes
that the world has changed, that America's
challenges are different. My father's atti-
tude represents that of the United States:
Do your duty, and raise the next generation
to do its."

I can understand Bill's feelings. I won-
dered how I'd feel being with you, the vet-
erans of Pearl Harbor, the survivors, on this
very special day. And I wondered if I would
feel that intense hatred that all of us felt for
the enemy 50 years ago. As I thought back
to that day of infamy and the loss of friends,
I wondered: What will my reaction be
when I go back to Pearl Harbor? What will
their reaction be, the other old veterans,
especially those who survived that terrible
day right here?

Well, let me tell you how I feel. I have no
rancor in my heart towards Germany or
Japan, none at all. And I hope, in spite of
the loss, that you have none in yours. This is
no time for recrimination.

World War II is over. It is history. We
won. We crushed totalitarianism. And when
that was done, we helped our enemies give
birth to democracies. We reached out, both
in Europe and in Asia. We made our en-
emies our friends, and we healed their
wounds. And in the process, we lifted our-
selves up.

The lessons of the war itself will live on,
and well they should: Preparedness;
strength; decency and honor; courage; sacri-
fice; the willingness to fight, even die, for
one's country-America, the land of the
free and the brave.

No, just speaking for one guy, I have no
rancor in my heart. I can still see the faces
of the fallen comrades, and I'll bet you can
see the faces of your fallen comrades too, or
family members. But don't you think
they're saying, "Fifty years have passed; our
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country is the undisputed leader of the free
world, and we are at peace."? Don't you
think each one is saying, "I did not die in
vain."?

May God bless each of you who sacrificed
and served. And may God grant His loving
protection to this, the greatest country on
the face of the Earth, the United States of
America.

Thank you all, and God bless you. Thank
you very much.

Note: The President spoke at 9:20 a.m. from
Kilo 8 Pier in Honolulu, Hawaii. He was
introduced by Lenore Rickert, retired US.
Navy nurse and a survivor of the Pearl
Harbor attack.

Remarks at Half-Time During the
Army-Navy Football Game
December 7, 1991

Well, first let me salute all that are there
at that wonderful Army-Navy contest. I un-
derstand you have a great ballgame under-
way.

Over my shoulder, perhaps you can see
the picture of Arizona where the war start-
ed, World War II, on December 7th, 50
years ago. And now I'm talking to you also
from the deck of the Missouri where the
war ended on September 2d, 1945. And I
must tell you this has been a very emotional
day for the survivors of Pearl Harbor. It's an
emotional day for those of us who served in
World War II, and it's an emotional day for
our entire country.

I think it is not a day for hatred. I think it
is not a day for rancor. I think it is a day for
healing and looking forward. And because
of the sacrifice of the people here at Pearl
Harbor and others that followed, yester-
day's enemies are now our friends. Yester-
day's hatred has now given way to feelings
of goodwill, partnership, friendly competi-
tion. And so it has been a moving day at
Pearl Harbor. And I, as Commander in
Chief of the forces, have been very proud
to be here.

Let me wish all of you at that wonderful
football game now the very best. And may I
say to the men and women of the U.S.

Naval Academy and the Army of the West
Point, thank you for your service to this, the
greatest country on the face of the Earth.
May God bless each and every one of you
who served the United States of America. It
is a special day, and all of you helped make
it a special day.

Thank you so much.

Note: The President spoke at 10:17 a.m.
aboard the US.S. Missouri in Pearl Harbor,
Hawaii. His remarks were broadcast live by
the American Broadcasting Company
during half-time of the Army-Navy football
game. Keith Jackson of ABC-Sports intro-
duced the President. A tape was not avail-
able for verification of the content of these
remarks.

Interview With Charles Bierbauer of
CNN at Pearl Harbor, Hawaii
December 7, 1991

Pearl Harbor

Q. This is Charles Bierbauer with Presi-
dent Bush on board the deck of the U.S.S.
Missouri.

Mr. President, thank you for joining us
with the Arizona Memorial behind us. As
you were there this morning, a day which
you've described as a very emotional one,
the sense of an apology from Japan for the
events at Pearl Harbor, how necessary is
that?

The President. I don't think it's necessary.
The Prime Minister very forthrightly ex-
pressed either regrets or remorse. I can't
remember the word that was used. But this
is a time for healing. This is a time for
looking forward.

We won the war. We made a tremendous
contribution to freedom by winning the
war-war ending right on the decks of this
very vessel. And this is not a time for re-
crimination or rancor. And so my message
is one of healing, of going forward-tough
competitors, being tough in competition for
business and markets, but not looking back
in the sense of bitterness and hatred.

Q. And yet you've heard from many of
the survivors a sense that they still-
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The President. Yes.
Q.-perhaps have that rancor. Can this

be a demarcation at this point?
The President. It should be a demarca-

tion. It should be a turning forward. And I
can understand the bitterness. What is it, a
thousand sailors still there in that tomb?
And dealing with those families today and
meeting them was for me very, very emo-
tional. But I really think this is a time to
look forward. And I can say to them, I un-
derstand part of what you're going through.
I lost a lot of fallen comrades, two room-
mates, many others. But this isn't the time
for recrimination. And I don't think most of
them feel that way. I think most of them
say, look, my husband, my son, my grandfa-
ther did not die in vain.

Anti-Japanese Sentiment

Q. A few months ago when you met with
then-Prime Minister Kaifu, he complained
about Japan bashing, about feeling unappre-
ciated over there. Why do you think that
persists?

The President. Well, I complained a little
bit about saying, "Hey, wait a minute,
there's some Europe bashing in Japan." And
I don't think it should exist in either coun-
try. And there's some nationalists there that
feel bitter about the United States. And
there's people in our country that feel
bitter about Japan and bash Japan-in other
words, instead of trying to compete better,
try to take it out on Japan.

I don't know why it is. I hope it is not
based on bigotry or some racial concept on
either side of the Pacific.

Q. Do you think it could be?
The President. I hope not, and I don't

want to say that. But we all know that back
in the days of World War II there was such
a feeling. I was there. I was a young man
then, and I remember it. But that's not the
case today. And I'm not saying there's no
residues of that nature, but if it is, we ought
to speak out against it. This is the time for
fair competition, and I'm going to take that
message to Japan. Fair, free markets, but
they've got to be fair. And let's do business
on that basis with respect. Let's recognize
that we've come together since the war.

They're democratic now. They were to-
talitarians and imperialists back then. And
so we shouldn't be recriminatory.

Administration of George Bush, 1991 / Dec. 7

Trade With Japan

Q. You will be in Japan in the beginning
of January.

The President. Yes.
Q. Does the message go beyond that? Are

you at a point where you can break this
logjam on trade?

The President. I hope so. I'm not sure
where the logjam-there are some things
that are moving; there are some things that
we feel we've been stonewalled on, to be
very candid. And I'm going to take a good,
tough message out there. And I expect they
will level with me where they feel we have
been discriminatory or being two-sided, say
one thing and do something else.

But that's the way we ought to do busi-
ness, look them in the eye and say, "Now,
wait a minute, you can't have a one-way
street. We want access to your markets."
But it shouldn't be based on what happened
here 50 years ago with some vestiges of
discrimination or recrimination.

Relations With Asian Nations

Q. Mr. President, a lot of people seem to
think that our relations with the Asian
countries, Japan among them, have been
based for the last several decades on a cir-
cling of the Soviet Union, a containment of
the Soviet Union. You don't have a Soviet
Union to contain anymore in the same
sense. How does that change your relation-
ship with Asia?

The President. I don't really feel that our
relationship with the Asian countries or
Japan is based on this concept of encircle-
ment. I feel that it should be based on ex-
panding markets, and expanding markets
means more jobs for the people in the
United States. So Pacific countries are our
biggest trading partners. So I don't think it's
based, that we ever based our relationship
with those countries on trying to encircle
the Soviet Union. They might have felt that
way-the old Soviet Union.

But I don't think today anybody feels that
our reaching out to Japan or our being with
Japan or Japan standing with us in the war
against Japan is because of encircling the
Soviet Union. I think it's much more sophis-
ticated than that, much more forward-look-
ing than that, and much more positive in
terms of the benefits to the American
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people, provided we can do better in get-
ting the access to the markets that I think
we must have.

Q. Mr. President, thank you very much
for joining us here on the U.S.S. Missouri.

The President. Some beautiful day out
here.

Q. It's a very beautiful day. Thank you.
The President. Thank you, sir.

Note: The interview began at 10:26 a.m.
aboard the US.S. Missouri A tape was not
available for verification of the content of
this interview.

Remarks at a Briefing by the National
Commission on AIDS
December 9, 1991

Lou, thank you. And let me just thank
Dr. Rogers and Dr. Osborn and, of course,
all the members of the AIDS Commission.
And let me tell them that I have great con-
fidence in the professionals in this Govern-
ment, from Dr. Sullivan on, the people out
at NIH, Dr. Roper, and so many others that
are working these problems.

And when you have something as devas-
tating and as scary as AIDS, I'm not sure
that our people that are working with such
compassion and such caring get the proper
credit. They're not in it for credit; they're
in it for trying to do something for human-
ity. And if I've ever seen a dedicated group
of professionals, I think they're sitting right
around this table.

Lou, I want to thank you for assembling
the team. Dr. Mason, of course, we're going
to hear from him; Tony Fauci, we know
how inspirational he's been; our Surgeon
General; head of NIH, Dr. Healy; and I
don't want to leave out my former White
House associate who's now branched off
into a new setting down there in Atlanta.

But no, we've got good people working it.
I think nobody ever has the total amount of
resource to bring to bear on a problem, and
yet I noted with interest what you said in
terms of the levels of funaing. And I'm very
anxious to hear from everybody. I, too,
would like to pay my respects to Belinda
Mason and also Kimberly.

But this is a tragic disease, and it is some-
thing that I'd like to find ways to be helpful
as President. In addition to the professional
aspects of all of this, I'd like to think that
there are some suggestions coming out of
this as to what we might be able to do to be
of more help from the White House. I'd like
to do it. Barbara, of course, feels the same
way. When she hugs those children, I think
it sends the proper message around the
country. And I'll never forget visits that
Tony and others out there arranged for me
quite a few months ago now, but it was
terribly moving. And some have suggested
that in some way it might have been help-
ful.

But all I'm saying here to you who are
giving so much of your lives and your love
and care to this, we do want to do what we
can to help. And I think we've got a good
program going, but I'd like to have the cri-
tique of that now from any-I don't know
whether you've got this all set up in an
orderly Sullivan manner, or are we just
dealer's choice here?

Note: The President spoke at 11:42 a.m. at
the Department of Health and Human
Services in Washington, DC. In his remarks,
he referred to Dr. June E. Osborne, Chair,
and Dr. David E Rogers, Vice Chair of the
Commission; Dr. William L. Roper, Director
of the Centers for Disease Control; Dr.
James 0. Mason, Assistant Secretary for
Health, Public Health Service; and Dr. An-
thony S. Fauci, Associate Director for AIDS
Research at the National Institutes of
Health. The President also mentioned AIDS
victims Kimberly Bergalis and Belinda
Mason, a former member of the Commis-
sion.

Remarks on Signing the High-
Performance Computing Act of 1991
December 9, 1991

Let me just thank you all for coming
today. And I'm pleased to sign into law the
High-Performance Computing Act of 1991.
This will implement the far-reaching initia-
tives on information technologies proposed
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to Congress in my fiscal year 1992 budget
earlier this year.

I'd like to thank Director Darman; my
science advisor Dr. Bromley; Secretary Wat-
kins and Secretary Mosbacher; Chairman
Boskin and Dick Truly, Administrator
Truly; Roger Porter; Director Massey, who
are with us today. And I'd like also to thank
Secretaries Cheney and Alexander who
couldn't be with us today, and Bill Reilly,
also missing, but all of them playing an in-
strumental part in all of this. And then all of
the other members of the administration
that helped develop this initiative and
secure enactment of this historic bill.

The development of high-performance
computing and communications technology
offers the potential to transform radically
the way in which all Americans will work,
learn, and communicate in the future. It
holds the promise of changing society as
much as the other great inventions of the
20th century, including the telephone, air
travel, and radio and TV.

This program will help researchers meet
the grand challenges in science: To unlock
the secrets of DNA, to forecast severe
weather events, and to discover new super-
conducting materials.

It is no surprise that America holds the
lead in high-performance information tech-
nology. Our greatest technological strides
have been made possible by the unique
qualities of American society: Freedom, in-
novation, entrepreneurial spirit, a combina-
tion found nowhere else in the world. And
this program will sustain and extend that
leadership position.

The high-performance computing initia-
tive is part of an overall strategy, advanced
by this administration to enhance our com-
petitiveness. My $76 billion R&D budget
proposal for this year included increased in-
vestment in both basic research and in ad-
ditional key areas of applied research, such
as material science, advance manufacturing,
biotechnology, and energy-related R&D.

In addition to these critical investments
in R&D, we've been working to prepare
America to compete in the next century by
opening up foreign markets to U.S. export
through a new GATT round and a North
American free-trade agreement, proposing
tax policies, such as making permanent
R&D tax credit, and reducing taxes on cap-

ital gains to promote long-term investment,
and preparing our work force to compete
through sharp increases in funding for math
and science education and through our
America 2000 broad reform initiative.

The initiative involves eight .Federal
agencies, all of which would contribute to
development of this new technology, and
would share in its benefits. Private industry
will work closely with Federal agencies and
labs in the planning, funding, and manage-
ment of this initiative to ensure that the
fruits of this research program will be
brought into the educational and commer-
cial marketplaces just as soon as possible.

The high-performance computing initia-
tive is an excellent example of the philoso-
phy of this administration: To invest in the
future, to create new jobs and new opportu-
nities for sustained economic growth. It is
also an excellent example of how Govern-
ment, industry, and academia can work to-
gether to develop new and important tech-
nologies.

And so, once again, welcome. And with
that, it gives me great pleasure now to sign
this legislation which will benefit Americans
today and on into the next century.

Note: The President spoke at 1:31 p.m. in
the Roosevelt Room at the White House. S.
272, approved December 9, was assigned
Public Law No. 102-194.

Statement on Signing Legislation To
Study the Feasibility of Establishing a
Native American Cultural Center
December 9, 1991

Today I am signing into law H.R. 3370,
an Act to direct the Secretary of the Interi-
or to carry out a study and make recom-
mendations to the Congress regarding the
feasibility of establishing a Native American
cultural center in Oklahoma City, Oklaho-
ma.

I am signing this bill notwithstanding a
provision that purports to require the Sec-
retary of the Interior to report the results of
a certain study together with his "recom-
mendations" to the Congress. Were this
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provision construed to require an executive
branch officer to submit legislative recom-
mendations to the Congress, it would be
constitutionally objectionable. Because Arti-
cle II, section 3 of the Constitution vests the
President with exclusive authority to decide
whether and when the executive branch
should propose legislation, this provision
will be construed as only advisory and not
requiring legislative recommendations.

George Bush

The White House,
December 9, 1991.

Note: H.R. 3370, approved December 9, was
assigned Public Law No. 102-196.

Proclamation 6390-Human Rights
Day, Bill of Rights Day, and Human
Rights Week, 1991
December 9, 1991
By the President of the United States

of America

A Proclamation

When the Federal Convention ended in
September 1787 and our Constitution was
presented to the States for ratification, it
was hailed by many as a triumph for liberty
and self-government. "The Constitution,"
wrote Thomas Jefferson, "is unquestionably
the wisest ever yet presented to men." Still,
he and others voiced concern that it did not
contain a declaration enumerating the
rights of individuals. To Jefferson such a
declaration was "what no just government
should refuse or rest on inferences."

Opponents to the idea argued that a bill
of rights would be unnecessary and perhaps
even harmful, should it invite disregard for
any rights that were not expressly stated. In
their view, the Constitution that began with
the words "We the People" clearly affirmed
the sovereignty of the American public. But
Jefferson and others persisted, noting that a
declaration of rights would serve "as a sup-
plement to the Constitution where that is
silent." James Madison conceded that such a
declaration might prove valuable because
"political truths declared in that solemn

manner acquire by degrees the character of
fundamental maxims of free government."
Today his words seem prophetic.

Our Bill of Rights guarantees, among
other basic liberties, freedom of speech and
of the press, as well as freedom of religion
and association; it recognizes the right to
keep and bear arms; and it prohibits unrea-
sonable search and seizure of a person's
home, papers, or possessions. The Bill of
Rights also states that no person shall be
deprived of life, liberty, or property without
due process of law and establishes funda-
mental rules of fairness in judicial proceed-
ings, including the right to trial by jury.
Since it was ratified on December 15, 1791,
the principles enshrined in this great docu-
ment have not only served as the guiding
tenets of American government but also in-
spired the advance of freedom around the
globe.

When it adopted the Universal Declara-
tion of Human Rights on December 10,
1948, the General Assembly of the United
Nations affirmed for all humankind the
ideals enshrined in our Bill of Rights.
Noting that "human rights should be pro-
tected by the rule of law," and describing
the Declaration as "a common standard of
achievement for all peoples and all na-
tions," signatories agreed to respect free-
dom of thought, freedom of conscience, as
well as freedom of religion and belief. They
declared that "everyone has the right to
life, liberty, and the security of person,"
and they recognized that all human beings
are entitled to equal protection of the law.
Signatories to the Declaration also recog-
nized an individual's right to participate in
the government of his or her country,
either directly or through freely chosen
representatives.

The Universal Declaration of Human
Rights reasserted what we Americans have
always believed: that recognition of these
rights "is the foundation of freedom, justice,
and peace in the world." This ideal was
reaffirmed and strengthened in the 1975
Helsinki Final Act of the Conference on
Security and Cooperation in Europe and
more recently in the 1990 Charter of Paris.

Today we stand closer than ever to
achieving universal compliance with the
letter and spirit of international human
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rights agreements. Two hundred years after
the ratification of our Bill of Rights, the
principles it enshrines continue to take root
around the world.

Having triumphed over communism,
many peoples and nations now confront the
challenge of improving respect for human
rights among various ethnic and religious
groups, as well as members of national mi-
norities. The United States will continue to
urge these and all nations to abide by inter-
national human rights agreements and to
act in the spirit of political pluralism and
tolerance-traditions that have made Amer-
ica's diversity a source of pride and
strength.

Now, Therefore, I, George Bush, Presi-
dent of the United States of America, by
virtue of the authority vested in me by the
Constitution and laws of the United States,
do hereby proclaim December 10, 1991, as
Human Rights Day and December 15,
1991, as Bill of Rights Day and call upon all
Americans to observe the week beginning
December 10, 1991, as Human Rights
Week.

In Witness Whereof, I have hereunto set
my hand this ninth day of December, in the
year of our Lord nineteen hundred and
ninety-one, and of the Independence of the
United States of America the two hundred
and sixteenth.

George Bush

[Filed with the Office of the Federal Regis-
ter, 5:01 p.m., December 9, 1991]

Note: This proclamation was published in
the Federal Register on December 11.

Remarks to the Chicago Board of Trade
in Chicago, Illinois
December 10, 1991

Thank you, Billy and thank you, Tom.
Listen, it's a great pleasure to be with all of
you. And standing next to me is a guy who
most of you know, son of Illinois, Ed Mad-
igan, the Secretary of Agriculture, doing a
great job.

Listen, we wanted to come by and see
this great market. And all of you ought to

know that, around the world, people are
trying as they come out from behind that
Iron Curtain to emulate the market here,
free trading in a very, very important area.
And you are doing more for agriculture and
for business, and we are very, very grateful
to you.

Let me just say a word. I am not happy,
and nor is anybody, with the state of the
economy. We want to see it moving. We
want to see it growing. And I will gather up
the best ideas I can between now and the
time that the Congress comes back, try to
lay partisan politics aside, and get this coun-
try moving by a strong growth package that
was long overdue.

The current performance of this economy
is unacceptable; growth is too slow. But
there are some encouraging signs: Interest
rates are down, mortgage interest rates, in-
flation seems to be holding down. And now,
we've just got to give it a kick and get it
started up again. And I'm grateful to all of
you for the example you've set. And now I
guess we have about 6 minutes, but I want
to see this place spring into action. Maybe I
can learn a few new hand gestures.

Thank you all. God bless you, and God
bless the United States.

Note: The President spoke at 10:23 a.m.
from the soybean pit of the Chicago Board
of Trade. In his remarks, he referred to Wil-
liam F O'Connor, chairman, and Thomas
F. Donovan, president and chief executive
officer of the Chicago Board of Trade.

Remarks to the Chicago Mercantile
Exchange in Chicago, Illinois
December 10, 1991

Thank you all very much. And Jack,
thank you, sir, for that more-than-generous
introduction. To Bill Brodsky, my thanks to
you, sir, for arranging all of this, coming
from Wall Street to Chicago, as you have.
I'm delighted to be with you. To Leo, Leo
Melamed, the Babe Ruth of the exchange, I
want to thank him. And, of course, salute
two others with me, your great Governor,
my friend Jim Edgar, and Ed Madigan, who
is our new-former Illinois Congressman,
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and now our able Secretary of Agriculture,
who is up to his eyeballs in working with us
to try to make a successful conclusion to
this GATT round. And he's knocking him-
self out, crossing the Atlantic Ocean back
and forth, but we couldn't have a better
Secretary of Agriculture trying to open up
these foreign markets to our agricultural
products. Ed, thank you.

And I thought Jim Thompson was going
to be with us, but maybe he's not that
brave, a member of the Board of Trade and
a lawyer. [Laughter] But he was here, and I
salute him, a longtime friend.

Jack mentioned the visit to the trading
floor, and I do want to thank everyone in-
volved in that trip through that melee for
their warmth of the reception and the-I
thought it would be pretty hard to match
the emotion of last weekend out there in
Pearl Harbor, but I'll tell you, this was a
little different. Younger kids, all-there
were a few old guys down there-[laugh-
ter]-but I'm talking about enthusiasm and
the future. And it was a wonderfully inspir-
ing trip through that floor, and I want to
thank those of you who were here that par-
ticipated in that and everybody else respon-
sible for that visit. Thank you very, very
much.

It's great to be back here and to have a
chance to visit briefly with the leaders of
the business community and leaders of this
exchange. As you know, we've had a staff
change at the White House, a new Chief of
Staff coming there. And when John Sununu
resigned, I looked to Chicago, I looked to
the Windy City for help, for another sound
manager, communicator, and consummate
politician. Well, Mike Ditka was busy with
other responsibilities-laughter]-and Sam
Skinner, though, rose to the fore. And I
think we're going to have a very good oper-
ation with your friend and mine, Sam, who
did a great job as Secretary of Transporta-
tion, now in this new, key place as we move
into a new year.

I've really enjoyed my visits here to both
exchanges today, the board and then here.
I've seen the future. It uses hand signals, at
least for now. [Laughter] But then, I've also
glimpsed at the fact that that's also chang-
ing. Speaking of hand signals, I saw a few
riding in here. [Laughter] They have a nice
way here of making one feel at home.

[Laughter] No, actually it's been very, very
friendly.

But I really enjoyed the tour downstairs,
and I also have been looking forward to this
part of the program, here on the upper
floor, the futures market of the future, I
think we really can peek into the next cen-
tury. Soon, probably sooner than you
expect, this area will be as packed and busy
as the trading pits below.

The Merc has become a bellwether of the
future because it never, ever lost the inven-
tive spirit of its founders. You defied the
doomsayers when you pioneered that risk-
pool management through the Exchange
Trust. You established the first financial fu-
tures market, the International Monetary
Market. You saw an international market-
place and established overseas offices before
most exchanges even thought of setting up
domestic branches. And you created Euro-
dollar Futures a decade ago, and I know
you celebrated its 10th anniversary yester-
day. And you should be very, very proud of
this world leadership.

In challenging times, you've thrived. And
this year, you trimmed expenses to improve
efficiency, and your business grew by more
than 4 percent, I'm told. Through the ups
and downs of the business cycle, you've op-
erated without requiring a dime's worth of
assistance from the American taxpayer. And
you've taken care of your own without
losing your momentum for a single minute.

It's great to be here-I mentioned him
earlier-with Leo Melamed whom, I sup-
pose, you call the father of the future. And
now, you all know of his professional accom-
plishments, but he never left his imagina-
tion at the office. As many of you know, he
has also written prodigiously. His greatest
triumph was the science fiction thriller
"The Tenth Planet." It's not about Capitol
Hill; it is another science fiction thriller.

Sometimes, though, debates on Capitol
Hill about the economy sound as if they
were about life on another planet. And you
know, an economy does not run just on
money. An economy lives and breathes on
ideas and information.

Entrepreneurs like the men and women
who trade in the Merc's pits, the farmers
who work the fields by day and the com-
puters by night, arbitrageurs in London,

1798

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. 1798 1991



Administration of George Bush, 1991 / Dec. 10

and investors the world over, these people
swap ideas, information, dreams, and dares,
and they fire an economy. Their energy
drives our Nation forward. They chart the
course through the international market-
place.

A government that does not understand
the gritty fundamentals of business cannot
understand how to help an economy grow.
Ten years ago, many of you stood with us as
the Reagan-Bush administration took on the
old wisdom that government could solve
everything and that business could flourish
regardless of what burdens Washington
heaped upon it. We cut the taxes and
peeled away regulations, restrained spend-
ing, promoted free trade. And out of that
came the longest peacetime economic ex-
pansion in the history of this country. While
others may have sat back to enjoy their new
prosperity, you were a driving dynamic
here. You moved forward.

You've stood with my administration as
we work to create the conditions for a more
vibrant economy. I've asked Congress for 3
years to pass a series of growth initiatives,
job-creating initiatives. And the economy
has turned sluggish. People want action.
And I want action, action to help people,
action to make things better now and in the
future.

And our administration believes as you do
that the solution lies in free markets for
free people. We've promoted straightfor-
ward measures to invigorate the economy,
such as cuts in the capital gains tax; banking
reform, inclusive banking reform legislation;
letting first-time homebuyers use these
IRA's for purchasing homes; a permanent
tax credit for R&D, for research and devel-
opment, and so on.

We pushed other initiatives to make the
most of our human capital now and in the
future: A revolution, for example, in Ameri-
can education; a tough crime package to
back up the police officers that we are sup-
ported by every single day of our lives; a
tort reform bill up there that will put some
caps on some of these mindlessly high set-
tlements that are driving much of the in-
dustry to its knees; and recently, a transpor-
tation bill that will create jobs and provide
much needed repair for our roads and
bridges and infrastructure.

And, again, I salute Sam Skinner for his
leadership as our Secretary of Transporta-
tion on this important job-creating legisla-
tion.

Although both political parties will feel
tempted to engage in partisan warfare
when Congress comes back in January, re-
convenes, I will be calling upon the Demo-
crats and the Republicans to lay partisan-
ship aside long enough to pass a clear,
strong growth package. We owe it to the
taxpayer; we owe it to those who have jobs,
and we owe it to those who don't have jobs
to get that done regardless of politics. And
I'm going to do that, no matter that 1992 is
a Presidential election year.

And I might say, being in his hometown,
I can work with Dan Rostenkowski, your
friend and mine, who is chairman of the
Ways and Means Committee. And if we had
more like him I believe we could have
gotten these problems solved long, long
ago.

In the post-cold war world-and you've
set the example on this one-we must
thrive in the international marketplace. I
am going to be meeting this weekend with
President Salinas. And I know he was up
visiting you all earlier this year. And the
two of us are going to discuss trade matters
in detail. And later this month I will pro-
mote free and fair trade-read that, jobs-
with our allies in Japan and South Korea
and Singapore, and also going down to Aus-
tralia. Free and fair trade means more jobs
for Americans.

And we must not pull back into some
isolationistic sphere listening to the siren's
call of "America first." I learned that lesson
as a young kid just at the beginning of
World War II, and I don't want to see this
country go back to "America first" and pro-
tection. That will shrink markets and throw
people out of work. And we need to stand
together against that call from the left and
against that call from the right to stay
within ourselves. We owe the world leader-
ship, and they're going to get it from this
President.

You know, the allegation is that I spend a
lot of time on foreign affairs. I take great
pride in some of the accomplishments
we've made. I think America came together
at Desert Storm, and we found a new sense
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of confidence, a new spirit as a Nation. And
I'm not going to back away from that. I am
proud that we're bringing parties that have
stood at each other's throats for years,
bringing them together in the Middle East
to talk some peace. I'm proud of the way
we've handled the evolution in the Soviet
Union. And right today it is extraordinarily
complicated.

But my point is, we cannot withdraw, we
can't pull back. You can't do it. You're en-
gaged in the markets, and well you should
be, because that offers prosperity to the
American people as well as to others. And I
don't think a President should pull back in
the face of domestic criticism by some par-
tisans suggesting that we don't have to
worry about our national security and that
we don't see that jobs stem from being en-
gaged with foreign countries, instead of
being pulled back from engagement with
foreign countries.

So, I can do both. We can stay involved,
work for world peace, enhance our national
security, and now drive forward to get this
economy moving by bipartisan action for
growth, economic growth that means jobs
for the American people.

Years ago, Carl Sandburg described this
city as "the hog butcher for the world."
That was the Chicago of another era, an-
other world. And today, Chicago serves the
pork belly's future, the currency's future,
the future, period, of an international mar-
ketplace. And the one message I'd like to
come out of this meeting here today and
the other meetings I've had is that we are
the hub of the international market. And
countries that are emerging into democracy
are looking to us for leadership in terms of
making world markets. And nobody does it
any better than the people right here in
this room.

Thank you very, very much. And now get
back to work and help us shape another
American century. Thank you all. I'm glad
to be with you.

Note: The President spoke at 12:05 p.m. fol-
lowing a tour of the trading floor. In his
remarks, he referred to John F. Sandner,
chairman of the board of governors of the
Chicago Mercantile Exchange; William J
Brodsky, president and chief executive offi-
cer of the exchange; and Leo Melamed,

chairman emeritus of the exchange and
chairman of the Globex Corp. A tape was
not available for verification of the content
of these remarks.

Remarks to the Illinois Farm Bureau in
Chicago, Illinois
December 10, 1991

Thank you, John, and to all the members,
thank you. Thank you, John White, Gover-
nor Edgar, and to Secretary Madigan, son of
Illinois, who is doing a superb job as our
Secretary of Agriculture. I'm glad he flew
out here with us. To Congressman Ewing,
who will be flying back with us, I under-
stand, on Air Force One back to Washing-
ton. We've welcomed him to the Congress
and proud he's there, To Enid Schlipf, who
has been at my side today, and I'm grateful
for that, his counsel. We had a session, a
listening session, getting counsel from busi-
ness people, and it was most appropriate
that Messrs. White and Schlipf were there.

And to all of you ladies and gentlemen of
the Illinois Farm Bureau, thank you for that
warm reception and for your hospitality. I
feel that I've come to the right place. My
top priority is to get this country moving
faster and more confidently on the path of
economic progress.

I've had excellent visits this morning on
the trading floors at the Merc and at the
Board of Trade. I lost 3 pounds in the proc-
ess just kind of working my way through
those hand signals. And it was wonderful.
And I had the privilege to have both John
and Enid, who are leaders of the Farm
Bureau, at my side during those sessions
and also, at Billy Goat's-[laughter]-I think
you guys were up there. It's a marvelous
burger place here. But speaking of farming,
let me give you a little bit of historical trivia
that will not send you into euphoria, but I
always try to claim kinship with various
States. And my great-grandfather, David
Walker, grew up on a farm near Blooming-
ton, Illinois. How about that one? Nobody's
ever heard that before.

But anyway, meeting with so many Illi-
nois farmers and agribusiness leaders, I've
had a chance to talk face to face with some
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men and women who are leading the way.
You see, agriculture is a perennial export
leader, and recently exports have been a
tremendous factor, a big factor in our over-
all economic growth. And here's how im-
portant that is: Every billion dollars in agri-
cultural exports means approximately
25,000 American jobs.

American farmers understand how the
world works. You know that taking a stand
for peace and stability abroad, supporting
emerging democracies, developing free and
fair international markets, will make our na-
tional economy much stronger. You know
what a determined American involvement
in global trade represents to the bottom
line. It means higher net farm income.

So first, I really wanted to thank, enthusi-
astically give thanks for the Farm Bureau's
efforts to keep America a leader in world
commerce and world security. I know I
speak for several hundred thousand young
service men and women in saying thank
you for all your support during Desert
Shield and thank you for all your support
during Desert Storm. We are very, very
grateful.

The Farm Bureau's leadership is vital to
our progress for free and fair trade, no mis-
take about it. You made a big contribution
to getting the North American free trade
talks off and running. You've helped launch
our Enterprise for the Americas Initiative
for trade and investment throughout the
Western Hemisphere. I can assure you, be-
cause of your foresight, we can look forward
to unprecedented prosperity and economic
security for hundreds of millions of North
and South Americans from the Illinois prai-
ries to the pampas of the Argentine.

Secretary Madigan and Ambassador Carla
Hills are working to secure a solid agree-
ment for global trade at the Uruguay round
of the GATT negotiations. A successful
GATT negotiation will literally revolution-
ize world agriculture trade, opening mar-
kets and leveling the playing field for
American exports. When we achieve this,
we will owe an incalculable debt to the
Farm Bureau who has always looked ahead
and never looked back on this important
question of international trade.

And I might say, John, you're quite a con-
trast, this marvelous organization, to the
noisy voices that want to withdraw us into

isolationism and protectionism. They say
they want to put "America first." You have
the common sense to recognize that Amer-
ica is first and will remain first only if we
stay engaged in world markets and involved
in world security. And as long as I am Presi-
dent, that's exactly what I intend to do.

American agriculture is productive and
competitive because of its strong orienta-
tion to free markets. Our agriculture owes
much to such fundamentals as advancing
productivity, embracing new technologies,
moving forward to new frontiers in scientif-
ic research.

Rural America is a model of strength on
social issues that are vital to our future.
Thank God that family and family values
remain so important to agricultural Amer-
ica. Farm communities, let's face it, they
face many hardships. But they always in-
volve parents in the schools, and that
always produces better students. With pro-
grams such as 4-H and FFA, Future Farm-
ers of America, rural America takes a lead-
ing role in our America 2000 strategy to
revolutionize, literally revolutionize our
education.

I can't tell you how impressed I am also
at how much most farmers know about
computers, not speaking for all of you, I
understand, but some of you. But I've had
enough trouble just finding the "on" switch
on my computer, say nothing of getting the
cursor to move where and when I want it
to. But the point is this, anyone who doesn't
appreciate the sophistication of the modern
farmer doesn't understand the modern
farmer.

Last month, by the way-maybe some of
you all were out there-but I spoke to
18,000 of our best and brightest kids at the
Future Farmers of America convention in
Kansas City. And let me tell you, I can't
contain my excitement thinking about the
day when those young men and women
become the leaders of our country. They
were bright and alert and patriotic and for-
ward-looking. And somebody, parents in
this room and across agricultural America
are doing a wonderful job with these young
men and women.

The guy that introduced me was so good,
I thought he was getting ready to run
against me. [Laughter] But anyway, you
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should have heard him. He's a real articu-
late dude.

Another concern I know you share with
me is the drug problem. The stakes here
involve not just the economy but our deep-
est social and moral well-being. Wherever I
go in this country, I call attention to those
who fight the drug war on the front lines. I
praise the businessmen and women who
keep drugs out of their companies and the
neighborhood youth centers that keep teen-
agers off the streets. So, let me take this
opportunity right now to thank hundreds
and thousands of Americans who don't get
mentioned often enough for their devotion
in running the strongest kind of drug-free
workplaces. And I'm referring, again, to the
moms and the dads and the grandparents
who run America's family farms.

Now, I know that sometimes times are
tough for America's farmer. And that's why
we stand by our commitment to help ease
the pain caused by natural disasters. This
week I will be signing legislation to provide
drought and disaster relief. Many farmers in
Illinois and other States suffered unusually
severe losses this year and last year. And
this legislation will provide much-needed
assistance for hard-hit farmers. And I will
be delighted to sign it.

Now, I know that the economic downturn
is hurting a lot of people in virtually every
sector. And I've heard from some tough,
optimistic people on my visit just today, but
they didn't sugarcoat their message about
the pain and the problems the country is
going through right now.

You and I know that we've got to do
more to get the economy on the move, to
get confidence back. And I'm prepared to
fight harder than ever for a series of growth
initiatives. And when Members of Congress
go back to work in January, after Christmas,
they'll hear from me in no uncertain terms.
My growth initiatives will give Americans
the freedom and incentive to get higher
yields from their efforts. A top priority, and
John referred to this, is to cut capital gains
taxes. I know it's a top priority of the Farm
Bureau, too, and I want to express my deep
thanks for your outstanding support on this
initiative.

Our high taxes, then, on capital gains are
way out of line with the policies in other
successful economies. Germany has no cap-

ital gains, no tax on capital gains on assets
held longer than 6 months. In Japan, an
entrepreneur who sells the company that
he's built from scratch pays a tax of 1 per-
cent. A capital gains tax cut will free up the
capital that we need for growth. And it will
increase the value of land, of labor and cap-
ital all at once by reducing the tax on suc-
cess. And I am going to keep on fighting
until we get that done.

Right now, we place entrepreneurs in a
lose-lose situation. When they risk money
and effort on something that fails, they lose.
And when they risk money on a winner, we
tax the capital gain, and they lose again. We
have to put an end to this lose-lose ap-
proach to the economy. A capital gains cut
will stimulate investment and create jobs in
every sector. And quite frankly, it will re-
store some fundamental fairness to the way
we treat farmers and the way we treat
homeowners.

Capital gains tax relief is but a part of our
program. Thanks to leadership from Illinois'
own Sam Skinner, our soon-to-be Chief of
Staff, I expect soon to sign a transportation
bill that creates new jobs while rebuilding
our roads and bridges. And I'm working for
a research tax credit to help new technol-
ogies create more jobs; working for new
IRA's to help the first-time homebuyer,
stimulate that homebuilding market; and
for bank reform. We desperately need com-
prehensive bank reform to help America
compete in the 21st century and to help
free up capital right now.

We want our children's future to be
worthy of the dreams and sacrifices that
built and sustained America as a great
Nation. Back in 1862, in spite of his preoc-
cupation with the Civil War, our President
established back then the U.S. Department
of Agriculture. Abraham Lincoln revered
the American farmer. He believed deeply
and stated eloquently that a strong Ameri-
can agriculture was the key to preserving
our Nation's independence.

A century and a quarter later, the men
and women of Illinois ag are worthy heirs
to Lincoln's vision. You and this organiza-
tion form a vital force for keeping America
strong and free. And I am looking forward
to seeing some of you, many of you maybe,
next month at the American Farm Bureau
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national convention out in Kansas City. And
I am delighted to be with you today. And I
am proud to work with you to help keep
this great country of ours growing and
thriving. I pledge to you I will do my level
best to lead this country to new growth and
new opportunity.

May God bless you and may God bless
the United States of America. Thank you all
very, very much.

Note: The President spoke at 1:45 p.m. at
the Palmer House Hotel. In his remarks, he
referred to John White, Jr., and Enid
Schlipf, president and former vice president,
respectively, of the Illinois Farm Bureau.

Exchange With Reporters in the
Cabinet Room
December 11, 1991

Soviet Union

Q. Mr. President, who is in charge in the
Soviet Union at this point?

The President. Well, we're following that
situation very closely in the Soviet Union.
And of course, our main interest is in demo-
cratic and market reform, the continuation
of that. They are going to sort these matters
out themselves. We will support democrat
and-reformers wherever they are there.
And that means at all levels, incidentally.

So, we are watching it very closely. And
as these dramatic changes take place or
proposals come forward, that's a matter for
the Republics and the center to sort out. I
think the answer to that question, you've
just got to look at where you're talking
about. So, we'll let that evolve.

I'll be meeting this afternoon with the
Secretary and our Ambassador and be talk-
ing about Jim's upcoming trip, the reasons
that are clearly of vital interest to us. One,
we want this humanitarian question, hu-
manitarian aid, to go forward in order to
promote peaceful reform. That's a ques-
tion-besides that, we've got just a plain
interest in seeing that people are fed. Ed
Madigan and I were talking about this yes-
terday on the way to Chicago.

And then, of course, we have a keen in-
terest, the whole world does, in the nuclear
questions there. And frankly, assurances
have been pretty good there. I see no
reason to alarm the American people, but
it's something that we're following extraor-
dinarily closely, and we are in touch. And I
feel that the thing to do now is just to go
forward with the plan of the Secretary and
see where it comes out.

But we can't make any predictions on the
evolution of all of this. That's their business.
Our interests are as I stated in here: De-
mocracy, market reform, humanitarian as-
sistance, the nuclear question, and peace,
peaceful evolution of all of this.

Capital Gains Tax Cut
Q. Mr. President, you made clear yester-

day you're going to keep fighting for a cap-
ital gains tax cut-

The President. Yes. I will keep on fight-
ing-

Q. Are you going to, have you got any
other-

The President. - for that. But now
we've got to get to work in the Cabinet, so
thank you.

Q. But, sir, do you have any other ideas
to jumpstart the economy?

The President. We'll be talking about
that, as I said yesterday-at the time I said
yesterday, too. So, we'll just keep working
on it.

Note: The President spoke at 10:35 a.m. In
his remarks, he referred to Secretary of
State James A. Baker III and Robert S.
Strauss, US. Ambassador to the Soviet
Union. A tape was not available for verifi-
cation of the content of this exchange.

Remarks at a Fundraising Luncheon for
Senator Frank H. Murkowski
December 11, 1991

Frank, thank you, and good luck. Thank
you for that very nice welcome. To you all
assembled, my thanks to you. And, Nancy,
Barbara and I send our very best wishes,
not just for the holiday season but for
what's over the horizon for you and that
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wonderful family. And let me just say good
morning, early morning, or breakfast time,
to our supporters joining us through the
magic of television, all Frank's friends up
there in Anchorage with Senator Ted Ste-
vens, our great leader up there who is
doing a wonderful job side by side with
Frank in Fairbanks; Mr. Richard Wien, who
I understand is connected to this, and so I
salute you, sir, and all assembled. And thank
you for your work on this.

And good afternoon, of course, to our
friends here in Washington. I'm told that
Ed Derwinski was to be here. I saw Senator
Strom Thurmond; Kit Bond is to be here,
Senator from Missouri; Larry Craig, another
great Senator; and, of course, standing at
my left, and chairman of this event, the
indefatigable and wonderful Lod Cook, to
whom we are all very, very grateful.

I had a chance to greet some of you all,
and I know that many of you have traveled
from all corners of America-New York and
California well represented and, of course,
Alaska-just to be here. And to anyone here
that I've missed, warm greetings to you. Let
me salute the marvelous music we had ear-
lier on, and I just wish you all the greatest
for Christmas.

May I say to all of you that your support
means an awful lot. It means a great deal to
Frank. He's touched, and I'm sure you've
been touched, too. [Laughter] But it is very
important that this man be reelected. And
I'm here today saluting what I think is one
of our essential key members of the team
up there on Capitol Hill. He is a public
servant--and Lod put it well-dedicated to
the people of his State. He never forgot
how he got sent here to Washington, DC,
and he is a leader that is constantly looking
forward, helping us try to find ways to build
a better America. So, the people of Alaska
are fortunate, and the people of this coun-
try are fortunate to have Senator Frank
Murkowski in the United States Senate, and
please keep him there.

We need him. We need him in the
Senate. And we need more people in Con-
gress like Frank, men and women who be-
lieve in growth and opportunity for all
Americans, elected leaders who are com-
mitted to excellence at home and then are
fighting for this competitiveness abroad.
And I need more Republicans in Congress,

and we need to keep the good ones there
that we've already got.

He just came back, as he mentioned in
his opening remarks, from Taiwan, Korea,
Japan, where he did reach agreement to
end this driftnet fishing. Took a leadership
role there, took on what was considered an
extraordinarily tough problem, and of enor-
mous help in getting it resolved.

As vice chairman of the Senate Intelli-
gence Committee and as ranking member
of the East Asian and Pacific Foreign Rela-
tions Subcommittee, he understands, he un-
derstands far better than most, that we are
a Pacific Nation. Alaska is a Pacific State.
We have all these other events unfolding all
around the world, in Eastern Europe, in the
Middle East, in South America, all of them
positive, I might add. But we must never
forget that we are a Pacific power. Our
largest trading partners, in total, are in the
Pacific area, the Pacific Rim.

Last week-and it was emotional-I went
out to Pearl Harbor to commemorate that
"Day of Infamy" in 1941. And sadly, Pearl
Harbor was a tragedy brought about by the
folly of isolationism. Today's neoisolationism
and then its economic accomplice, protec-
tionism, are just as dangerous today as they
were some 50 years ago.

The fact is, this country has enjoyed its
most lasting growth and economic opportu-
nity and security, I might add, when we
rejected isolationism, both political and eco-
nomic, in favor of engagement and leader-
ship. We are, then, a Pacific Nation. Next
month in Asia, and I'm looking forward to
this, I'll discuss with some of our Pacific
friends and allies their responsibility to
share with us the challenges and burden of
leadership in the post-cold war world.

In today's world, American lives and
American jobs, our prosperity, our security,
depend on our ability to compete and to
lead. That's why I am looking forward to
this trip, and we are determined to go
there, do what Frank has been doing as
your Alaskan Senator: To help open up new
markets for American products and create
new opportunities for American workers.
The answer isn't to turn inward, it's to
extend our opportunities outward.

We feel the benefits of foreign trade here
at home, particularly in Alaska with its ex-
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ports of timber and fish and coal. It is im-
portant to acknowledge that last year alone,
the total gross exports accounted for virtual-
ly all of the economic growth in the coun-
try. So with a sluggish economy, we will
continue to do all we can to reach out and
expand our overseas markets.

Speaking of our economy, certainly we all
know that some people are having a rough
go of it, a tough time. I see that message in
letters, and I hear it in conversations in the
communities I visit. While Congress is
home for the holidays, they'll be hearing
that same message. And I hope they listen
closely. Because when I give the State of
the Union Address before Congress in Janu-
ary, I will ask them to put politics aside and
come together and take some very impor-
tant steps for growth and opportunity.
We've sent up three different economic
growth packages in the last 3 years, but I
intend now to propose a new economic
growth package to get this economy
moving. I believe Congress will act. I know
leaders like Frank Murkowski will be at my
side on this, but I believe Congress will act.
I think the American people want us to get
the job done. They don't care -who gets
credit. They're tired of the bickering. Let's
get on with it.

Among the most important elements of
what we've tried to get acted upon these
last 3 years is our plan to boost American
competitiveness through initiatives like our
America 2000 initiative for excellence in
education, it's a wonderful program to revo-
lutionize our schools; our job-creating trans-
portation strategy to efficiently move goods
and services between markets, and I'm
looking forward to signing that bill; our civil
justice reform plan to keep employers in
the factories and out of the courtrooms; and
our national energy strategy to cut our de-
pendence on foreign oil.

Let me say a word about this, about our
energy strategy, and say this: that Frank is
committed-and let me just assure you I
remain committed-to environmentally re-
sponsible access to ANWR. It is absolutely
essential.

You know, the critics said years ago when
the debate was on on the pipeline up there,
the Alaska pipeline, that caribou would be
extinct because of this. Well, there's so
many caribou they're rubbing up against

the pipeline, they're breeding like mad.
They're having a great time. And it is a
sound environment up there. So don't listen
to the arguments from the same people
that gave us the same arguments before
and were proved wrong. Listen to the
President who says we, our national securi-
ty, our own national interest depends upon
our having an energy program that makes
us less dependent on foreign oil. And I'm
never going to change my view on that. If
caribou could vote, Murkowski would be in
by a landslide. [Laughter]

Let me just close this way: I am deter-
mined to get this economy moving again.
We've got to make the American dream
come alive for all Americans. And we've got
to keep this good American, this fine serv-
ant of Alaska and our country, in the United
States Senate. And with your help, I am
absolutely confident that that will be done.

Frank, keep up the good work. Take a
little time off for Christmas and possibly
New Year. And to all in Alaska who are
plugged in, my greetings to you, and may
you have a wonderful holiday season. And
God bless the United States of America.
Thank you very, very much.

Note: The President spoke at 12:32 p.m. at
the Willard Hotel. His remarks were broad-
cast via satellite to fundraising breakfasts
in Anchorage and Fairbanks, AK. In his
remarks, he referred to Richard Wien,
chairman of the Fairbanks breakfast.

Teleconference Remarks on the Kick-
Off of Montana 2000 and Billings 2000
December 11, 1991

The President. Well, I'm just delighted to
be with you in this marvelous way. And I
really wanted to call up, though, to just
offer my strongest congratulations to you
and then to that marvelous team that I un-
derstand you've assembled there.

You know, this Montana 2000-Billings
2000 really are right in keeping with this
new spirit of revolutionizing our schools.
And they're going to make terrific contribu-
tions to what I think is clearly now a nation-
al momentum on education reform.
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So I really want to ask you, how's it
going?

Governor Stephens. It's going very well,
Mr. President. And, of course, we're de-
lighted to have your distinguished Secretary
of Education Lamar Alexander with us.
He'll be speaking right after this phone call.
And we have a great group of Montanans
who extend to you and Mrs. Bush the com-
pliments of the season.

The President. Well, that's terrific. And I
was told on my briefing paper, and you can
confirm whether it's true, that not only is
your superintendent of public instruction
there, Nancy Kennan, but also the Billings
school superintendent, which is good. If
that's true, and I expect you have others, it
symbolizes what we're trying to do to get
the communities involved and the local
levels involved. So are they all there now?
Who else you got?

Governor Stephens. They are all here,
Mr. President, and they send you greetings.
We also have the publisher of The Billings
Gazette and the president of the Chamber,
Mr. Wayne Schile. And we've just heard
some very complimentary remarks by Sena-
tor Conrad Burns, who is a strong right
hand of yours, and a lady named Karen
Morrison, who is one of our outstanding
teachers. So we've got an all-star cast on the
stage.

The President. Well, I'm glad they're
there. Conrad was here with me in the
White House last night. I imagine he made
a quick exit to get that far out there. But
look, also be sure to give my best to Lamar,
and do me a favor; give him a little home-
work and tell him that I am so anxious to
get a report on Montana 2000 as we go
along here. I want to try as best I can per-
sonally to keep up with the progress in
these States. He's filling me in on a lot of
them. And I agree with you as to the job
he's doing for us. But tell Lamar to be sure
to keep me informed on how all that's
going.

Governor Stephens. I certainly will, Mr.
President. And I know he's enjoying his stay
here in Montana, and we're waiting for his
remarks following your phone call. And we
deeply appreciate, Mr. President, you
would take time from your schedule to call
Montana and visit with us about this impor-
tant subject.

The President. Well, listen, it's good. And
my respects to the Senator; my respects to
our great Secretary. And I know that this is
the right program for our country. And so
far, I'll say this, with Nancy Kennan there
especially, and others, we've kept this out
of the shrill arena of partisan politics. It is
too important to our country, too important
to our States. And I just commend Lamar
for the way he's brought in people and in-
terests from all over the spectrum. I mean,
everyone should feel included in this ap-
proach, and I'm sure it's going to work that
way in your great State too.

Governor Stephens. Indeed it is, Mr.
President. And thank you again for the
courtesy of your call.

The President. May I wish all your folks
there a merry Christmas. We're beginning,
just beginning to get into the Christmas
spirit.

Governor Stephens. All right. And We
have a message for you from Montana, and
here it is, Mr. President.

The President. All right.

[At this point, the group wished the Presi-
dent a "Merry Christmas. '1

The President. Hey, listen, I beat you to
the draw, though. [Laughter] That's good.
Have a good one, Stan. How's the tree
doing out there?

Governor Stephens. It's doing just great.
It looks marvelous.

The President. I'll see you. Well, invite
me back out.

Governor Stephens. We shall. Thank you,
Mr. President. Thanks for your call.

The President. Good talking to you.
Merry Christmas.

Governor Stephens. Merry Christmas.

Note: The President spoke at 2:30 p.m. from
the Oval Office at the White House to par-
ticipants meeting at Arrowhead Elementary
School in Billings, MT Dr. Peter Carparelli
is superintendent of schools for the Billings
public school system, and Karen J Morrison
is a teacher at Garfield Elementary School
in Billings.
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Message on the Observance of
Christmas
December 11, 1991

At Christmas, we celebrate the promise
of salvation that God gave to mankind
almost 2,000 years ago. The birth of Christ
changed the course of history, and His life
changed the soul of man. Christ taught that
giving is the greatest of all aspirations and
that the redemptive power of love and sac-
rifice is stronger than any force of arms. It
is testimony to the wisdom and the truth of
these teachings that they have not only en-
dured but also flourished over two millen-
nia.

Blessed with an unparalleled degree of
freedom and security, generations of Ameri-
cans have been able to celebrate Christmas
with open joy. Tragically, that has not
always been the case in other nations, but
we look to the future with optimism, and
we celebrate the holidays with special glad-
ness as courageous peoples around the
world continue to claim the civil and reli-
gious liberty to which all people are heirs.
The triumph of democratic ideals and the
lessening of global tensions give us added
reason for celebration this Christmas season,
and as the world community draws closer
together, the wisdom of Christ's counsel to
"love thy neighbor as thyself" grows clear-
er.

By His words and by His example, Christ
has called us to share our many blessings
with others. As individuals and as a Nation,
in our homes and in our communities, there
are countless ways that we can extend to
others the same love and mercy that God
showed humankind when He gave us His
only Son. During this holy season and
throughout the year, let us look to the self-
less spirit of giving that Jesus embodied as
inspiration in our own lives-giving thanks
for what God has done for us and abiding
by Christ's teaching to do for others as we
would do for ourselves.

Barbara joins me in wishing all of our
fellow Americans a Merry Christmas. God
bless you.

George Bush

Statement on the European
Community Summit
December 11, 1991

We welcome the historic steps toward
economic and political union agreed to by
the leaders of the European Community in
The Netherlands. Four and a half decades
after the destruction of World War II, West-
ern Europe stands prosperous and free: a
model of what cooperation, democracy, and
the free market can yield, and a beacon to
those in the East struggling to secure their
liberty and well-being.

The results of the EC summit in Maas-
tricht represent a milestone which we cele-
brate along with our European partners.
The United States has long supported Euro-
pean unity because of our strong conviction
that it was good for Europe, good for the
Atlantic partnership, and good for the
world. I have made clear from the outset of
this administration my view that a strong,
united Europe is very much in America's
interest. A more united Europe offers the
United States a more effective partner, pre-
pared for larger responsibilities.

Europe's steps toward unity will strength-
en our renewed Atlantic Alliance. NATO's
endorsement at the Rome summit of a "Eu-
ropean pillar" underscores the additional
responsibility which the European allies are
assuming in the protection of shared vital
interests and values. At Maastricht, the EC
requested the Western European Union,
whose members are in both NATO and the
EC, to serve as the vehicle for increased
European responsibility on defense matters.
We are pleased that our allies in the West-
ern European Union in turn decided to
strengthen that institution as both NATO's
European pillar and the defense component
of the European Union. NATO will remain
the essential forum for consultation among
its members and the venue for agreement
on policies bearing on the security and de-
fense commitments of the Allies under the
Washington Treaty.

A strengthened EC has a vital role to play
in assuring a stable and prosperous Europe
and a humane world order. Already today,
the European Community and its member
states are taking a major role, working with
us, to help the citizens of Central and East-
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ern Europe transform their societies. Our
Atlantic partnership is equally essential in
supporting the movement toward freedom
and democracy in what we have known as
the Soviet Union. But our cooperation with
the new Europe goes farther. The Europe-
an Community stands with us as a partner
in the search for peace in the Middle East,
and against difficult odds, it continues to
labor with our support for a peaceful solu-
tion to the war in Yugoslavia.

The evolving monetary unity and single
market of the EC promises new economic
vitality for Europe. With this comes new
investment possibilities and markets for
American business as well as new competi-
tion. We welcome these developments, but
we also expect that the new Europe will
assume new responsibilities for maintaining
and strengthening the world economic
system. This means working with us to
bridge our bilateral differences, to expand
an open global trading system by successful-
ly concluding the Uruguay round, and to
avoid the dangers of protectionism.

America can take pride in its contribu-
tions to Europe's success. The U.S. engage-
ment on that continent has yielded many
benefits for the Europeans and for us.
Those benefits remind us that our interests
do not stop at our shores. We are intimately
connected to what happens in Europe and
beyond. Now, we are getting an even
stronger European partner. I therefore
speak for all of America when I send best
wishes to the members of the European
Community for their new steps toward inte-
gration.

Memorandum on the Intermodal
Surface Transportation Efficiency Act
December 11, 1991

Memorandum for the Secretary of
Transportation

I have just received, and will soon sign,
H.R. 2950, the Intermodal Surface Trans-
portation Efficiency Act. I direct you to mo-
bilize immediately the Department to expe-
dite release of highway, highway safety, and
mass transit funds. Further, you should
assist State and local transportation officials

in the expeditious implementation of this
Act. Timely action is essential to provide
construction industry jobs and to stimulate
our overall economy as well as to begin
renewing our investment in the soundness
and safety of the Nation's surface transpor-
tation system.

George Bush

Exchange With Reporters Prior to a
Meeting With Prime Minister
Constantinos Mitsotakis of Greece
December 12, 1991

The President. We've got a few things,
odds and ends to talk about. But Greek-
U.S., as far as we're concerned, is strong as
they can be, Greek-U.S. relations, and we're
very pleased about that.

The Prime Minister. I am also very
pleased. And we made progress.

Soviet Union
Q. Mr. President, do you think Gorba-

chev-
The President. I have nothing really to

add to the discussion on that right now.
We're following it very carefully, as you
know, and in touch. So we'll just leave it
right there.

Cyprus
Q. Are you hopeful that the Cyprus talks

will start early next year?
The President. Well, we want to talk

about that. That's one of the issues where I
have great respect for Prime Minister Mit-
sotakis' judgment. We've gone into it at
length on several occasions. And I would
just want to assure him that if the U.S. can
help move things forward, we are deter-
mined to try. We thought we'd moved a
little bit before the process had moved. And
now we want to, out of this visit, see what
he has to suggest and maybe we can be
more helpful. I'd like to think so. I think he
knows we've tried.

And, of course, the Secretary-General will
be down here this afternoon, so we can talk
with him about it. So, this subject will be
very much on our minds.
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The Prime Minister. We will discuss this
subject. It's a very important subject-
matter-for us.

Q. Are you optimistic that talks will come
soon, though?

The Prime Minister. I am always optimis-
tic.

The President. That's why he's such a
good Prime Minister. He's always looking
ahead.

Jay Leno
Q. How did you like Jay Leno, Mr. Presi-

dent?
The President. He was all right. He was

great.
Q. Did he have any good jokes?
The President. He had a couple about

me, but I can't tell you what they were. No,
he's funny and very good. I wished him
well, and I had a chance to show him the
decorations and see Barbara. You talked to
him. Thanks a lot.

Q. Did you ask him to ease up, Mr. Vice
President? [Laughter]

The Vice President. I told him to ease up,
you're right. [Laughter]

The President. He hasn't been on your
case.

All right, gang, this has been a great
pleasure, but we've got a lot of business to
do here.

May I just say how pleased we are to
have the Prime Minister here. I will just
repeat here what I said to the earlier wave
of journalists, and that is that from our
standpoint, the U.S. standpoint, U.S.-Greece
relations are on strong footing. They are in
good shape. And we are working very close-
ly with this Government, and will continue
to, to try to help solve the outside problems
as well as the few remaining, I would say,
rather small items that exists between
Greece and the United States.

So, on the U.S. side, we are just pleased to
welcome the Prime Minister here and look
forward to having a wide array of talks on
problems in the area. Cyprus, obviously,
will come up. I'm most anxious to get his
views on the Balkans, and a lot of other
subjects to discuss. But the main point is
he's welcome. And it gives me a chance in
a small way to say thank you to the Prime
Minister and the people of Greece for a trip

that Barbara and I will never forget. It was
wonderful.

The Prime Minister. It was a pleasure for
us.

The Balkans

Q. -in the Balkans?

The President. Well, we want to talk
about that. I'm anxious to hear from the
Prime Minister on his priorities; where he
thinks we could help; the role of the EC;
and, of course, the role you asked about.
But I'd like to hear it from him rather than
give my views. After that I'll be glad to give
them.

Listen, we've got to go to work, guys. Last
one.

Q. How would you describe your role
with the Prime Minister?

The President. Close, strong, personal,
and respectful. We've got it all. And that's
not diplomatic language, that's right from
here. We've got all this diplomacy, you
know. We can say "cordial and friendly."
He's a friend.

Cyprus

Q. Are you prepared to show the same
determination on the Cyprus issue as you
have shown in the Middle East?

The President. We're going to try. We're
going to try. I want to do what's helpful.
We tried when we came back from Greece
and Turkey, and we still support the Secre-
tary-General's initiative. He'll be here
today, incidentally. But the United States
can't dictate. We can try to help, and that's
what I want to hear about.

Now, you guys are out of here because
we've got to get to work. We've got a lot to
do here. Thanks a lot.

Note: The exchange began at 11:02 a.m. in
the Oval Office at the White House. A tape
was not available for verification of the
content of this exchange.
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Remarks Following Discussions With
Prime Minister Constantinos Mitsotakis
of Greece
December 12, 1991

The President. Mr. Prime Minister and
distinguished members of the Greek Gov-
ernment, 5 months ago, I visited Athens,
the first visit by an American President to
Greece in more than a generation. Today,
in welcoming Prime Minister Mitsotakis to
the White House, our two countries reaf-
firm the value of close contact to address
common concern.

Mr. Prime Minister, in the past 3 years,
we've witnessed a world transformed, and
your continent has been right at the center
of change. America sees Greece as a part-
ner in meeting many of the challenges that
cross borders and threaten the peace: ter-
rorism, international drug trade, ethnic con-
flict.

In the Balkans, in the new Europe, in
Cyprus, Greece remains a factor for stabili-
ty, a champion of human rights, a partner
in the quest to forge a new world order:
peaceful, prosperous, and free.

The U.S. continues to be as concerned as
we have been in the past with Greece's
security and the sanctity of its borders. We
continue to help Greece strengthen its de-
fenses. And we support the progress your
nation has made toward economic reform,
liberalizing trade and investment.

Opening Greek markets to investment
from the United States and other nations
will mean jobs and better living standards
for Greeks and Americans alike.

Our meetings today also focused on chal-
lenges that stand as obstacles to lasting
peace in your corner of the world: The
longstanding conflict in Cyprus, and Yugo-
slavia's fratricidal civil war.

Let me start with Yugoslavia. Who can
fail to be moved by these heartrending
images, carnage and suffering on a scale
that recalls the horrors of the Second World
War rather than the hopes of the new era
we've now entered. The U.S. supports the
European Community's efforts, the EC's ef-
forts, including economic sanctions, to stop
the fighting.

We remain convinced that a negotiated
settlement, helped along by the United Na-
tions and the interested international com-

munity, is possible, necessary, and certainly
long overdue.

In the case of Cyprus, I again offer the
good offices of the United States to over-
come a source of bitter conflict between
two of our valued allies. We continue to
hope for an international high-level meet-
ing on Cyprus as early as possible in 1992.

With good-faith negotiations, and the con-
tinued efforts of the United Nations Secre-
tary-General, we can make progress in pro-
ducing a settlement acceptable to all par-
ties.

Mr. Prime Minister, let me just close by
simply saying that Greece holds great
meaning for Americans: Not only the mil-
lions who trace their own ancestry to your
country, but, as relative newcomers now in
our third century of democracy, as a people
who revere Greece as the birthplace of de-
mocracy more than two millennia ago.

It's been a very special pleasure having
this opportunity to meet with you again, to
have you and your able team here in Wash-
ington, DC today, and to wish Greece on
behalf of all Americans every blessings for
the new year.

All yours.
The Prime Minister. I would like first to

express my heartfelt thanks to President
Bush for inviting me to Washington and
receiving me at the White House so
warmly. At this moment in history when
democracy's flourishing throughout the
world, it is a great honor for me as Prime
Minister of Greece, where democracy was
born 2,500 years ago, to come for an official
visit to the United States, the champion of
democracy in our times.

The love of freedom and faith in democ-
racy are two of the important ties that form
a unique bond between Greece and the
United States. And I welcome the opportu-
nity this visit has given me to reinforce our
special relationship in this season of hope
and renewal.

I am especially pleased that this visit al-
lowed me to continue my private talks with
President Bush and with our delegations to
expand on the substantial and fruitful dis-
cussions we had in Greece last summer.

As might be expected, we exchanged
views on world developments and focused
closely on what is happening in our region,
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the Balkans, where, as you know, Greece is
playing an essential role in promoting peace
and stability.

We had a lengthy discussion on the
Cyprus question, and I thanked President
Bush for his personal commitment to help
bring about a fair settlement that will end
the long agony of the Cypriot people.

I am certain that with the strong support
of the President, the new Secretary-General
of the United Nations, building on the
achievements of his worthy predecessor,
will be able to lead the efforts of all of us to
a speedy and successful conclusion on
Cyprus.

I want to stress that our talks marked one
more milestone in the improving relations
between our two countries, which, as you
know, have made spectacular progress in
the past 2 years.

The ties between Greece and the United
States are strong and special. We fought in
two World Wars together and waged a joint
struggle to stop the spread of totalitarian-
ism. But what makes it such a profound
pleasure for all Greeks who come to the
United States is that we recognize the high-
est ideals of this Nation as native to our
own. I am very confident that the special
relationship between Greece and the
United States, which reflects the common
values of our two peoples and the strong
friendship they have fostered will grow
even stronger in the years ahead.

Let me conclude by wishing everyone in
the United States a very happy holiday
season.

Note: The President spoke at 1:19 p.m. on
the South Lawn of the White House. A tape
was not available for verification of the
content of these remarks.

Statement by Press Secretary Fitzwater
on Assistance to the Soviet Union and
the Republics
December 12, 1991

We are witnessing dramatic and historic
events in the Soviet Union and the Repub-
lics. The collapse of communism there is of
global importance and gives the Republics

the opportunity to move rapidly toward de-
mocracy and market economies. These de-
velopments pave the way for the integra-
tion of the Soviet Union and the Republics
into the community of democratic nations
and the strengthening of a more peaceful
and stable international order.

The world has a vital interest in the suc-
cess of this transition. The United States is
especially well-positioned because of its her-
itage and traditions to make a substantial
contribution by building on its existing
technical cooperation efforts as well as med-
ical and food assistance programs. The
United States strongly supports reform at all
levels of government and will focus its as-
sistance efforts on those who stand for fun-
damental political and economic reform, in-
cluding the establishment of democratic sys-
tems based on principles of the rule of law
and individual freedoms, respect for inter-
nationally recognized human rights, eco-
nomic reform based on market principles,
respect for international law and obliga-
tions, and adherence to responsible security
policies.

To be effective, programs of all U.S. Gov-
ernment agencies must be carefully coordi-
nated internally, and with the programs of
other countries and international institu-
tions. It is also critically important to ensure
that the energy and resources of individual
Americans, private voluntary organizations,
and businesses be fully integrated into our
efforts, wherever possible.

Accordingly, the President has appointed
Deputy Secretary of State Lawrence S. Eag-
leburger to be the Coordinator of United
States assistance to the Soviet Union and
the Republics. In that position, Secretary
Eagleburger will be responsible for oversee-
ing and coordinating all assistance programs
and activities which pertain to the Soviet
Union and the Republics.

The President has also named Michael J.
Boskin, Chairman of the Council of Eco-
nomic Advisers, Donald Atwood, Deputy
Secretary of Defense, John E. Robson,
Deputy Secretary of the Treasury, Ann M.
Veneman, Deputy Secretary of Agriculture
and Ronald W. Roskens, Administrator of
the Agency for International Development,
as Deputy Coordinators.
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The United States will focus its assistance
to the Soviet Union and the Republics on
several priority areas: food distribution and
marketing, energy and environment, finan-
cial and economic institution building,
democratic institution building, and defense
conversion. U.S. assistance also will be
aimed at promoting increased trade and in-
vestment through programs designed to en-
courage the involvement of U.S. businesses
in the emerging private sector of the Soviet
Union and the Republics.

Teleconference Remarks on the Kick-
Off of Arizona 2000
December 12, 1991

The President. Governor, how are you,
Fife?

Governor Symington. Fine, Mr. Presi-
dent, how are you?

The President. Well, I don't know how
our communication is working, but I
wanted to just check in and call with con-
gratulations to you and to that great team
that Lamar tells me you've put together.
And I understand some of them are there.

Governor Symington. Yes, we have ev-
erybody assembled at the Trevor Browne
High School. And we've got 1,200 people in
the audience.

The President. Well, that is terrific. And I
know that Jim Kolbe's there, and Jon Kyl; at
least they were scheduled to be.

Governor Symington. They're here.
The President. Well, let me salute them,

and also Diane Bishop, your State superin-
tendent. And I say this because I want to
emphasize something that I'm sure you
know, and that is that we don't view this
marvelous program that you all are en-
gaged in as a partisan effort at all. I mean,
this is national. It flies over politics. And I
think it's catching on around the country.
And I wanted to just congratulate you on
getting it kicked off here.

And I didn't know you had 1,200 people.
I heard there was 800 Bruins sitting out
there in the auditorium. They said 900. It
sounds like you've got a bunch there.

But that's just great. And I hope that they
all realize that Arizona is involved in some-

thing fundamental, something revolution-
ary, and something wonderful for our coun-
try.

But tell me, how's the day been going?
Governor Symington. It's going extreme-

ly well. But we're obviously thrilled to have
your call. And we just want to thank you for
your tremendous leadership on the educa-
tion front, Mr. President. And we're happy
to be an America 2000 State.

The President. Well, I know it'll go well.
And I think the point here is that you're
showing that education reform can happen
right there at the local level, on a school-by-
school or community-by-community basis.
And we're-the Federal Government obvi-
ously wants to do its part. Educational
spending is higher than it's ever been. But
this isn't a question of simply money; it's a
question of ideas and revolutionizing our
approach, the Nation's approach to educa-
tion.

So, good luck on it. And I think it is a way
that the whole community can pull togeth-
er to help all the students learn. And I'm
impressed with what you're doing. So, give
Lamar a homework assignment if you will.
The poor guy's killing himself going all
around the country and doing a superb job.
But tell him when he gets back-is he sit-
ting right there?

Governor Symington. He's right here.
The President. Oh, well, let me ask him

then. Lamar, when you get back, give me a
report on how this thing shapes up, how
Arizona 2000 is doing, how it fits into our
national program. And come on over to the
White House, and we'll get an update on
this big trip of yours.

Governor Symington. He's coming right
to the phone, Mr. President.

The President. Okay.
Secretary Alexander. Yes, sir. [Laughter]
The President. How's it looking out

there?
Secretary Alexander. Thank you, Mr.

President. I'll see you next week.
The President. Well, I look forward to it.

And may I say to everyone there: Diane
Bishop, Lela Alston, who is, I understand,
the chairman of the senate education com-
mittee from the State Senate; Bev Herman
was supposed to be there, who is the chair-
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man of the house education committee in
the Arizona State House.

I'm just delighted that you all are partici-
pating in this. And I wish you all the best.

Is Peter Rios out there, the president of
the house?

Governor Symington. Yes, Mr. President,
I was about to mention him. He's here as
well.

The President. Well, you've got them all.
I've just had a partial list here, but I was
told that the leadership would be there,
both Democrats and Republicans. So that's
great.

Well, listen, I won't keep you, but let me
wish all those Bruins a very merry Christ-
mas, a happy New Year. And let me give
them a little lecture. Do everything that
your Governor and your State superintend-
ent and these people are telling you to do
in terms of this education. We need you.
You're the future, and we need you bad. So,
have a good Christmas and then back to
work. And I'll do my part here.

And bless you all. And, Fife, keep up the
great work of leadership.

Governor Symington. Thank you, Mr.
President.

The President. Over and out.

Note: The President spoke at 3:47 p.m. from
the Oval Office in the White House. In his
remarks, he referred to Congressmen Jim
Kolbe and Jon Kyl of Arizona.

Exchange With Reporters Prior to a
Meeting With United Nations Secretary-
General Javier Perez de Cuellar
December 12, 1991

Gratitude for the Release of American
Hostages

Q. What are your thoughts this afternoon,
Mr. President?

The President. My thoughts? My thoughts
are gratitude to the Secretary-General and
to Mr. Picco. My thoughts are of courage
and heroism of the five people standing in
front of us. My thoughts are for their fami-
lies. My thoughts are of the joy that the
Nation feels at the release of these five and
others preceeding them. And I think this

says that we have a lot to be grateful for in
America. It's a wonderful, wonderful occa-
sion at the White House, having them here.

Now, we're going to go over into the
White House itself to honor the Secretary-
General, Mr. Picco, his courage, his heroism
really, helped free these people. And best
of all for Barbara and me, to say hello to
their loving families and welcome them
home.

The Yellow Ribbon

Q. Is it time to take the yellow ribbon
down, sir?

The President. Not for me. Not for me
until the cases are all closed. There's two
Germans held against their will. There are
remains of two beloved Americans who
have not been accounted for. And we are
grateful for what's happened, very grateful
that they're all here. I just couldn't be more
pleased.

Q. Can you-
The President. Not any louder, no, I can't.

[Laughter]

Timing of the Release

Q. Do you think this could have hap-
pened sooner?

The President. I'm just grateful that it's
happened. And, of course, I wish that it
happened sooner. For them to spend those
precious years in their lives held against
their will, of course, every American wishes
that it had been sooner.

In any event, why, they're home and
that's what matters. And it's Christmas and
that also matters.

Unresolved Hostage Issues

Q. Mr. Secretary-General, did you bring
any good news about the return of the re-
mains of Americans and about the release
of the two Germans?

The Secretary-General. Well, as you
know, I am extremely concerned about the
fate, of course, of Mr. Higgins, Colonel Hig-
gins and Mr. Buckley. And I hope to get
some news in the next few days.

And then, as far as the Germans are con-
cerned, we keep working and we are hope-
ful; as well as for the Israeli missing persons
and some others who are the detainees in
Lebanon as well, are a matter of concern to
me. Because for us in the United Nations
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we see too many problems. It is not a politi-
cal problem as you very well know.

The President. Thank you all very much.
We've got to go over and greet the families
now.

Note: The exchange began at 4:35 p.m.
in the Rose Garden at the White House, prior
to a meeting with the UN, Secretary-
General; Giandomenico Picco, Assistant to
the Secretary-General for Special
Assignments; and the former five American
hostages.

Remarks on Presenting the Medal of
Freedom and the Presidential Award
for Exceptional Service to United
Nations Officials
December 12, 1991

The President. We are so happy, Barbara
and I are so happy to be here for this very
special pre-Christmas family occasion at the
White House. The Vice President is here,
and I salute him. Members of our Cabinet:
Secretary of State; Secretary Mosbacher;
Secretary of Labor; Tom Pickering, our able
Ambassador at the U.N. And we all were
just dying to come.

We're joined also by two gentlemen who
represent the highest in humanitarian
ideals. And I'm talking, of course, about
Javier Perez de Cuellar, the Secretary-Gen-
eral of the United Nations; and the Assistant
Secretary-General Gianni Picco, who is
right here. Let me also welcome to the
White House the friends and the families of
five special men returned to freedom. Fi-
nally, to Thomas Sutherland, Alann Steen,
Jesse Turner, Joseph Cicippio, and Terry
Anderson, let me simply say on behalf of
our entire country, welcome home.

All over America people waited for the
day your long ordeal would end. And all
over America we share your joy, and we
thank God that you are free.

Nothing says it better than, I think, the
sign in Norristown, Pennsylvania, in
Thomas Cicippio's front yard. For 5 long
years that sign served as a constant remind-
er, with the name of each hostage and a
number counting each cruel day of captiv-
ity. And then, one by one, the numbers
gave way to a sign marked "Freed." And

finally, just 9 days ago, came the moment
the Cicippio family prayed for. And over
Joseph's name, they nailed not another
number but a sign that read, "Free at last."
And that said a lot for all of us.

And all of you have survived an act of
unspeakable, uncivilized cruelty. Hostage-
taking is hell on a human scale, not just for
the innocents held captive, but for the fami-
lies, for the families that they left behind.
And no power on Earth can give back the
years that you've lost. And yet no one can
take from you the strength of the spirit that
sustained you.

The world is now learning the horrors
that you endured. But we're learning as
well, and this is the good news, the story of
your survival, the miracle that you fash-
ioned from the hope your captors could not
take away.

We know now you used the language of
the deaf to communicate from cell to cell to
speak to one another in silence, how you
managed to learn from one another, laugh
with one another, help each other sustain a
stubborn indignity. And you demonstrated
each day in captivity a defiant faith. You
believed in your country and your families
and your colleagues and yourself. And you
knew that one day you would go free.

Your triumph shines new light on a
simple truth: The days and years apart burn
away the trivial things we once thought had
value to reveal what truly matters in life,
family, faith, hope, and love. And seeing
freedom through your eyes, even for a
moment, frees us from the petty concerns
that so often hold us hostage and distract us
from life's larger joys, larger meaning.

The families here today are whole again.
But for others the ordeal is not over, for
two German citizens and their families, for
the families of two courageous Americans
whose duty sent them to Lebanon and who
died at the hands of their captors. In the
name of the civilized values that we hold
dear, I call on those responsible for these
crimes: Free Heinrich Struebig and Thomas
Kemptner, and return the remains of Rich
Higgins and William Buckley. And let the
families of these innocent men find peace.

The truth is clear. Hostage-taking has
failed. From the beginning in Tehran in
1979, hostage-takers sought to exploit our
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system's reverence for the individual. They
sought to exploit that as a weakness. And
your captors believed hostage-taking would
tie our hands, and they were wrong. We
remained determined to defend American
interests in international principles in the
Middle East. Through Desert Shield and
Desert Storm we stood fast against aggres-
sion, and we showed the world that terror-
ism in all its forms can't succeed. And in
the end, the hostage-takers did more
damage to their cause than they did to
America's resolve, certainly than they did to
your resolve. And in the end, each hostage-
taking, each heartless act against innocence
announced to the world the inhumanity of
the captors.

Tom Sutherland and Terry Anderson, you
were right when you said no to negotiating
with hostage-takers. This administration has
followed a no-negotiation policy since the
beginning. Bargaining serves only to make
a currency of human lives and leads to
more of the evil that it seeks to end. I am
convinced that this course remains the
world's best hope that no more innocent
men and women will meet your fate, that
no family will ever again be forced to
endure your years in agony.

This policy was not without risk. Sticking
with it wasn't easy, especially for a country
that cares, so deeply about every American
held against his will. We've learned that it
works. It helped end the agony, and I like
to feel that it helped bring you home.

Yes, America did its part. Many men and
women in this country and around the
world, most of whom you'll never meet,
worked to secure your freedom. And today,
we want to go on. So many of the family
members sitting behind you all and aside of
you did their part, and boy, did they do it
well. And it wasn't just spouses; it was sis-
ters and brothers and plenty of others I
might single out here.

But there are others as well. And today
we want to recognize the selfless efforts of
one man who, at great personal risk, helped
bring you to freedom. And I might say par-
enthetically that one of the first words I
heard from Terry Anderson was the sugges-
tion that we honor the man we're about to
honor, and the other one as well.

In his years as Special Envoy at the
United Nations, Assistant Secretary-General

Gianni Picco has sought always to serve
peace and to resolve conflict. Today for his
efforts in winning the freedom of our hos-
tages, we honor Mr. Picco with the Presi-
dential Award for Exceptional Service.

Would you come up here, please, sir?
Very proud to have you here.

I will ask the Major to read the citation
please. Please be seated.

The Major. "The United States honors
Mr. Picco in recognition of his distinguished
role in facilitating the release of hostages
held in Lebanon. His skillful diplomacy
with Middle Eastern governments and offi-
cials and representatives of the hostage
holders has resulted in freedom for many
individuals held in the region outside the
due process of law, including six Ameri-
cans.

"His personal courage in the face of
danger and his dedication to the mission
represent the best tradition of international
civil service."

The President. We also honor the man
who made your release his personal respon-
sibility, a man whose life work in service to
humanitarian ideals has won him honor the
world over, Javier Perez de Cuellar.

Before asking the Major to read the cita-
tion let me just say this: He made peace
among all nations his mission. He's taken
the principles of the United Nations Char-
ter as a personal code.

He was present at the creation as a dele-
gate to the first General Assembly of the
United Nations back in 1946. And we first
met in 1971 when each of us received the
singular honor of serving our countries as
Permanent Representative to the United
Nations.

My distinguished colleague went on to
represent Peru in the Security Council, and
then, of course, as we all know, for the past
10 years he has served the cause of world
peace as Secretary-General.

His tenure has marked the rebirth, literal-
ly, the rebirth of the United Nations, its
emergence as a force for peace. Coopera-
tion now replaces cold war conflict. And
across the globe the U.N. now leads the
international effort to resolve conflicts that
have caused so much suffering. Peacekeep-
ing missions have proliferated. Eleven are
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underway right now; five begun in the past
year alone.

And, Mr. Secretary-General, I am person-
ally grateful to you for your strong stand
against Iraq's assault on Kuwait, your tire-
less work to sustain the coalition. In large
part because of your leadership, the United
Nations now stands closer to its founding
ideal than at any time in history.

And today then we honor this architect of
peace, a man we are all proud to call
friend, that Barbara and I especially treas-
ure the friendship for the Perez de Cuel-
lars. Mr. Secretary-General, with great
pride I now present to you the highest civil-
ian honor this country can bestow, the
Medal of Freedom. And I will ask the Major
to read the citation.

The Major. "Javier Perez de Cuellar. For
10 years of exceptionally distinguished serv-
ice as Secretary-General of the United Na-
tions, Javier Perez de Cuellar presided over
the rebirth of that institution. With wisdom,
vision, diplomacy, and skill, he forged a
U.N. where cooperation in reaching
common goals is replacing rhetoric and di-
vision.

"His tireless dedication to conflict resolu-
tion, and economic and social concerns has
contributed to a better world and ensured a
strengthened U.N. more capable than ever
of fulfilling its Charter.

"His service has been marked by a singular
devotion to humanitarian interests, includ-
ing the life, security, and safety of individ-
ual people throughout the world.

"The United States honors a servant of hu-
mankind who has advanced the cause of
freedom and hope."

The President. Congratulations.
The Secretary-General. Mr. President,

Mrs. Bush, Excellencies, ladies and gentle-
men, it is a tremendous honor for me to
receive the Medal of Freedom, an award
that I shall value all the more highly be-
cause it has been given to me by my old
and very dear friend, President Bush.

In my view, it is really more appropriate
that this tribute should be paid to the
United Nations as a whole rather than to
me personally. Today, as never before, the
organization is being called upon to fulfill
the responsibility entrusted to it by its
founding fathers nearly half a century ago.
The circumstances in the international

arena that have made it possible for the
United Nations to carry out this role are
deeply gratifying. And much credit is due
to President Bush himself, who has a pro-
found understanding of the organization
and its goals.

Mr. President, it gives me special pleas-
ure to attend this ceremony after having
been greeted by a group of brave and won-
derful men who, at this moment, under-
stand more fully than we possibly can the
true meaning of freedom. That these
former American hostages have, at long
last, been reunited with their loved ones
and especially during this holiday season
makes the efforts that I and my efficient
and loyal assistant, Mr. Giandomenico
Picco, have undertaken these many months
all the more worthwhile.

At the same time, Mr. President, I cannot
but mention with sorrow an American who
was kidnaped while serving the United Na-
tions, namely, Colonel William R. Higgins,
who was, at the time of his abduction, chief
of a peacekeeping observer group in south
Lebanon. It is tragic that the life of this
innocent man was lost. I am doing every-
thing possible to see to it that his body is
returned promptly to his family.

As I prepare to leave office, I would like,
once again, to thank President Bush for the
cooperation and support he has extended to
me as Secretary-General, and to the organi-
zation more widely; and particularly in
helping to ensure that the United Nations
may fulfill the enormous expectations that
today exist for greater peace, stability, and
respect for human rights to all the world.
Thank you, Mr. President.

The President. I know some of us are
going over to light America's Christmas
tree across the way, but Barbara and I just
have to say hello to the families. So what
we'll suggest is, we'll go out here in the
hall, and you all come wandering out.
You've got to do that; that's mandatory. You
have to say hello to us. And then, please
take your families and browse through this
winter wonderland. The work on all these
decorations was done by volunteers from all
over this country, and I think you'll feel, as
we do, that the White House is blessed by
this wonderful dedication, and the gift from
the American people.
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So, it's a fitting time that you all are here.
And I think we'll just wander on out now
and ask you to come, and please, all of you
just come by and say hello. We'd love that.

Note: The President spoke at 5:03 p.m. in
the East Room at the White House. Maj. John
Wissler, USMC, military aide to the Presi-
dent, read the citations. A tape was not
available for verification of the content of
this exchange.

Remarks on Lighting the National
Christmas Tree
December 12, 1991

Welcome to this wonderful Washington
tradition. And I am particularly proud to-
night to have some very special friends
here with us to help light our Nation's
Christmas tree. America's prayers were an-
swered when these men came home to us;
so a special welcome to Terry Anderson and
Madeleine Bassil. Here they are: Alann and
Virginia Steen; and Thomas and Jean Suth-
erland; Joseph and Elham Cicippio; and
Jesse and Badr Turner.

Have a great evening.
[At this point, the Christmas Pageant of
Peace entertainment began.]

Well, thank you, Joe. Please be seated all
of you, and it's good to see the Secretary of
the Interior, so many other special guests
here. And, of course, a warm thank you to
Marilyn Horne; this marvelous Tucson Boys
Chorus; the Navy Band; Joe Williams; our
favorites, the Gatlin Brothers over here.
And all the performers who brought the
Christmas spirit to Washington tonight.

And thanks to Santa. His big night is
coming up. And we don't have to ask this
particular Santa, Willard Scott, what the
weather's going to be like on Christmas
Eve. He's predicting it. And he is right
every once in a while. [Laughter]

This is a very special night. And I look
over my shoulder here at the very special
guests, the brave men who are with us here
tonight. And on behalf of our loving coun-
try I say, finally, to Terry Anderson, to Tom
Sutherland, Joseph Cicippio, and Alarm
Steen and Jesse Turner, and the others not
here: Welcome home.

Welcome home, to this, the most gener-
ous and proud and free Nation on the face
of the Earth. It is more than just appropri-
ate, it is almost miraculous that we can cele-
brate with these five the lighting of our
Nation's Christmas tree. The idea is .so
moving because these men have come out
of darkness into the bright light of liberty.
And as you hear these remarkable men talk,
you realize they were never lost in that
darkness of sorrow, anguish, and despair.
Even at the worst moments, they were
guided by a stubborn spark that cruelty
could not extinguish, the spark of the
human spirit.

Their precious gift to us is to rekindle our
Nation's belief in the light of faith and our
belief in ourselves. And when Terry and
Tom and Joseph and Alann and Jesse light
our Nation's tree tonight, that act will be a
reminder of what they and their compan-
ions, living and gone, have already done to
light our Nation's soul.

There have been special guests at these
ceremonies before. Even Winston Churchill
helped to light the tree during World War
II, but this Nation has never been honored
by the presence of men whose spirit meant
more to all of us. Your fortitude, your
humor, and generosity tell us the true
meaning of this season. And at this time of
year especially, these men remind us that
the glitz and glamour of material things
don't matter; the courage, the faith, and the
love of these men embody, that they
embody, are all we need to recognize
what's really important.

The way they've returned to their fami-
lies and to us proves they live by the chal-
lenge of that beautiful prayer of St. Francis,
"Grant that I may not so much seek to be
consoled as to console; to be understood as
to understand; to be loved as to love.
Where there is despair, let us sow hope;
where there is hatred, love; and -where
there is darkness, ever light."

When history remembers Christmas 1991,
let it remember that tonight we gathered
with men who show us that this is a season
of spirit, not a celebration of plenty.

Let history remember that tonight we
stood with these two heroes and asked for
God's blessing on this world. And finally, in
the words of the carol we'll sing in a few
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minutes, let history remember that at
Christmas 1991, this Nation united to give
thanks to God and to ask God for peace on
earth, goodwill to all.

God bless these five men, this wonderful
country, and now I'd like to ask them to
join me as we light the Nation's Christmas
tree.

Note: The President spoke at 5:42 p.m. on
the Ellipse during the annual Christmas
Pageant of Peace. In his remarks, he re-
ferred to Joe Riley, president of the Christ-
mas Pageant of Peace; Marilyn Home,
mezzo-soprano with the Metropolitan
Opera; jazz singer Joe Williams; and coun-
try and western entertainers, the Gatlin
Brothers. Television weatherman Willard
Scott was dressed as Santa Claus. A tape
was not available for verification of the
content of these remarks.

Proclamation 6391-Wright Brothers
Day, 1991
December 12, 1991
By the President of the United States
of America

A Proclamation
They were quiet men of modest means,

but in an extraordinary display of talent,
imagination, and teamwork, Orville and
Wilbur Wright changed the world. Less
than a century ago, on December 17, 1903,
these enterprising brothers launched the
age of aviation with the first controlled,
manned flight in a heavier-than-air, me-
chanically propelled airplane. Although
their handcrafted "Flyer" covered just 120
feet on its maiden voyage over the wind-
swept beach near Kitty'Hawk, North Caro-
lina, the Wright brothers helped lead man-
kind on a great journey of discovery and
progress that continues to this day.

Given the routine nature of air travel
today-as well as the increasing frequency
of shuttle missions and other forms of space-
flight-it can be difficult for us to fathom
just how remarkable the work of the
Wright brothers was. When they began to
experiment with airplane models and wind
tunnels at their small workshop in Dayton,

Ohio, many people believed that human
flight would never be possible. At that time,
even the automobile had not yet appeared
on the American scene. Defying the skep-
tics, Orville and Wilbur Wright persevered
through months of careful study, calcula-
tion, and design.

Indeed, long before they began construct-
ing their first flying machine, the Wrights
immersed themselves in the study of exist-
ing texts and papers on fundamental aero-
dynamics. They also conducted exhaustive
research, moving far beyond previously ac-
cepted data and theories, many of which
had proved to be unreliable. The Wrights'
achievement of three-axis control in flight,
inspired by watching birds of the air, laid
the foundation for their success at Kitty
Hawk and for the future development of all
aviation.

More than a tribute to their mechanical
acumen and collective genius, the Wright
brothers' triumph at Kitty Hawk stands as a
shining example of the power of intellect
and determination over seemingly insur-
mountable odds. It is an example we do
well to remember. Today many frontiers
still stand before us. Every problem and
question we face, both as individuals and as
a Nation, represents new challenges and op-
portunities. Like Orville and Wilbur Wright
and like all those Americans who have used
their freedom, resources and skill to reach
high goals, we, too, can rise on the wings of
industry and learning.

The Congress, by a joint resolution ap-
proved December 17, 1963 (77 Stat. 402; 36
U.S.C. 169),. has designated the 17th day of
December of each year as "Wright Brothers
Day" and requested the President to issue
annually a proclamation commemorating
this day.

Now, Therefore, I, George Bush, Presi-
dent of the United States of America, do
hereby proclaim December 17, 1991, as
Wright Brothers Day. I invite all Americans
to observe that day with appropriate pro-
grams, ceremonies, and activities.

In Witness Whereof, I have hereunto set
my hand this twelfth day of December, in
the year of our Lord nineteen hundred and
ninety-one, and of the Independence of the
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United States of America the two hundred
and sixteenth.

George Bush

[Filed with the Office of the Federal Regis-
ter, 10:10 a.m. December 13, 1991]

Note: This proclamation was published in
the Federal Register on December 16.

Statement on Signing the Conventional
Forces in Europe Treaty
Implementation Act of 1991
December 12, 1991

Today I have signed into law H.R. 3807,
the "Conventional Forces in Europe Treaty
Implementation Act of 1991." The Act sup-
ports the United States Government's pro-
gram to transfer Conventional Forces in
Europe treaty-limited equipment within the
NATO Alliance. Implementation serves U.S.
security interests and achieves Administra-
tion objectives.

However, I have concerns over two pro-
visions of the Act. Section 401(c) requires
that the Inspector General of the United
States Arms Control and Disarmament
Agency submit a report on certain matters
to the President, the Speaker of the House,
and the Chairman of the Senate Foreign
Relations Committee. Because prior review
of executive branch reports is integral to
the President's constitutional authority to
supervise and control decision-making
within the executive branch, H.R. 3807
shall not be interpreted to encroach upon
that authority.

Section 402 requires additional congres-
sional oversight of On-Site Inspection
Agency (OSIA) activities. The existing
review by the House and Senate Armed
Services and Appropriations Committees
provides sufficient congressional oversight
of OSIA activities. Expanding the review to
include other committees of the House and
Senate will unnecessarily burden the
budget review and oversight process. The
requested report and budget documenta-
tion for the Committees on Foreign Affairs

and Foreign Relations will be submitted
merely to provide notice.

George Bush

The White House,
December 12, 1991.

Note: H.R. 3807, approved December 12,
was assigned Public Law No. 102-228.

Statement on Signing the Dire
Emergency Appropriations and
Disaster Assistance Legislation
December 12, 1991

Today I have signed into law H.J. Res.
157, the "Dire Emergency Supplemental
Appropriations and Transfers for Relief
From the Effects of Natural Disasters, for
Other Urgent Needs, and for Incremental
Cost of 'Operation Desert Shield/Desert
Storm' Act of 1992."

I am pleased that the Congress was able
to approve, prior to its adjournment, a bill
that provides urgently needed funding for
programs that address the effects of natural
disasters in the United States and its territo-
ries. I am likewise pleased that H.J. Res. 157
provides these needed funds in a way that
does not violate the statutory spending
limits mandated by the Budget Enforce-
ment Act (BEA) or the concept of what
constitutes an emergency under the BEA.

The Act provides $800 million for the
Federal Emergency Management Agency's
disaster relief program to cover costs associ-
ated with the unusually high level of disas-
ters that have occurred during 1991. These
include Hurricane Bob; the devastating fires
in Oakland, California, and the State of
Washington; and the northeastern storm
that ravaged New England on October 31.
In addition, the Act provides $995 million
in assistance to producers of agricultural
crops who have suffered losses during 1990
or 1991. Pursuant to section 251(bX2XDXi)
of the Balanced Budget and Emergency
Deficit Control Act of 1985, as amended, I
designate these amounts as emergency re-
quirements. These designated amounts in-
clude the amount I designated as an emer-
gency requirement on June 28, 1991, in my
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supplemental and amendment requests for
FEMA.

The Act also includes funds for the incre-
mental costs of Operation Desert Shield/
Storm. Such expenditures continue to be fi-
nanced by foreign contributions to the De-
fense Cooperation Account.

I am appreciative of the fact that the
Congress deleted or significantly limited
the availability of over $2.5 billion in fund-
ing that I have not designated as "emergen-
cy requirements."

George Bush

The White House,
December 12, 1991.

Note: Hi Res. 157, approved December 12,
was assigned Public Law No. 102-229.

Statement on Signing the Resolution
Trust Corporation Refinancing,
Restructuring, and Improvement Act of
1991
December 12, 1991

Today I have signed into law H.R. 3435,
the "Resolution Trust Corporation Refi-
nancing, Restructuring, and Improvement
Act of 1991." This Act reorganizes the Res-
olution Trust Corporation (RTC) while pro-
viding only stopgap funding to allow the
RTC to resume the resolution of failed
thrifts.

H.R. 3435 provides only a part of the
funds requested by the Administration
which are urgently needed to protect de-
positors' accounts. This manner of funding
risks a repeat of the start-and-stop process
that has already cost American taxpayers
millions of dollars.

The Administration requested $80 billion
to allow the RTC to fulfill the Federal Gov-
ernment's deposit insurance commitments
and complete the job of closing insolvent
thrifts.

I am approving this legislation in view of
the RTC's critical need to receive funding
immediately so that we can make good on
our Government's deposit insurance obliga-
tions. I urge the Congress, upon its return,
to move quickly to provide the remaining

necessary funds to allow the RTC to com-
plete its mission without increasing the
burden on America's taxpayers.

George Bush

The White House,
December 12, 1991.

Note: H.R. 3435, approved December 12,
was assigned Public Law No. 102-233.

Exchange With Reporters on the
Situation in the Soviet Union
December 13, 1991

Q. Mr. President, now that it appears that
Gorbachev is on his way out, what are your
feelings?

The President. Well, we're watching that
situation very closely. Secretary Baker made
a very good speech, talking about adminis-
tration policy. We're looking forward to his
trip. And this is not a helpful time to edito-
rialize on personalities inside the Soviet
Union.

We're supporting those who are re-
formed. We're supporting those who are for
democracy, whoever they are, wherever
they are, in whatever Republic they are
and in the center. And that's been our
policy, and we will continue to watch this
question of self-determination evolve in the
Soviet Union. And that's exactly what's hap-
pening. And we have some interests, inter-
ests in the peaceful reconciliation. We've
got fundamental interests in responsibility
to the whole world for the nuclear weapons
question. So we want to see that that is
handled with the ultimate, maximum
amount of safety, and the assurances from
the center and from the Republics has been
very good on that, incidentally.

So we're watching it very, very closely,
and I think the leaders there understand
our position as to let them sort these mat-
ters out. It's not for the United States to
dictate these matters, but we do have inter-
ests, some of which I've mentioned here.

Thank you all very much.
Q. Have you been in contact with Yeltsin

or Gorbachev?

1820

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. 1820 1991



Administration of George Bush, 1991 / Dec. 13

The President. We'll let you know when
we reveal the personal contacts I've had.
But we're in close contact with the differ-
ent factions.

Thank you.

Note: The exchange began at 9:18 a.m. in
the Roosevelt Room at the White House.

Exchange with Reporters in the
Cabinet Room
December 13, 1991

The President. Listen, this meeting is on
our drug strategy, and I'm very grateful to
so many, members of the Cabinet and other
leaders who are here today. I have great
confidence in the work that Bob is involved
in. And, indeed, there is some very good
news on the drug front. That doesn't mean
we've won the battle by a long shot, but
I'm sure he'll be reporting to us in just a
minute on the problems that remain and on
the progress that's been made.

This has got to be, as we turn the corner,
remain as one of our key priorities. And
when you talk to some that he's enlisted in
the private sector, I'm encouraged. I mean,
I've talked to quite a few of them, Jim
Burke and many others, and they are very,
very positive as to how we're doing here.
When I look at the international situation
that Bob's been engaged in, in the interdic-
tion, working with Justice and many others,
Don Atwood's department, why, there's
reason to be optimistic there.

So, it's a good message, but we've got to
do better, and we've got to continue to
fight. So thank you all very much. And
now-

Q. Mr. President, can I just ask you to
follow up on something you said in the
other session?

The President. No, we've got to get
going, honestly. We really do. We've been
in there, interrupted, you know, when we
did a meeting, that I deviated from the
rules. So thanks.

Q. Could you just explain-I mean, why
are you satisfied with assurances that there's
no nuclear threat because of the Soviet-

The President. We will explain all that in
time. I can't do it at a photo opportunity.
It's very complicated.

Q. Are you satisfied there's no problem?
The President. I can certify to the Ameri-

can people that the assurances we've been
given are very positive. And we are con-
tinuing to stay engaged in it. So, please let
us have this time. I only have a little bit,
limited-

Note: The exchange began at 10:03 a.m.
prior to a meeting with the Domestic Policy
Council. In his remarks, the President re-
ferred to Bob Martinez, Director of the
Office of Drug Control Policy; Deputy Sec-
retary of Defense Donald I Atwood, Jr.;
and Jim Burke, Chairman of the President's
Drug Advisory Council. A tape was not
available for verification of the content of
this exchange.

Teleconference Remarks to the 1991
Congress of Cities
December 13, 1991

The President. Thank you, Commissioner
Hood. And I understand you're the incom-
ing president of the wonderful organization,
the National League of Cities. Thank you
for inviting me to be with you. To Presi-
dent Sidney Barthelemy, the Mayor of one
of my favorite cities, New Orleans, welcome
to you, sir. I look forward to your help, most
of all, officials who have enriched our cities
and helped our cities enrich America; I
greet all of you.

I am very pleased that Lamar Alexander
was able to address you this morning. A
former Governor, a great Secretary of Edu-
cation; he's doing a great job. And we are
on to something with this America 2000.
And I hope when he finished that you had a
feel for this marvelous program.

Our mayors are doing a great job in help-
ing make American education number one.
I was hoping today to be with you in
person, but at least I can say America has
produced two Presidents in a row who have
made it to the big screen. This is a good
way to do it if you can't be there in person.
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It's an honor to join this year's NLC
Annual Congress of Cities, even if it is by
video hookup, and to salute you soldiers on
the front lines. You man the front lines of
our assault on falling scores and failing
grades in education, our war on drugs, our
defense of the American family, and our
battle against crime. And you know why
we've got to crusade to protect American
principles and work to solve America's
problems.

As the elected officials out there hearing
the needs of day-to-day, ordinary people,
you understand those problems. And you
know them not from a bureaucrat's safe dis-
tance but from the hot seat of an elected
official whose neighbors call to complain
about roads and taxes and the police. You
know. You name it.

Many people wonder how a President
can know what goes on outside Washington,
especially for families struggling to make
ends meet. Well, I have read the letters of
people feeling the pinch of a tough econo-
my. As a matter of fact, I've traveled to 48
States since becoming President, talking
and meeting people and listening and, yes,
learning at every stop. And I've listened to
the guidance and advice of leaders, many of
whom are right there in that room.

And when I deliver my State of the
Union Address in a few weeks, I'm going to
ask the Congress to lay aside partisan inter-
est just long enough to focus on America's
interest and to enact a commonsense series
of economic growth measures. Also, because
each additional billion dollars in manufac-
tured goods and trade means another
20,000 American jobs, I'm going to contin-
ue fighting to crack open foreign markets
to create domestic jobs. And that's the mes-
sage I'm going to be taking with me on my
upcoming trip to Asia. We go down to Aus-
tralia, Singapore, Korea, and Japan.

In the meantime, I will make sure that
our agencies do everything they can to help
the people, from getting those unemploy-
ment checks out to easing the credit
crunch. Already, we've taken steps to help
those in need, speeding up a number of
Government payments that will put $9.7
billion into the economy that wouldn't have
been there during the first and second
quarters of the fiscal year.

And I'm especially proud of the transpor-
tation bill which I'll be signing in just a few
days that will keep our traffic on the move
and our economy on the rise, building roads
and fixing bridges and creating jobs.

And still, it isn't enough. We have to
build on these beginnings. So I hope our
other initiatives are also helping you. For
example, our administration has boosted
State and local law enforcement funding to
$495 million. That's in addition to the $250
million in cash and property seized last year
from drug dealers through what we call the
Asset Forfeiture program. Overall, Federal
aid to States and localities to fight drugs has
grown under this administration to nearly
$3 billion a year. I think the total spending
I jotted down here is $11.7 billion.

Our Healthy Start program to cut infant
mortality got a big boost this year, from $21
million to $65 million. And that's also true
for AIDS research and treatment. Under
the Ryan White Act, $200 million in AIDS
prevention in fiscal '92 goes directly to
cities. And I also ask your support of some-
thing which can help every city, enterprise
zones to unleash a new generation of entre-
preneurs to attract new business to those
areas.

President Kennedy once said, "We will
neglect our cities at our peril, for in ne-
glecting them we neglect the Nation." I do
not intend to neglect our cities, nor do I
intend to burden them with Washington's
version of help: Taxes, rules, regulations,
and no money. We've learned the wisdom
of keeping government closest to the
people. My administration wants to give
local power and local responsibility to local
officials. We want to free you to do what
you do best.

I do want to do my part. To do so, I need
your counsel and your wisdom. So let's
work together to find new solutions to old
problems. Only then can we prepare our
cities and our country for the new Ameri-
can century ahead.

It is great to be with you all. I'd be glad
to take a couple of questions. But thank you
for what you've done. Thank you for what
you are doing. And at this special time of
year, God bless you all. I just wish that each
and every one of you -could have been at
the White House yesterday as we welcomed

1822

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. 1822 1991



Administration of George Bush, 1991 / Dec. 13

home those five hostages. I can only say
that Barbara and I count our blessings for
family every day of the year. And this was a
most-moving occasion. And then we took
them out to light the Nation's Christmas
tree-we modestly call it-across from the
White House. And I flipped the electric
switch and nothing happened. [Laughter]

But in any event, it was a great and won-
derful, moving day for our whole country.
And I wish each of you leaders could have
been with us in the White House.

And now I'll be glad, Commissioner, to
take any questions.

War on Drugs

Q. Mr. President, more than 20 years ago,
former President Richard Nixon declared a
Federal war on drugs. Three years ago, you
announced a similar war. Yet today the
problem of drugs and drug-related violence
on our streets is just as pervasive as ever. In
fact, murders are at record levels. Mr. Presi-
dent, we have a very enthusiastic audience
here--[laughter]--I wish you were here to
see how wonderful this audience is and how
concerned this audience is. However, over
the last 20-year period, the Federal Govern-
ment has been unwilling to spend one
single dime and send it directly to those of
us who are on the front lines that you men-
tioned.

In the Gulf war you went to the front
lines to meet with the troops to ensure that
they had the necessary tools and support in
order to win. Can we count on you, Mr.
President, in your new budget and legisla-
tive agenda to provide for direct assistance
to cities and towns?

The President. Well, let me simply say
that from an overall standpoint, fighting the
Nation's drug war from an overall stand-
point, Federal funding is up by 80 percent
since I've become President, 80 percent, to
$11.7 billion. I think it is $11.7 billion. And
nearly $3 billion will go to State and local
governments. I am familiar with the age-old
argument as to whether the Governors get
it or whether the mayors get it. And I've
been around the political track long enough
to be aware of it. In our program, we are
trying to recognize this and trying to get
the job done.

Let me just say, though, you had a very
pessimistic assessment of where the matter

stands. And there's plenty of reason to be
pessimistic, but there's also some reason to
be somewhat optimistic. Drug use amongst
the young people have gone off-this awful
cocaine amongst young people is down over
the last 2 years by something like 11 per-
cent. The war isn't won, but progress is
being made.

We're working with a media campaign,
all private, they're spending $1 million a
day on advertising which gets right into
your communities, trying to educate people
against the use of drugs. So in addition to
the Government money, that means the
taxpayers' money, in addition to the Gov-
ernment money, there is a lot going on.
And, frankly, if you canvassed that hall,
though everyone could use more funds for
fighting drugs, I think that you'd find that a
lot of people out there in what we call the
volunteer sector are doing an awful lot.
We've honored a lot of them here at the
White House, and I am terribly impressed
by how community action is making an
enormous contribution to the fight against
drugs.

But yes, in our budget I think you'll see
the amount of money I said for State, for
local governments, and I also think that
you'll see what I would think is pretty full
funding, in tough financial times I might
add, for the fight against drugs.

Let me give you another side of it that I
think is important. We're doing better on
the interdiction side as well. Much better
on that. And then you mentioned the crime
problem. I would like to enlist the support
of everybody in that room. You are on the
front line. You are on the cutting edge, and
I'd like to enlist your support for a tough, a
meaningful, tough anti-crime bill. We've
been trying to get that through Congress
for a long, long time. And again, let's put
the politics aside and let's give the support
that we need to the police officers that are
out there on the beat.

But thank you. It was a good question.
Q. Thank you for taking time to be with

us, and thank you for the tree you planted 2
years ago in memory of Ryan White. It's
still standing in downtown Indianapolis.

The President. Is it growing, though?
[Laughter]
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Block Grant Program for Cities
Q. There's a strong feeling here, Mr.

President, that when the cities hurt, Amer-
ica hurts, and when the cities are healthy,
America is healthy. Many central cities and
small towns are facing severe fiscal distress
today. Their tax bases have eroded while
poverty, crime, and health care needs and
demands have accelerated.

We believe the idea of direct assistance to
cities and towns from the Federal Govern-
ment has merit. And the question I would
ask you, sir, is: Can we prevail upon you to
consider a proposal this year to put togeth-
er a package of Federal relief for unfunded
mandates and targeted fiscal assistance to
cities and towns, and would you be willing
to meet with a group of local officials to
discuss this subject?

The President. That was two questions.
Bill, you know, and I don't know whether
you helped formulate the general idea of an
enormous block grant proposal that we
have; it's about finished. What we've tried
to do on this block grant proposal-I be-
lieve it's in the $15-billion range-was to
work it out in a way that it will get support
in the Congress. And we've tried to take
into consideration some of the congressional
concerns without making this block grant
into some other mandated program by
having a lot of strings attached.

So, we are finalizing now-and it will be
ready in time to send up as soon as Con-
gress goes back-a substantial block grant
program that will go out there without
strings attached, and I believe it will get
passed. So, I'm very interested in this. It's
taken a long time to get the legislation
drafted in a way to answer some of the-
well, I'd put it this way-understandable
concerns in the Congress. But we're going
to be pushing it, and it's going to be a part
of our overall economic package.

Inasmuch as you made the request-and I
never say no to Hudnut, that's my motto-I
think it would be useful to sit down with
you and a handful of others that you might
bring into the White House to talk about
these problems.

I wasn't just, as we say, "blowing smoke"
when I made my remarks. We are in touch
with mayors. We had the mayor of New
York City down here just the other day.
Wasn't heralded as a great public relations

event, but I learned from that. A long talk
with other mayors as we go along. But
bring them in here. We may have to wait
until after the first because we're going off,
as you know, coming into this marvelous
Christmas season, and we might all need a
little bit of rest. But I'd like to do it, and
you can consider this a formal acceptance
of what I thought was a relatively formal-
ized request.

Q. Mr. President, and we accept that, and
we will be there to visit with you. And we
appreciate the time that you have given us
this morning. We want to work with you.
We're counting on you, as you're counting
on us, and let me, on behalf of all of the
delegates here this morning, not only once
again thank you, but wish you and Mrs.
Bush a very happy holiday.

The President. Well, same to all of you.
And let me end by making one additional
comment. These are tough times, and
there's a lot of people at work and there's
an unsatisfactory number of people out of
work. A lot of people are worried. Their
confidence is not there. And they worry
about tomorrow, even though they have a
job today. And I understand all that, and
we're going to try in the State of the Union
Message to make a proposal that won't
make matters worse out of good intentions
but will make them better and come for-
ward with a strong program there. I believe
we'll have that. I hope it will have the sup-
port, enthusiastic support across party lines,
not only in the Congress but out there.

But let me just say this at the end of this
year, inasmuch as you were gracious and
really kind enough to wish Barbara and me
a merry Christmas. You know, we have a
lot to be grateful for in this wonderful coun-
try of ours. I touched on the hostage
matter. This morning, I had a long conver-
sation with Boris Yeltsin over in Moscow,
and there's great and interesting change
going on there.

But the underpinning of that change is
freedom, and it is democracy, and it is
reform. And you look around at the 'fact
that in this very day in Washington Arabs
are talking to Israelis, something that might
not have happened. You look abroad and
you see the newfound credibility of the
United States as a result of what your sons
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and daughters did in Desert Storm. The
United States can use that credibility now
to get into these foreign markets and create
jobs and our voice is more credible around
the world.

So, I cannot neglect my responsibilities
for world peace, for managing on behalf of
the only superpower in the world that
other countries look to not just for that but
because of our values. I'm not going to for-
sake those responsibilities. But I am going
to do what is necessary and stay involved
with you at that level that I know so well,
in order to try to help alleviate the con-
cerns that I mentioned in the very begin-
ning that the American people have.

Having said that, we have a lot to be
grateful for in the United States of America.
And thank you for your greetings, and Bar-
bara will appreciate it. And I hope that you
and all your families have the best Christ-
mas ever and a wonderfully prosperous, ex-
citing, forward-moving 1992. Good luck to
each and every one of you. And thank you
for letting me come in this way.

Note: The President spoke at 1:17 p.m. from
Room 459 of the Old Executive Office
Building to the annual Congress of Cities,
sponsored by the National League of Cities,
meeting in Las Vegas, NV. In his remarks,
he referred to Glenda E. Hood, first vice
president of the National League of Cities;
Ryan White, a teenager who died of AIDS
in 1990; and Thomas Hudnut, mayor of In-
dianapolis. A tape was not available for
verification of the content of these remarks.

Statement by Press Secretary Fitzwater
on a Comprehensive Safeguard
Agreement Between Argentina, Brazil,
and the International Atomic Energy
Agency
December 13, 1991

The President has congratulated Presi-
dents Menem and Collor for their states-
manship in signing a comprehensive safe-
guards agreement with the International
Atomic Energy Agency (IAEA). Presidents
Collor and Menem have shown great
energy and leadership in fulfilling the com-
mitments they undertook in the November

1990 declaration in Foz do Iguacu to
devote their nuclear programs exclusively
to peaceful purposes and to submit all their
nuclear activities to IAEA safeguards.

This action will contribute greatly to
peace and stability in the Western Hemi-
sphere and throughout the world. We wish
Presidents Menem and Collor continued
success as they work toward the inal objec-
tive of the Iguacu declaration: The full
entry into force of the Treaty of Tlatelolco
in their national territories. We call on all
nations that need to take steps for the
Treaty to enter into force throughout Latin
America to do so at an early date, freeing
the continent from the dangers of a nuclear
arms race.
Note: The statement referred to President
Carlos SaW Menem of Argentina and Presi-
dent Fernando Collor de Mello of Brazil.

Proclamation 6392-Bicentennial of
the District of Columbia Month, 1991
December 13, 1991

By the President of the United States
of America
A Proclamation

Although it encompasses just 10 square
miles, the District of Columbia contains a
vast wealth of history and culture-a legacy
that befits our Nation's Capital. This year,
we celebrate the 200th anniversary of our
remarkable Federal city.

Conceived by the Framers of our Consti-
tution, who provided for the establishment
of a special district to serve "as the Seat of
the Government of the United States," our
Nation's Capital began to take shape in
1791. In January of that year, a site was
selected for the city under the direction of
President George Washington. The follow-
ing month Andrew Ellicot and Benjamin
Banneker, a successful black farmer who
was self-taught in engineering, mathemat-
ics, and other fields, began to survey the
terrain.

Plans for the actual layout of the city re-
flected the exuberance, pride, and opti-
mism of our young Republic. When he sub-
mitted his design to the Congress in De-
cember 1791, Major Pierre L'Enfant includ-
ed numerous provisions for parks, fountains,
and wide, sweeping avenues-all reflecting
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a vision as grand and as ambitious as the
American experiment itself.

Over the years, a number of our Nation's
leaders took great personal interest in the
development of the Federal city. Thomas
Jefferson offered advice and sketches for its
design, and it was has idea to build a large
mall extending from the foot of the hill on
which our magnificent United States Cap-
itol now stands. Today the Mall in Washing-
ton is surrounded by monuments and muse-
ums that honor the brilliant thinkers and
brave heroes who have defined and defend-
ed the American ideals of liberty and self-
government. Many of the museums in our
Nation's Capital also contain vast collections
of American art and folklore, as well as fas-
cinating displays of U.S. achievements in
science, industry, and aviation.

As the seat of government of the United
States for 200 years, our Nation's Capital
has become a center of American culture
and a world-renowned symbol of freedom
and democracy. Here is where President
John Adams and his successors continued
the work that President George Washington
and the First Congress had begun in New
York. Here is where President Abraham
Lincoln labored to preserve our Union; and
here is where the Reverend Dr. Martin
Luther King, Jr., led the historic march that
energized the civil rights movement and
reminded America of its promise of liberty
and justice for all. Much of our Nation's
history has marched through Washington,
D.C., and today that journey continues as
we engage in the day-to-day process of
democratic government.

While our Nation's Capital belongs to all
Americans, this occasion is a very special
one for the residents of the District of Co-
lumbia. Many families have lived in the city
for generations, and this bicentennial is also
a celebration of their roots.

At the end of the Civil War, thousands of
African Americans came to Washington,
making the city a virtual symbol of emanci-
pation and progress. Their accomplish-
ments, reflected in the growth of institu-
tions such as Howard University, helped
pave the way for countless others. Today
residents of the District of Columbia contin-
ue to make outstanding contributions in
education, business, science, and the arts.
On this occasion, all Americans join them in

celebrating 200 years of history and
achievement.

The Congress, by House Joint Resolution
356, has designated December 1991 as "Bi-
centennial of the District of Columbia
Month" and has authorized and requested
the President to issue a proclamation in ob-
servance of this month.

Now, Therefore, I, George Bush, Presi-
dent of the United States of America, do
hereby proclaim December 1991 as Bicen-
tennial of the District of Columbia Month. I
invite all Americans to observe this month
with appropriate ceremonies and activities.

In Witness Whereof, I have hereunto set
my hand this thirteenth day of December,
in the year of our Lord nineteen hundred
and ninety-one, and of the Independence of
the United States of America the two hun-
dred and sixteenth.

George Bush

[Filed with the Office of the Federal Regis-
ter, 11:31 a.m., December 16, 1991]

Note: This proclamation was published in
the Federal Register on December 17.

Proclamation 6393-Year of Clean
Water, 1992, and Clean Water Month,
1992
December 13, 1991

By the President of the United States
of America

A Proclamation
Water is essential to every form of life on

Earth. Indeed, this vital substance unites
our planet's ecosystems, the miraculous yet
fragile relationships in nature that sustain
each other as well as all human activity.
Recognizing the importance of our precious
water resources, the United States has made
a firm commitment to protecting their
physical, chemical, and biological integrity.
This year, the 20th anniversary of the Clean
Water Act reminds us that we are all stew-
ards of our water resources, and, as such,
we are responsible for their preservation
and wise use.

Since the enactment of the Clean Water
Act in 1972, we have achieved remarkable
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improvements in many of our Nation's
water resources. Twenty years ago, less
than half of America's rivers supported fish
and shellfish or provided wildlife habitat.
Fishing and swimming were restricted in
many areas, and drinking water supplies
were threatened. Today, however, nearly
three-fourths of the Nation's waters support
these uses, and many others have signifi-
cantly improved in quality. Fish and water-
fowl have returned to many of our rivers,
lakes, and coastal waters.

We have taken great strides during the
past two decades, primarily by controlling
pollution from sewage treatment plants and
industrial facilities. Recent advances in sci-
ence and technology have enabled us to
engage in more effective studies of water
pollution-its causes and its effects. These
studies, which have often revealed the mag-
nitude of previously underestimated prob-
lems, have led to more vigorous and inno-
vative antipollution measures. At the same
time, public awareness of the importance of
clean water has also increased; now there is
more support than ever for protecting and
enhancing water quality.

While we can take pride in this progress,
many challenges remain. Urban and indus-
trial growth are creating additional sources
of pollution while placing increased de-
mands on limited water resources. Contami-
nated runoff from farmlands as well as city
streets is, all too often, degrading our
waters and damaging ecosystems. Scientists
continue to detect unacceptable levels of
pollutants in many bodies of water and in
the tissues of finfish and shellfish. All Amer-
icans must continue to work together to
protect our water resources and the wildlife
that depends on them.

We have already discerned the need for
new and innovative solutions. Indeed, today
we know that the health of aquatic ecosys-
tems must be examined holistically, to de-
termine how various forms of human activi-
ty affect water quality. We know that we
must protect entire watersheds that feed
into our rivers, lakes, and coastal waters.
We also recognize that, by preventing pol-
lution at the source, we can protect water-
sheds and avoid the high economic and en-
vironmental costs of treating wastes and re-
storing ecosystems after pollution has al-
ready occurred. Moreover, experience has

shown us that our actions must be based on
sound science.

The 20th anniversary of the Clean Water
Act marks an important milestone in the
history of American environmental protec-
tion. However, just as water links each of
our planet's ecosystems, water pollution
recognizes no boundaries. All Americans
and their representatives in all levels of
government must work together to pro-
mote wise stewardship of this, our "water
planet." We must also foster greater coop-
eration in the international community.

As an expression of our national commit-
ment to these goals, the Congress, by Public
Law 101-424, has designated 1992 as the
"Year of Clean Water" and October 1992 as
"Clean Water Month."

Now, Therefore, I, George Bush, Presi-
dent of the United States of America, do
hereby proclaim 1992 as the Year of Clean
Water and October 1992 as .Clean Water
Month. I call upon all Americans to observe
this year and month with appropriate pro-
grams, ceremonies, and activities. I also ask
my fellow Americans to join in setting ex-
amples of environmental stewardship in our
daily lives.

In Witness Whereof, I have hereunto set
my hand this thirteenth day of December,
in the year of our Lord nineteen hundred
and ninety-one, and of the Independence of
the United States of America the two hun-
dred and sixteenth.

George Bush

[Filed with the Office of the Federal Regis-
ter, 11:34 a.m., December 16, 1991]

Note: This proclamation was published in
the Federal Register on December 17.

Statement by Press Secretary Fitzwater
on the President's Telephone
Conversation With President
Gorbachev
December 13, 1991

President Bush spoke by telephone this
afternoon with President Gorbachev con-
cerning events in the Soviet Union and the
Republics. The nearly 30-minute conversa-

1827

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. 1827 1991



Dec. 13 / Administration of George Bush, 1991

tion ranged over several issues including
the economy, the status of the Common-
wealth effort, the safety of nuclear weap-
ons, and other issues. President Gorbachev
assured President Bush that the command
and control system for nuclear weapons re-
mains secure. President Bush had received
similar assurances from President Yeltsin in
a telephone call at 10:50 a.m. this morning.

President Bush assured both Presidents of
support for humanitarian and medical
needs. He summarized the United States
program of support, including the loan
guarantees, direct aid, and financial assist-
ance in the elimination of nuclear weapons.
President Bush emphasized once again our
general support for democratic and eco-
nomic reforms.

Letter to Congressional Leaders on
Naming Don E. Newquist as Chairman-
Designate of the U.S. International
Trade Commission
December 13, 1991

Dear Mr. Speaker: (Dear Mr. President:)
Pursuant to the provisions of 19 U.S.C.

1330(cXl), this is to notify the Congress that
I have designated Don E. Newquist as
Chairman of the United States International
Trade Commission, effective December 13,
1991.

Sincerely,

George Bush

Note: Identical letters were sent to Thomas
S. Foley, Speaker of the House of Represent-
atives, and Dan Quayle, President of the
Senate.

Points of Light Recognition Program

The President named the following individ-
uals and institutions as exemplars of his
commitment to making community service
central to the life and work of every Ameri-
can.

December 9
Jewish Family Service of Colorado, of Denver,

CO

December 10

Reinette Greaves, of Attleboro Falls, MA

December 11

William Foster, of Brush Prairie, WA

December 12

Nguyet Lam, of Atlanta, GA

December 13

Community Kitchen, of Chattanooga, TN

Digest of Other
White House Announcements

The following list includes the President's
public schedule and other items of general
interest announced by the Office of the
Press Secretary and not included elsewhere
in this issue.

December 7
In the morning, the President met with

Pearl Harbor survivors of U.S.S. Arizona
and U.S.S. Utah.

Later in the morning, the President had
an interview with CBS and a briefing with
U.S. Ambassadors to Pacific Rim countries.

The President declared a major disaster
exists in the Republic of the Marshall Is-
lands and ordered Federal aid to supple-
ment State and local recovery efforts in the
area struck by Typhoon Zelda on Novem-
ber 28 and 29, 1991.

December 8
In the afternoon, the President and Mrs.

Bush returned to the White House. Later in
the afternoon, the President had a tele-
phone conversation with President Boris
Yeltsin of the Russian Republic.

In the evening, the President and Mrs.
Bush attended the John F. Kennedy Center
Honors performing arts achievement
awards ceremony.
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December 9
The President met at the White House

with:
-the Vice President; John H. Sununu,

Chief of Staff to the President; Brent
Scowcroft, Assistant to the President for
National Security Affairs; and members
of the CIA briefing staff;

-Mother Teresa.
The President announced his intention to

designate Ralph W. Tarr, of California, to
be U.S. Commissioner on the Upper Colora-
do River Commission. He would succeed
J.F. Ross. Currently Mr. Tarr serves as part-
ner with the law firm of Andrews & Kurth
in Los Angeles, CA.

The President announced his intention to
appoint the following individuals to be
members of the Advisory Committee on the
Arts, John F. Kennedy Center for the Per-
forming Arts:

Candace Somerville, of the District of Columbia.
She would succeed Ann Rydalch. Currently Ms.
Somerville serves as assistant vice president of
Begg International in Washington, DC.

Helen V. Meyer, of Kansas. She would succeed
Harriet Slaybaugh. Currently Ms. Meyer serves
as a director of the Wichita Symphony Associa-
tion and of the Wichita Music Theatre in Wich-
ita, KS.

Mary Welch Rogers, of Georgia. She would suc-
ceed Julie P. Montgomery. Ms. Rogers is a
Catholic contemporary Christian artist in At-
lanta, GA.

Henry .. Smith, of Texas. He would succeed
Eileen S. S. G. Slocum. Currently Mr. Smith
serves as chairman of Clark Bardes, Inc., in
Dallas, TX.

Marcia Poulsen Price, of Utah. She would suc-
ceed John Piercey. Currently Ms. Price serves
as a board member on the Utah Arts Council
and on the Governor's Executive Residence
Commission in Salt Lake City, UT.

H. E. Monroe, Jr., of Alabama. This is an initial
appointment. From 1970 to 1986, Mr. Monroe
served as president and chief executive officer
of the Monroe Business Equipment Co. in
Huntsville, AL.

December 10
In the morning, the President traveled to

Chicago, IL.
In the afternoon, the President returned

to the White House.

Administration of George Bush, 1991

In the evening, the President and Mrs.
Bush hosted the Congressional Christmas
ball on the State Floor at the White House.

The President announced his intention to
appoint Edwin D. Brubeck, of Indiana, to
be Chairman of the Federal Service Im-
passes Disputes Panel. Since 1976, Mr. Bru-
beck has served as a business representative
on the Indiana State Building Trades Coun-
cil in Indianapolis, IN.

The President announced his intention to
appoint David F. Egan, of Connecticut, to
be a U.S. Commissioner on the Council and
Commissions of the North Atlantic Salmon
Conservation Organization. He would suc-
ceed Frank Eberle Carlton. Since 1982, Mr.
Egan has served as a public defender for
the Judicial District of Ansonia/Milford in
Milford, CT.

The President announced his intention to
appoint Avery C. Faulkner, of Virginia, to
be a member of the Advisory Council on
Historic Preservation for a term expiring
June 10, 1995. This is a reappointment.
Currently Mr. Faulkner serves as a senior
partner with Avery Faulkner, FAIA in
Washington, DC.

The President declared a major disaster
exists in the Federated States of Micronesia
and ordered Federal aid to supplement
State and local recovery efforts in the area
struck by Typhoon Yuri on November 25
through November 29, 1991.

December 11
The President met at the White House

with:
-the Vice President; John H. Sununu,

Chief of Staff to the President; Brent
Scowcroft, Assistant to the President for
National Security Affairs; and members
of the CIA briefing staff;

-John H. Sununu;
-Secretary of State James A. Baker III;
-James A. Baker III, Robert S. Strauss,

Ambassador to the Soviet Union, and
Brent Scowcroft.

In the evening, the President and Mrs.
Bush hosted a Christmas reception on the
State Floor at the White House.

The President announced his intention to
appoint the following individuals to be
members of the Christopher Columbus
Quincentenary Jubilee Commission:
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William M. Ray, of Oregon. He would succeed
Jane Lee Garcia. Since 1986, Mr. Ray has
served on the Economic Development Com-
mittee of the Klamath Tribe in Portland, OR.

John B. Tsu, of California. He would succeed Lee
Collins. From 1985 to 1986, Dr. Tsu served as a
professor and director of the Asian Pacific Insti-
tute of the John F. Kennedy University in Bur-
lingame, CA.

Mary Jane Checch, of the District of Columbia.
This is a reappointment.

Ricardo S. Pines, of Florida. He would succeed
James J. O'Connor. Currently Mr. Pines serves
as president of the Pines Group, Inc., in Coral
Gables, FL.

December 12
The President met at the White House

with:
-the Vice President; John H. Sununu,

Chief of Staff to the President; Brent
Scowcroft, Assistant to the President for
National Security Affairs; and members
of the CIA briefing staff;

-John H. Sununu;
-Select Senate Republicans;
-Prime Minister Constantinos Mitsotakis

of Greece, for lunch.
In the evening, the President and Mrs.

Bush hosted a Christmas reception on the
State Floor at the White House.

The White House announced that the
President will travel to Dallas/Fort Worth,
TX, on Wednesday, December 18, to sign
the surface transportation bill and address
the American Association of State Highway
and Transportation Officials.

December 13
The President met at the White House

with:
-the Vice President; John H. Sununu,

Chief of Staff to the President; Brent
Scowcroft, Assistant to the President for
National Security Affairs; and members
of the CIA briefing staff;

-John H. Sununu;
-private sector health care groups;
-Secretary of State James A. Baker III;
-Prime Minister Andre Milongo of the

Republic of the Congo;
-the Vice President, for lunch.
In the afternoon, the President and Mrs.

Bush attended the Diplomatic Corps Christ-
mas tea on the State Floor at the White
House.

In the evening, the President and Mrs.
Bush traveled to Camp David, MD, for the
weekend.

The President designated Don E. New-
quist as Chairman of the United States
International Trade Commission for the
term expiring June 16, 1992. Mr. Newquist
has served as a member of the Commission
since October 11, 1988.

The President declared a major disaster
exists in the Territory of American Samoa
and ordered Federal aid to supplement
State and local recovery efforts in the area
struck by Hurricane Val on December 6
through December 10, 1991.

Nominations
Submitted to the Senate

Note: The Congress having adjourned sine
die on Wednesday, November 27, no nomi-
nations were submitted during the period
covered by this issue. The second session of
the 102d Congress will convene on January
3, 1992.

Checklist
of White House Press Releases

The following list contains releases of the
Office of the Press Secretary that are nei-
ther printed as items nor covered by entries
in the Digest of Other White House An-
nouncements.

Released December 7

Advance text:
Remarks during the Pearl Harbor Survivors
ceremony

Advance text:
Remarks during the 50th Commemorative
ceremony of Pearl Harbor
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Released December 7 -Continued

Advance text:
Remarks to World War II Veterans and
families

Released December 9

Fact sheet:
High-Performance Computing and Commu-
nications

Released December 12

Transcript:
Press briefing on the meeting with Prime
Minister Constantinos Mitsotakis of
Greece-by Ambassador Thomas Niles, As-
sistant Secretary of State for European and
Canadian Affairs

Transcript:
Press briefing on the negotiations on the
North American free trade agreement-by
Ambassador Carla Hills, U.S. Trade Repre-
sentative

Released December 13

Transcript:
Press briefing on the Soviet Union and the
Republics-by Secretary of State James A.
Baker III

Acts Approved

by the President

Approved December 9

S. 272 / Public Law 102-194
High-Performance Computing Act of 1991

H.R. 1988 / Public Law 102-195
National Aeronautics and Space Administra-
tion Authorization Act, Fiscal Year 1992

H.R. 3370 / Public Law 102-196
To direct the Secretary of the Interior to
carry out a study and make recommenda-
tions to the Congress regarding the feasibili-
ty of establishing a Native American cultur-
al center in Oklahoma City, Oklahoma

Administration of George Bush, 1991

Approved December 9 -Continued

H.J. Res. 346 / Public Law 102-197
Approving the extension of nondiscrimina-
tory treatment with respect to the products
of the Union of Soviet Socialist Republics

S. 1284 / Public Law 102-198
To make certain technical corrections in
the Judicial Improvements Act of 1990 and
other provisions of law relating to the
courts

Approved December 10

H.R. 525 / Public Law 102-199
To amend the Federal charter for the Boys'
Clubs of America to reflect the change of
the name of the organization to the Boys &
Girls Clubs of America

H.R. 829 / Public Law 102-200
To amend title 28, United States Code, to
make changes in the composition of the
Eastern and Western Districts of Virginia

H.R. 848 / Public Law 102-201
Little Bighorn Battlefield National Monu-
ment

H.R. 990 / Public Law 102-202
To authorize additional appropriations for
land acquisition at Monocacy National Bat-
tlefield, Maryland

H.R. 3322 / Public Law 102-203
To designate the building in St. Louis, Mis-
souri, which is currently known as the Well-
ston Station, as the "Gwen B. Giles Post
Office Building"

H.R. 3531 / Public Law 102-204
Patent and Trademark Office Authorization
Act of 1991

H.R. 3709 / Public Law 102-205
To waive the period of Congressional
review for certain District of Columbia acts

H.J. Res. 191 / Public Law 102-206
Designating January 5, 1992 through Janu-
ary 11, 1992 as "National Law Enforcement
Training Week"
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Approved December 10-Continued

H.J. Res. 212 / Public Law 102-207
To designate the week beginning February
16, 1992, as "National Visiting Nurse Asso-
ciations Week"

H.J. Res. 300 / Public Law 102-208
Designating the month of May 1992 as "Na-
tional Trauma Awareness Month"

H.J. Res. 356 / Public Law 102-209
Designating December 1991 as "Bicenten-
nial of the District of Columbia Month"

H.J. Res. 372 / Public Law 102-210
Designating December 21, 1991, as "Bas-
ketball Centennial Day"

Approved December 11

H.R. 690 / Public Law 102-211
To authorize the National Park Service to
acquire and manage the Mary McLeod Be-
thune Council House National Historic Site,
and for other purposes

H.R. 794 / Public Law 102-212
To establish the Silvio 0. Conte National
Fish and Wildlife Refuge along the Con-
necticut River, and for other purposes

H.R. 948 / Public Law 102-213
To designate the United States courthouse
located at 120 North Henry Street in Madi-
son, Wisconsin, as the "Robert W. Kasten-
meier United States Courthouse"

H.R. 1099 / Public Law 102-214
Lamprey River Study Act of 1991

H.R. 3012 / Public Law 102-215
White Clay Creek Study Act

H.R. 3169 / Public Law 102-216
To lengthen from five to seven years the
expiration period applicable to legislative
authority relating to construction of com-
memorative works on Federal land in the
District of Columbia and its environs

H.R. 3245 / Public Law 102-217
Chattahoochee National Forest Protection
Act of 1991

Approved December 11 -Continued

H.R. 3327 / Public Law 102-218
To amend title 38, United States Code, to
provide for the designation of an Assistant
Secretary of the Department of Veterans
Affairs as the Chief Minority Affairs Officer
of the Department

H.R. 3387 / Public Law 102-219
To amend the Pennsylvania Avenue Devel-
opment Corporation Act of 1972 to author-
ize appropriations for implementation of
the development plan for Pennsylvania
Avenue between the Capitol and the White
House, and for other purposes

H.R. 3604 / Public Law 102-220
Green Spring Acquisition and Protection
Act of 1991

H.R. 3932 / Public Law 102-221
To improve the operational efficiency of
the James Madison Memorial Fellowship
Foundation, and for other purposes

S. 2050 / Public Law 102-222
To ensure that the ceiling established with
respect to health education assistance loans
does not prohibit the provision of Federal
loan insurance to new and previous borrow-
ers under such loan program, and for other
purposes

S. 2098 / Public Law 102-223
To authorize the President to appoint Major
General Jerry Ralph Curry to the Office of
Administrator of the Federal Aviation Ad-
ministration

S.J. Res. 198 / Public Law 102-224
To recognize contributions Federal civilian
employees provided during the attack on
Pearl Harbor and during World War II

H.R. 3881 / Public Law 102-225
To expand the boundaries of Stones River
National Battlefield, Tennessee, and for
other purposes

H.R. 2105 / Public Law 102-226
To designate an area as the "Myrtle Foester
Whitmire Division of the Aransas National
Wildlife Refuge"
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Approved December 11 -Continued

H.R. 3909 / Public Law 102-227
Tax Extension Act of 1991

S. 159 / Private Law 102-1

For the relief of Maria Erica Bartski

Approved December 12

H.R. 3807 / Public Law 102-228
Conventional Forces in Europe Treaty Im-
plementation Act of 1991

H.J. Res. 157 / Public Law 102-229
Dire Emergency Supplemental Appropria-
tions and Transfers for Relief From the Ef-
fects of Natural Disasters, for Other Urgent
Needs, and for Incremental Cost of 'Oper-
ation Desert Shield/Desert Storm' Act of
1992

H.R. 3576 / Public Law 102-230
To amend the Cranston-Gonzalez National
Affordable Housing Act to reserve assist-
ance under the HOME Investment Partner-
ships Act for certain insular areas

H.R. 1476 / Public Law 102-231
San Carlos Indian Irrigation Project Divesti-
ture Act of 1991

Administration of George Bush, 1991

Approved December 12 -Continued

H.R. 3049 / Public Law 102-232
Miscellaneous and Technical Immigration
and Naturalization Amendments of 1991

H.R. 3435 / Public Law 102-233
Resolution Trust Corporation Refinancing,
Restructuring, and Improvement Act of
1991

H.R. 3595 / Public Law 102-234
Medicaid Voluntary Contribution and Pro-
vider-Specific Tax Amendments of 1991

S. 367 / Public Law 102-235
Nontraditional Employment for Women Act

S. 1532 / Public Law 102-236
Abandoned Infants Assistance Act Amend-
ments of 1991

H.R. 635 / Private Law 102-2

For the relief of Abby Cooke

Approved December 13

H.R. 3029 / Public Law 102-237
Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade
Act Amendments of 1991
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Abortion-1610, 1684, 1685
Administrative Conference of the U.S.-1473
Adoption Week, National-1733, 1734
Advisory commissions, committees, and coun-

cils-1409, 1410, 1434, 1709
Agency. See other part of subject
Aging, Federal Council on the-1674
Agriculture, trade negotiations and agreements.

See Commerce, international
Agriculture, Department of

Assistant Secretary-1393
Rural Telephone Bank-1434
Secretary-1374, 1402, 1483, 1607, 1695
Under Secretary-1607

AID. See Development Cooperation Agency, U.S.
International

AIDS. See Health and medical care
Alaska, Arctic National Wildlife Refuge-1560
Alaska Natives, Joint Federal-State Commission

on Policies and Programs Affecting-1473
Albania, U.S. Ambassador-1575
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Alzheimer's Disease Month, National-1631
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American. See other part of subject
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Angola, National Union for the Total Independ-
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Anorexia Bulimia Care, Inc., Lincoln Center,

MA-1408
Arab Americans-1675
Argentina

Law enforcement cooperation with U.S.-1547
President-1661, 1674

Armed Forces, U.S.
International role. See specific country or

region
Reserves-1418

Arms Control and Disarmament Agency, U.S.-
1416

Arms and munitions
See also Nuclear weapons
Arms control negotiations and agreements-
1598, 1603, 1725

Biological and chemical weapons-1527, 1603,
1757

Export controls-1459
Trident submarine-1416

Art, National Gallery of-1437
Arts, National Council on the. See Arts and the

Humanities, National Foundation on the

Arts, National Endowment for the. See Arts and
the Humanities, National Foundation on the

Arts and the Humanities, National Foundation on
the

Arts, National Council on the-1410, 1674
Arts, National Endowment for the-1671
Humanities, National Council on the-1675
Museum Services Board, National-1435, 1547

Asia-Pacific region
Trade with U.S.-1640
U.S. military role-1640

Asia Society-1639
Associated Builders & Contractors, Inc-1514
Associated Press Managing Editors-1455
Australia, President Bush's visit-1592, 1594
Austria, Chancellor-1435
Automobile industry, electric vehicles-1502
Award. See other part of subject

Bahamas, extradition treaty with U.S.-1524
Bahrain

Ambassador to U.S.-1738
Amir-1446

Ballet Folkl6rico de Mexico-1571
Bangladesh, Ambassador to U.S.-1738
Bank of Credit and Commerce International-

1507
Banking-1367, 1555
Barbados, Ambassador to U.S.-1738
Beacon Council-1366
Bell Atlantic-1454
Benin, President-1589, 1590
Board. See other part of subject
Bolivia, trade with U.S.-1757
Bone Marrow Transplant Volunteers of the Uni-

versity of Nebraska Medical Center, Omaha,
NE-1513

Boy Scout Troop 4, Ann Arbor, MI-1781
Breast Cancer Awareness Month, National-1500
Brunei, U.S. Ambassador-1739
Budget, Federal

Defense spending-1596
Deficit-1504, 1507, 1642, 1691
Fiscal year 1991-1380
Fiscal year 1992-1525
Rescissions and deferrals-1365

Bulgaria
American University inauguration ceremony,

U.S. delegation-1571
Trade with U.S.-1643, 1756

Bulgarian-American Enterprise Fund-1612
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Bureau. See other part of subject
Burma (Myanmar), National League for Democ-

racy, leader-1445
Business and industry

See also specific industry
Education, role-1716
Productivity and competitiveness-1581, 1745,

1747
Small and minority business-1523, 1779

Business Press Association, American-1453

Cabinet
See also specific position
Meetings with President-1417, 1433

California
Ontario Kiwanis and Rotary Clubs-1773
President's visits-1613, 1771, 1773

Camp Baskervill, Pawley's Island, SC-1673
Canada, trade with U.S.-1358
Catholic Education Association, National-1613
Central Intelligence Agency

Director Gates-1382, 1402, 1493, 1592, 1628
Foreign intelligence role-1403, 1493

CFE. See Arms and munitions, arms control ne-
gotiations and agreements

Chicago Bulls-1378
Child Health Day-1415
Children's Day, National-1430
Christian Schools, Association of-1739
Christmas Seals-1708
CIA. See Central Intelligence Agency
Circle K International-1739
Civil Justice Reform-1484, 1485, 1559
Civil rights

Discrimination-1700, 1701
Proposed legislation-1503, 1505, 1511, 1694
Sexual harassment-1458, 1497

Civil Rights Act of 1991-1699, 1701
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COCOM. See Coordinating Committee for Multi-
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Colombia, trade with U.S.-1757
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agencies and employees
Commerce, Department of

Export controls, administration-1460, 1461
Secretary-1463, 1479, 1731

Commerce, international
See also specific country or subject; Economy,

international
Exports, U.S.-1747
Free and fair trade-1620, 1623, 1660
Generalized System of Preferences (GSP)--
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Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the U.S.

(HTS)--1358, 1422, 1756, 1769
Military exports. See Arms and munitions,

export controls
Tariff Schedules of the U.S. (TSUS)---1360

Commerce, international-Continued
Trade negotiations and agreements-1358,

1368, 1422, 1423, 1463, 1479, 1523, 1620,
1622, 1647, 1668, 1756, 1757

Commerce, Justice, and State, the Judiciary, and
Related Agencies Appropriations Act, 1992,
Departments of-1529
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Committee. See other part of subject
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Competitiveness Council-1484, 1592, 1777
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Coordinating Committee for Multilateral Security

Export Controls-1460
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Crime. See Law enforcement and crime
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Conference on
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Cyprus

Conflict resolution-1703
President-1704
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U.S. Special Coordinator-1703

Czechoslovakia
Emigration policy-1455
Joint declaration on cooperation-1481
President-1479, 1514
Trade with U.S.-1480, 1757, 1780

Defense, Department of
Assistant Secretary-1587
Budget-1596
Deputy Secretary-1739
Deputy Under Secretary-1381
Director of Defense Research and Engineer-
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Joint Chiefs of Staff-1506
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Ecuador, trade with U.S.-1757
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Parental involvement-1395
Quality-1366, 1371, 1375, 1387, 1394, 1398,

1560, 1569, 1646, 1670, 1680, 1714, 1723,
1742, 1776
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Fiscal years 1989 and 1990, reports-1434
Secretary-1366, 1398
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President's Advisory Commission on-1665

Educational Research and Improvement, Nation-
al Advisory Council on-1410, 1434

El Salvador, U.S. Ambassador-1380
Eldercare Access Center Mobile Meals, Oklaho-

ma City, OK-1513
Election Commission, Federal-1709
Elections
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Gubernatorial. See specific State
Presidential campaign-1382, 1402, 1577,
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Environmental Protection Agency-1530, 1552
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Trade with U.S.-1461, 1593, 1620
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Food assistance
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Freedom, Presidential Medal of-1677
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Combined Federal Campaign-1708
Cost control-1777
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Cyprus conflict resolution, role. See Cyprus
Minister of Foreign Affairs-1704
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Greek Orthodox Patriarch-1433
GSP. See Commerce, international
Guam

Typhoon-1782
World War II anniversary ceremony, Presi-

dent's representative-1782
Guatemala, President-1380

Haiti
Ambassador to U.S.-1408
Economic sanctions-1532, 1533, 1690
Military coup-1382, 1396, 1399
President-1396, 1399, 1406, 1532, 1690
Refugees-1689
U.S. national emergency, declaration-1406

Hanukkah-1744, 1782
Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the U.S. See Com-

merce, international
Harry S Truman Scholarship Foundation-1433
Hawthorne Elementary School, Salt Lake City,

UT-1589
Health and Human Services, Department of

Assistant Secretary-1645
Deputy Secretary-1491
Secretary-1575, 1610, 1684

Health and medical care
Acquired immune deficiency syndrome

(AIDS--1606, 1649, 1655, 1657, 1687, 1693,
1720

Cancer-1500
Health care reform-1608, 1654, 1777
Mental health-1575

Hispanic Americans-1665, 1766
Home Care Week, National-1743
Homeownership and Opportunity for People Ev-

erywhere (HOPE)-1530
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Hospice Month, National-1591
Hostages-1483, 1679, 1685, 1742, 1750, 1759,

1761, 1778
Housing, public housing-1530
Housing Month, National Accessible-1728
Housing and Urban Development, Department

of, funding-1530
Humanities, National Council on the. See Arts

and the Humanities, National Foundation on
the

Hungary
Ambassador to U.S.-1738
Prime Minister-1406
Trade with U.S.-1757, 1780

Iceland, President-1421
Indian and Alaska Native Culture and Arts De-

velopment, Institute of American-1434, 1473,
1514

Indian Heritage Month, National American-
1546

Indians, American, tribal government relation-
ship with Federal Government-1758

Inflation. See Economy, national
Information Agency, U.S.-1452, 1528
Institute. See other part of subject
Intelligence Authorization Act, Fiscal Year

1992-1758
Interest rates. See Economy, national
Interior, Department of the, Chief Financial Offi-

cer-1708
International. See other part of subject
Investigation, Federal Bureau of. See Justice, De-

partment of
Iran

Economic sanctions-1461
President-1404
U.S. national emergency, continuation-1632

Iraq
See also Persian Gulf conflict
Arms shipments-1461
Economic sanctions-1446
President-1404, 1446, 1597, 1721

Israel
Economic assistance-1401
Prime Minister-1709
Trade with U.S.-1360, 1361
Violence in occupied territories-1531, 1542

Italian-American Foundation, National-1413
Italy,

Ambassador to U.S.-1408, 1413
President-1613
President Bush's visit-1597-1599, 1604, 1613
Prime Minister-1613

Jamaica, law enforcement cooperation with
U.S.-1517

James Madison Memorial Fellowship Founda-
tion-1433

Japan
President Bush's visit-1592, 1594, 1610
Trade with U.S.-1641, 1650

Jewish Americans-1674
Justice, Department of

Attorney General-1473, 1696, 1731
Civil justice reform, role-1487-1490
Federal Bureau of Investigation-1439, 1497,

1510
Federal Prison Industries-1472
Foreign Claims Settlement Commission of the

United States-1675
U.S. Marshals Service-1699
U.S. Parole Commission-1739
VANPAC Task Force-1473
Victims of Crime, Office of-1675

KCNC Television-1692
Kentucky

President's visit-1383, 1385, 1409
Republican Party event-1385

Key Club International-1739
KHOU Television-1576
King's Messenger Puppeteers, San Bernardino,

CA-1472
KMOV Television-1652
KNBC Television-1690
Korea, Republic of

Driftnet fishing agreement with U.S.-1463
President Bush's visit-1592, 1594
Trade with U.S.-1641

KPLR Television-1654
KPRC Television-1562
KSDK Television-1650
KTRK Television-1578
KTVI Television-1648
Kuwait

See also Persian Gulf conflict
Amir-1372
Oil well fires-1597

Labor Relations Authority, Federal-1675
Latvia, trade with U.S.-1757
Law enforcement and crime

See also Drug abuse and trafficking; Justice,
Department of

Drunk driving-1642
International cooperation-1500, 1517, 1547,

1644
Pornography-1429
Proposed crime legislation-1384, 1387, 1449,

1576, 1580, 1725, 1732
Law Enforcement Memorial Dedication Day, Na-

tional-1448, 1450
Lebanon, hostages-1483, 1679, 1685, 1742,
1750, 1759, 1761, 1778

Lecture Series, Presidential-1433
Legal Services Corporation-1529
Lesotho, Ambassador to U.S.-1408
Libraries and Information Science, National

Commission on-1434, 1473
Libya, terrorism, role-1682, 1688, 1706, 1735
Life Issues for the Elderly (LIFE), Charlottesville,

VA-1472
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Lithuania, trade with U.S.-1757
Louisiana

Gubernatorial election-1509, 1595, 1653,
1656, 1679

President's visit-1369
Republican Party event-1369

Luxembourg, Ambassador to U.S.-1738

Mag Instrument-1771
Maine, President's visit-1612
Malcolm Baldrige National Quality Awards-1581
Malta, Ambassador to U.S.-1408
Management and Budget, Office of-1488, 1489,

1552, 1592, 1699
Manufacturers Executive Committee, National

Association of-1782
Maritime affairs

Driftnet fishing, international agreements-
1462

Tuna imports to U.S.-1360, 1479
Marlow Industries-1581
Marshall Islands, trade with U.S.-1359
Maryland, President's visit-1438
Massachusetts, coastal storm-1613
Match-Two Prisoner Outreach Program of the

Richmond J. Donovan Correction Facility, San
Diego, CA-1433

Medal, William J. Donovan-1494
Mental Illness Awareness Week-1420
Mexico

President-1368, 1571
Trade with U.S.-1479

Micronesia, trade with U.S.-1359
Middle East

See also specific country; Hostages; Palestin-
ians; Persian Gulf conflict

Peace efforts, U.S. and international-1401,
1464, 1491, 1503, 1504, 1531, 1534, 1537,
1542-1544, 1572

Military Appeals, U.S. Court of-1408
Military Families Recognition Day, National-
1705

Minnesota Twins-1555
Mississippi

Governor-elect-1738
President's visit-1747

Missouri
President's visit-1645, 1648, 1650, 1652, 1654,

1656
Republican Party event-1656

Mongolia, Ambassador to U.S.-1738
Mose and Garrison Siskin Memorial Foundation

Pre-School, Chattanooga, TN-1612
Museum Services Board, National. See Arts and

the Humanities, National Foundation on the
Myanmar. See Burma

National. See other part of subject
Native Americans. See Indians, American
NATO. See North Atlantic Treaty Organization
Negro Educational Emergency Drive (NEED),

Pittsburgh, PA-1781

Neon Enterprises-1454
Nepal, Ambassador to U.S.-1738
Netherlands

President Bush's visit-1613, 1617, 1620, 1624
Prime Minister-1617, 1620
Queen-1613

New American Schools Development Corpora-
tion-1398, 1410

New Hampshire, coastal storm-1674
New York

President's visit-1634, 1639, 1674
Republican Party event-1634

Nobel Peace Prize-1445
North Atlantic Treaty Organization-1435, 1593,

1597-1599, 1604, 1607, 1609, 1613, 1618
North Dakota 41st Air Force Junior Reserve Offi-

cer Training Corps Squadron, Fargo, ND-
1433

Northern Mariana Islands, U.S. Special Repre-
sentative-1433

Norway, Queen-1421
Nuclear weapons

Arms control negotiations and agreements-
1416, 1452, 1598, 1603, 1604, 1726

Nonproliferation-1777
Production and disposal controls, verification

measures-1416
Reduction proposals-1364, 1405, 1441, 1535
Strategic defense programs-1452

Nutrition Monitoring Advisory Council, Nation-
al-1709

Office. See other part of subject
Ohio, President's visit-1714, 1717, 1720, 1723,
1738

Olympic Dinner-1409
Operation SHARE, Phoenix, AZ--1738
OPIC. See Development Cooperation Agency,

U.S. International
Organization. See other part of subject
Overseas Private Investment Corporation

Agency, U.S. International. See Development
Cooperation Agency, U.S. International

Pacific region. See Asia-Pacific region
Palestinians-1544
Panama

Government assets held by U.S.-1392
Law enforcement cooperation with U.S.-1500

Panama Canal Commission-1433
Panama Canal Consultative Committee-1739
Peace Corps-1409
Pearl Harbor-1650, 1741, 1750, 1770
Peavey Electronics-1747
Pennsylvania

President's visit-1409
Republican Party event-1409
Senatorial election-1590, 1595, 1608, 1649

Persian Gulf conflict
See also specific country
Kuwaiti oil fields and installations-1597
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Persian Gulf conflict-Continued
News media coverage-1457
Post-conflict assessment-1372

Peru, trade with U.S.-1757
Philanthropy Day, National-1672
Points of Light Recognition Program-1357,

1361, 1364, 1365, 1408, 1432, 1453, 1472,
1513, 1571, 1612, 1673, 1707, 1738, 1781

Poison Prevention Week, National-] 627
Poland, trade with U.S.-1781
Polish-American Heritage Month-1424
Pollution. See Environment
Pornography. See Law enforcement and crime
Postal Rate Commission-1409
Postal Service, U.S.-1474
Presidency, national security responsibilities-
1405

Presidential. See other part of subject
President's. See other part of subject
Professor of the Year-1474
Project C.A.R.E. (Caring Always Reaps Enjoy-

ment), Wanamassa, NJ-1472
Public service. See Government agencies and em-

ployees

Radon Action Week, National-1407
Real Estate Industry Association- 1781
Reconstruction and Development, International

Bank for-1409, 1480
Recycling and Procurement Policy, Council on

Federal-1551
Red Lobster Restaurants-1454
Red Ribbon Month, National-1642
Refugee Day-1522
Refugees, Haiti-1689
Regulatory reform. See Government agencies and

employees
Religious Alliance Against Pornography-1429
Republican Congressional Committee, National-
1708

Republican National Committee-1708, 1709
Republican Party

Congressional leadership-1548
President's Club Dinner-1514
State party organizations, fundraisers, etc. See

specific State
Republican Senatorial Committee, National-
1409, 1434

Reserve System, Federal-1367
Ronald Reagan Presidential Library-1586, 1613
Rural America, President's Council on-1473
Ruth House Ministries, Tampa, FL-1612
Ryder and Walker Cup Teams-1409

Saint Joseph's Chapin Street Health Center,
South Bend, IN-1433

Salary Council, Federal-1708
Scholars, Commission on Presidential-1473
Science Foundation, National-1530
Science and technology

Research and development-1530
Space program. See Space program

Science and Technology, President's Council of
Advisors on-1675

Sciences, National Academy of-1398
SDI. See Nuclear weapons, strategic defense pro-

grams
Securities and Exchange Commission-1514
Securities Investor Protection Corp.-1410
Security, national. See Defense and national secu-

rity
Security and Cooperation in Europe, Conference

on-1601, 1602
Security Council, National

Assistant to President for National Security Af-
fairs-1731

Deputy Assistant to President for National Se-
curity Affairs-1685

Special Assistant to President for National Se-
curity Affairs-1543

Security Telecommunications Advisory Commit-
tee, President's National-1434

Senegal, economic assistance-1644
Senior Volunteers of the Elvin Hill Elementary

School, Columbiana, AL-1408
Sentencing Commission, U.S.-1514
Singapore, President Bush's visit-1592, 1594
Small business. See Business and industry
South Africa

African National Congress-1760
Economic sanctions-1460

South King County Multi-Service Center Literacy
Program, Federal Way, WA-1738

Southern Newspaper Publishers Association-
1679

Southside Preparatory Association, Inc., Syracuse,
NY-1673

Soviet Union. See Union of Soviet Socialist Repub-
lics

Space program, funding-1530
Spain

Deputy Prime Minister-1572
President Bush's visit-1534, 1540, 1543, 1572
Prime Minister-1540, 1572

Sports
Baseball, World Series champions-1555
Basketball, NBA champions-1378
Golf, Ryder and Walker Cup Teams-1409

START. See Nuclear weapons, arms control nego-
tiations and agreements

State, Department of
Assistant Secretary-1528
Employment of Soviet nationals, Moscow Em-

bassy-1501
Secretary-1402, 1406, 1407, 1434, 1435, 1441,

1461, 1463, 1464, 1503, 1514, 1527-1529,
1533, 1537, 1540, 1541, 1545, 1608, 1613,
1641, 1668, 1704, 1708, 1709, 1731, 1739,
1781, 1782

State Governments, Council of-1708
State Legislatures, National Conference of-1708
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State and local governments
Education, role-1372, 1724
Environment, role-1551

States, Organization of American-1382, 1399
Strategic Services, Office of-1492
Student Loan Marketing Association- 1674
Student Volunteers of DePauw University,

Greencastle, IN-1513
Sunlight Club, Inc., Washington, PA-1571
Supreme Court of the U.S.-1428, 1431, 1438,

1441, 1443, 1444, 1452, 1458, 1464, 1684
Syria, economic sanctions-1461

Taiwan, driftnet fishing agreement with U.S.-
1463

Tariff Schedules of the U.S. See Commerce, inter-
national

Taxation
Capital gains-1367, 1456, 1504, 1560, 1566,

1576, 1579, 1609, 1636, 1641, 1647, 1718,
1746, 1755, 1779

Tax cut proposals-1508, 1606
Team 100 Dinner-1473
Tennessee, President's visit-1396
Terrorism

See also specific country or region
Pan American plane crash in Scotland-1682,
1688, 1706, 1735

Texas
Governor-1580
President's visit-1557, 1562, 1565, 1572, 1576,
1578, 1581, 1584

Republican Party events-1557, 1565, 1573
Thanks-Giving Square-1584

Thailand
Prime Minister-1782
Queen-1571

Thanksgiving Day-1713, 1736
Thanksgiving Foundation, National-1573
Tourism Policy Council, 1990 report-1473
Toys for Tots-1782
Trade. See Commerce, international
Trade Commission, U.S. International-1514
Trade Policy and Negotiations, Advisory Commit-

tee for-1434
Trade Representative, Office of the U.S.-1575,

1696
Transportation

Highways-1548
Proposed legislation-1652

Transportation, Department of
Deputy Secretary-1699
Federal Aviation Administration-1705
Highway Traffic Safety Administration, Nation-

al-1548
Secretary-1781

Transportation and Related Agencies Appropria-
tions Act, 1992, Department of-1526

Travel and tourism-1520
Treasury, Department of the

Assistant Secretary-1393
Foreign Assets Control, Office of-1392

Treasury, Department of the-Continued
Secretary-1402, 1406, 1483, 1514, 1532, 1696,

1708, 1782
Under Secretary-1536

Treasury, Postal Service and General Govern-
ment Appropriations Act, 1992-1525

Tribal Self-Governance Demonstration Project
Act-1758

Tropicana Products, Inc.-1744
Turkey

Cyprus conflict resolution, role. See Cyprus
Minister of Foreign Affairs-1704
President-1703
Prime Minister-1703

Twelve Together Program, Detroit, MI-1571

Ukrainian American leaders-1739
Unemployment. See Employment and unemploy-

ment
Union of Soviet Socialist Republics

Arms control negotiations and agreements-
1726

Economic assistance-1374, 1536, 1539, 1590
Food assistance-1483, 1607, 1695
Minister of Foreign Affairs Pankin-1464
Minister of Foreign Affairs of the Republic of

Russia-1731
Patriarch of Moscow-1675
President-1368, 1370, 1413, 1534, 1543, 1572,
1603, 1607, 1684, 1778

President of the Republic of Armenia-1665
President of the Republic of Kazakhstan-1778
President of the Republic of Kyrgystan-1514
President of the Republic of Russia-1370,

1539, 1778
President of the Republic of Ukraine-1777,
1778, 1782

Reforms, political and economic-1598, 1620,
1768

Safeguarding nuclear weapons-1777
Senior Adviser to President-1683, 1684
Trade with U.S.-1422, 1423, 1757
U.S. Embassy-1501

United Kingdom, Prime Minister-1597, 1613,
1622

United Nations
Cyprus conflict resolution, role. See Cyprus
Economic and Social Council, U.S. Representa-

tive-1514
General Assembly, U.S. Representatives-1515
Middle East peace efforts, role. See Middle East
Secretary-General Ghali-1760
Secretary-General Perez de Cuellar-1 7 03,
1742, 1750, 1759

Weapons nonproliferation, role-1 6 0 3

United Nations Day-1477
U.S. See other part of subject
University Migrant Services, Fresno, CA-1707
Urban Education Project of the Denver Audubon

Society, Denver, CO-1612
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Uruguay, law enforcement cooperation with
U.S.-1644

Uruguay round tariff negotiations. See Com-
merce, international, trade negotiations and
agreements

Vatican City
Pope-1604, 1613
President Bush's visit-1604, 1613

Veteran Week, Hire a-1633
Veterans Affairs, Department of, funding-1530
Veterans Affairs and Housing and Urban Devel-

opment, and Independent Agencies Appropria-
tions Act, 1992, Departments of-1529

Veterans' Compensation Rate Amendments of
1991-1632

Veterans Day-1388, 1617, 1626
Veterans of Foreign Wars-1410
Vetoes, Presidential-1432, 1684, 1685
Victory Awards-1708
Vietnam Veterans of America-1514
Virginia, President's visit-1626, 1628
Voice of America. See Information Agency, U.S.
Voluntarism-1357, 1379, 1672
Volunteer Action Award, amendment, Presi-

dent's-1702
Volunteers of Johnson Elementary School, Cedar

Rapids, IA-1707
Volunteers of O.W. Motivational, Inc., Cincinnati,

OH-1707

Washington, fires-1674
WBNS Television-1717
WCMH Television-1720
Weapons. See Arms and munitions
Wegmans Food Markets-1453
Western Samoa, Prime Minister-1421
White Cane Safety Day-1374
White House Fellowships, President's Commis-

sion on-1433
White House Office

Assistant to President for National Security Af-
fairs-1731

White House Office-Continued
Assistant to President and Press Secretary-

1380, 1406, 1417, 1421, 1445, 1452, 1483,
1491, 1524, 1531, 1590, 1592, 1597, 1612,
1665, 1679, 1684, 1685, 1695, 1725, 1731,
1736, 1742, 1750, 1759, 1760

Chief of Staff Skinner-1760, 1781
Chief of Staff Sununu-1408, 1409, 1433-1435,

1472, 1473, 1514, 1571, 1613, 1674, 1688,
1708, 1709, 1719, 1739, 1751, 1762, 1766,
1781, 1782

Deputy Assistant to President for National Se-
curity Affairs-1685

Special Assistant to President for Advance-
1413

Special Assistant to President for Intergovern-
mental Affairs-1673

Special Assistant to President for National Se-
curity Affairs-1543

Special Emissary for POW/MIA Affairs-1473
Williamsport Students Engaged in Real Volun-

teer Efforts (WillSERVE), Williamsport, PA-
1738

Wingate College, Wingate, NC-1673
WMAQ Television-1693
WNBC Television-1687
Women Veterans Recognition Week, National-
1630

World Bank. See Reconstruction and Develop-
ment, International Bank for

World Food Day-1445
World Population Awareness Week-1512
WRC Television-1686
WSYX Television-1723
WTVJ Television-1689

Young Men's Christian Association-1408
Youth Development, Inc., Albuquerque, NM-

1433
Yugoslavia

Civil conflict-1406, 1619
Economic sanctions-1608, 1621, 1769
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Adair, Doug-1720
Agee, Philip-1494
Ahsan, Abul-1738
Akayev, Askar-1514
Alexander, Lamar-1366, 1398, 1404, 1665
Alexander, Leslee B.-1411
Allen, Robert E.-1409
Allen, Susan-1473
Ames, Piestwa Robert Harold-1473, 1474
Anan Panyarachun-1782
Anderson, Terry-1751, 1759, 1779
Andreotti, Giulio-1613
Ano, Elizabeth-1707
Antall, Jozsef-1406
Aristide, Jean-Bertrand-1380, 1396, 1399, 1406,

1532, 1690
Armor, David J.-1434
Arnold, Morris S-1614
Ashcroft, John-1573
Athens, Andrew-1433
Atwood, Donald J., Jr.-1739
Augustine, Norman R.-1409
Aung San Suu Kyi-1445
Ayre, J. Randolph-1473

Baker, James A., 111-1382, 1402, 1406, 1434,
1435, 1441, 1463, 1464, 1503, 1514, 1537,
1540, 1541, 1545, 1608, 1613, 1641, 1668,
1704, 1708, 1709, 1731, 1739, 1781, 1782

Badrige, Malcolm-1581
Bande, Andres-1665
Barr, William P.-1473, 1573, 1731
Barrett, Bernard M., Jr.-1674
Bartholomew, Reginald-1535
Bates, David Q., Jr.-1674
Bauer, Frank-1612
Bea, Carlos-1710
Beese, J. Carter, Jr.-1514
Beightol, David J.-1673
Berns, Alphonse-1738
Biancheri, Boris-1408, 1413
Biden, Joseph R., Jr.-1442, 1496, 1508
Black, Charles-1760
Blackwell, John Kenneth-1514
Blankespoor, Harvey D.-1474
Block, Janelle-1410
Blondin, Carmen Joseph-1409
Blount, Winton M.-1671
Bond, Christopher S-1656
Boren, David L.-1499, 1514
Boskin, Michael J-1771
Bowland, Debra Russell-1675, 1710

Bracken, Frank-1782
Brady, Nicholas F.-1402, 1483, 1514, 1708,

1771, 1782
Breunig, Robert G.-1435
Brody, Anita A.-1739
Brown, Ronald-1648
Brulte, Jim-1773
Buchanan, Patrick J.-1768
Buchanan, Wiley T.-1514, 1573
Buckley, William-1759, 1761, 1778
Buckley, William F., Jr.-1677
Burgener, Clair W.-1572
Burns, Ken-1671
Burton, Dan-1515, 1573
Busey, James Buchanan, IV-1699, 1710
Bush, Barbara P.-1579
Bush, Patty-1572
Bush, William H.T.-1572
Byrne, Eddie-1449

Calder6n Fournier, Rafael Angel-1426
Call, David L.-1709
Camilion, Oscar-1703
Carrington, Peter-1619
Casimir, Jean-1408
Castro, Fidel-1369, 1689, 1690
Chao, Elaine-1571
Cheney, Dick-1433, 1458, 1571, 1596, 1731,

1738
Cheney, Lynne V.-1672
Cicippio, Joseph-1742
Clarke, Robert L.-1568
Clement, Edith Brown-1410
Clinton, Bill-1691
Cohnes, Shadonica-1362
Collins, Mark McCampbell, Jr.-1409
Columbus, Christopher-1425
Condayan, John-1452
Cooper, Ada-1408
Cooper, Theodore-1612
Cossiga, Francesco-1613
Costa, Jose A., Jr.-1572
Cowan, Louise-1671
Cox, Ruth Gardner-1409, 1411
Crawford, John W., Jr.-1472
Crow, Trammell-1434
Crowder, Richard T.-1375, 1607
Curry, Jerry R.-1705, 1739

Danforth, John C.-1439, 1452, 1503, 1700
Danilovich, John J-1433
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D'Arcangelo, Mark J.-1472
Darman, Richard G.-1771
Dasburg, John H.-1433
Davey, Danny-1738
Davis, John R., Jr.-1614
Dawagiv, Luvsandorj-1738
de Amparo, Casa-1612
De Puget, Albert Borg Oliver-1408
del Junco, Tirso-1474
Delors, Jacques-1620
DeMent, Ira-1709
Devine, Alice A.-1434
Diller, Barry-1408
DiPrete, Carol K.-1473
Dixon, Sharon P.-1687
Dole, Robert-1417, 1503, 1514, 1549, 1648,

1655, 1700, 1702, 1707
Domenici, Pete V.-1499, 1514
Donovan, William J.-1492
Douglas, Linda-1690
Duffy, Leo P.-1573, 1585
Duke, David-1509, 1595, 1653, 1656, 1764,

1766, 1768
Dymally, Mervyn M.-1515, 1573

Eaton, Perry R-1473
Edwards, Eddie-1362
Edwards, Edwin-1653
Elliot, Ambrose, Jr.-1472
Elsey, Isabella-1781
Erwin, William W.-1612

Farman, Richard D.-1519
Fay, Charles H.-1708
Feissel, Gustave-1703
FernAndez-Ord6fiez, Francisco-1540
Ferr6, Don Luis-1678
Finnbogad6ttir, Vigdis-1421
Fitts, C. Austin-1674
Fitzwater, Marlin-1379, 1380, 1406, 1417, 1421,

1445, 1452, 1483, 1491, 1524, 1531, 1590,
1592, 1597, 1612, 1665, 1679, 1685, 1695,
1725, 1731, 1736, 1742, 1750, 1759, 1760

Fling, John-1571
Foley, Thomas S-1648, 1655
Ford, Betty-1677
Ford, Ford Barney-1474
Ford, Richard-1650
Fordice, Kirk-1593, 1738
Fore, Henrietta H.-1392
Forrest, Lou-1723
Frankel, Charles-1671
Franklin, James B.-1739
Fraser, Donald C.-1381, 1411
Fulkerson, Jewett Monroe-1473

Gallegos, Lou-1433
Garfinkel, Eric 1-1710
Gates, Robert M.-1382, 1402, 1493, 1592, 1628,
1683, 1778

Geiger, Peter-1707
Gelacak, Michael S-1514
Genscher, Hans-Dietrich-1389

Gentzler, Doreen-1686
Gephardt, Richard A.-1651
Geraldi, Michael-1612
Geraldi, Mrs. Michael-1612
Ghali, Boutros--1760
Gierke, Herman F.-1408, 1411
Gingrich, Newt-1549, 1731
Glennon, Joseph Francis-1572
Goldstein, Julia-1362
Gonzdlez Mirquez, Felipe-1540, 1572
Good, Mary L.-1675
Goodling, William F.-1700
Gorbachev, Mikhail-1368, 1370, 1375, 1386,

1413, 1503, 1534, 1543, 1572, 1603, 1607,
1684, 1768, 1778

Gordon, John A.-1543
Gradison, Willis D., Jr.-1499
Grady, Robert Edward-1699, 1710
Graham, Tony Michael-1710
Gray, Hanna-1678
Greenspan, Alan-1367, 1474
Griffith, G.O., Jr.-1710
Grimes, David-1571
Grossman, James H.-1675, 1710
Grossman, Marc-1433, 1572

Haas, Karl-1672
Hamilton, Frances E.-1473
Hamilton, Lee H.-1499
Handy, Garland-1673
Harms, Julie-1362, 1408
Harris, Suzanne S-1709
Hashemi-Rafsanjani, Ali Akbar-1404
Hatch, Orrin G.-1700
Havel, Vdclav-1479, 1514
Hawkins, Augustus F.-1700
Haynes, William R.-1739
Heilmeier, George H.-1434
Hembry, Lisa A.-1547
Hendren, Jimm Larry-1614
Herrick, John F., Jr.-1413
Higgins, William R.-1759, 1761, 1779
Hill, Anita-1440, 1444, 1458, 1495, 1509, 1510
Hill, Hugh Kenneth-1572
Hilty, Charles R.-1393
Hitt, John C.-1572
Hollings, Powell-1707
Hopkins, Larry J.-1382, 1385
Horowitz, Michael-1571
Horton, Willie-1442
Howe, Jonathan-1685
Hudson, Henry Edward-1699, 1710
Hunter, Julius-1652
Hussein, Saddam-1370, 1386, 1404, 1446, 1597,
1721

Hyde, Henry J.-1700

Iannone, Carol-1710
Ingrassia, Anthony F.-1708
Irenas, Joseph E.-1709

Jaakson, Ernst-1738

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. B-2 1991



Name Index to Issues 40-49

James, Charles H., 111-1709
James, Kay Coles-1479
Jannotta, Edgar D.-1612
Joel, Lucille A.-1708
Johnson, Earvin (Magic)-1606, 1650, 1655, 1657,

1693, 1720
Johnson, Roland H.-1409, 1411
Johnston, J. Bennett-1518, 1569
Jordan, David James-1740
Jorden, William J.-1739
Joyner, J. Curtis-1614

Kalock, Merlin-1473
Keating, Francis A., 11-1709
Kelly, John Hubert-1678, 1710
Kelly, Paul J., Jr.-1710
Kennedy, Edward M.-1505, 1700
Khalifa, Abdul Rahman bin Fares Al- -1738
Khalifa, 'Isa bin Salman Al-1446
King Juan Carlos [- 1572
Kleckner, Dean R.-1434
Kohl, Helmut-1605, 1613
Kozak, Michael G.-1380, 1411
Kozyrev, Andrei-1731
Kravchuk, Leonid-1375, 1777, 1778, 1782
Kristol, Irving-1752
Kumanyika, Shiriki K.-1709
Kuo Wei Tchen, John-1672
Kuoch, Theanvy-1571

Lansing, Allan-1781
Ledsky, Nelson C.-1703
Lee, Helen E.-1709
Leonard, Timothy D.-1711
Lester, A. David-1434
Leyden, John F.-1708
Lilley, James Roderick-1587, 1614
Lindsey, Larry-1367
Lockyear, Frank-1362
Lubbers, Ruud-1617, 1620
Lyons, James E.-1434

MacDougal, Gary-1612
Macomber, William Butts, Jr.-1572
Madigan, Edward R.-1374, 1402, 1483, 1607,
1695

Maglica, Tony-1771
Major, John-1597, 1613, 1622
Malek, Frederic V.-1760
Mandela, Nelson-1760
Marlow, Ray-1582
Marsh, Don-1648
McCormick, William T.-1518
McDonough, Richard-1362
McEntire, Reba N.-1708
McKeehan, Linda-1738
McKelvie, Roderick R.-1614
Meiklejohn, Lorraine Mindy-1433
Mellon, Andrew-1437
Menem, Carlos Sail-1661, 1668, 1674
Meshesha, Nekonnen-1612
Michel, Robert H.-1549, 1648, 1655, 1700, 1731
Miller, Marshall Lee-1612

Minick, Lynn-1513
Mitchell, George J.-1514, 1569, 1637
Mitsotakis, Constantine-1703
Mitterrand, Frangois-1405, 1605, 1613
Miyazawa, Kiichi-1641
Moley, Kevin E.-1491, 1515
Montgomery, Michael B.-1409
Moore, Jonathan-1515, 1573
Moose, George Edward-i1515, 1573
Mosbacher, Robert A.-1463, 1581, 1731, 1760
Mostoller, Cynthia-1375
Mulford, David C.-1536

Natsios, Andrew S-1411
Nazarbayev, Nursultan-1375, 1778
Nicholas, N.J., Jr.-1434
Nielson, Charles F.-1674
Noriega, Manuel A.-1370
Novello, Antonia C.-1656
Noyes, Mike-1362
Nummy, David M.-1393
Nunn, Sam-1514

O'Connor, Sandra Day-1702
O'Neill, Thomas P., Jr. (Tip)-1678
Orr, Bob-1717
Ozal, Turgut-1703

Padilla, Oscar-1573
Padova, John R.-1614
Pangle, Carl-1673
Pankin, Boris-1464
Patriarch Alesky 11-1675
Patriarch Bartholomew Archondonis-1572
Patriarch Dimitrios 1-1433
Paulino, Jos6-1454
Payne, Robert E.-1711
Pearl, Minnie-1396
Peavey, Hartley D.-1747
Perez de Cuellar de la Guerra, Javier-1703,

1742, 1759
Peters, Roberta-1410
Petersmeyer, C. Gregg-1519
Phillips, Christopher H.-1739
Phillips, Susan Meredith-1367, 1410
Picco, Giandomenico-1759
Pickering, Thomas R.-1515, 1573
Pope John Paul 11-1604, 1613
Potter, Trevor Alexander McClurg-1709, 1711
Powell, Colin L.-1506
Price, Carol-1724

Quayle, Dan-1484, 1557, 1565, 1592, 1634, 1761
Queen Beatrix-1613
Queen Sirikit-1571
Queen Sonja-1421
Queen Sophia-1572
Quick, H. Edward, Jr. -1409

Randles, Tom-1689
Randolf, Dixie-1472
Randolph, James G.-1573, 1585
Rangos, John, Jr.-1433

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. B-3 1991



Administration of George Bush, 1991

Reagan, Nancy-1587
Reagan, Ronald W.-1586, 1613
Reed, Joseph Verner, Jr.-1515, 1573
Reilly, Edward F.-1739, 1740
Reis, Victor H.-1380, 1411
Richards, Ann-1580
Robinson, C. Paul-1416
Robinson, James D., 111-1434
Robinson, Sue L.-1411
Robreno, Eduardo C.-1740
Rockefeller, Margaretta F.-1573
Rodriguez, Laura-1513
Rodriguez, Sylvan-1576
Roemer, Buddy-1369, 1510, 1653
Rogers, Edward M., Jr.-1507
Rostenkowski, Dan-1606, 1648, 1655, 1771
Roy, Mimi-1571
Ryerson, William Edwin-1575

Sabah, Jabir al-Ahmad al-Jabir al- -1372
Salinas de Gortari, Carlos-1368, 1570, 1571
Saunders, Warner-1693
Savimbi, Jonas-1417
Say, Peggy-1759
Scarborough, Chuck-1687
Schaeffer, John W., Jr.-1473
Schieffer, Kevin V-1515
Schiff, Steve-1654
Schliiter, Poul-1473
Schrote, John-1708
Schwarzenegger, Arnold-1645
Scowcroft, Brent-1731
Seager, Floyd-1362
Seba, Leo-1472
Sebesta, James A.-1473
Serra y Serra, Narcis-1572
Serrano Elias, Jorge-1380
Shakespeare, Frank-1572
Shamir, Yitzhak-1709
Shevardnadze, Eduard-1683
Shirley, Betty-1781
Shrontz, Frank Anderson-1434
Simpson, John R.-1739, 1740
Skinner, Samuel K.-1760, 1766, 1781
Soglo, Nicephore-1589, 1590
Soran, Bob-1745
Spangler, Scott M.-1704, 1739
Sparks, Sam-1411
Steen, Alann-1750
Stohr, Donald J.-1710
Stone, Richard B.-1626
Stone, Ron-1562
Stoup, Elizabeth-1673
Strauss, Annette-1584 I
Stuart, Bill-1692
Sturdivant, John N.-1708
Sullivan, Leon-1677
Sullivan, Louis W.-1608, 1610, 1684, 1777
Sununu, John H.-1408, 1409, 1434, 1435, 1472,

1473, 1514, 1571, 1613, 1674, 1675, 1688,
1708, 1709, 1719, 1739, 1751, 1761, 1762,
1781, 1782

Sutherland, Thomas-1679, 1685
Swendiman, Alan Robert-1675, 1710

Taft, Robert-1613
Tahir-Kheli, Shirin Raziuddin-1515, 1573
Tar, Pal-1738
Taylor, William-1554
Tchirkow, Peter A.-1708
Teeter, Robert-1760
Ter-Petrosian, Levon-1665
Thamae, Tseliso-1408
Thomas, Clarence-1382, 1428, 1431, 1438, 1441,
1443, 1444, 1452, 1458, 1464, 1495, 1499,
1506, 1508, 1510, 1561

Thomas, Scott E.-1709, 1711
Thompson, Morris-1473
Thompson, Tommy-1717
Thornburgh, Dick-1382, 1409, 1590, 1593,
1608, 1649, 1653

Thurman, Maxwell R.-1739
Tobias, Robert M.-1708
Tofilau Eti Alesana-1421
Tompkins, Arnold R.-1645
Tomy, Sadie-1433
Train, Russell-1677
Traxler, William J., Jr.-1710
Turner, Jesse-1483
Turner, Pamela J.-1614
Tyroler, Charles, 11-1614

Ungaro, Ursula Mancusi-1740
Upadhyay, Yog Prasad-1738

Vassiliou, George-1704
Velazco, Sheila K.-1708
Vessey, John W.-1473
Voinovich, George-1723
Von Hayek, Friedrich-1678
Vranitzky, Franz-1435
Vreeland, Frederick-1710

Waite, Terry-1679, 1685
Wallace, Robert-1410
Wallop, Malcolm-1518, 1569
Walsh, Thomas J.-1708
Walters, Vernon-1678
Ward, Dave-1578
Ward, Gregg-1573, 1585
Watanabe, Ruth K.-1435
Watson, Alexander Fletcher-1515, 1573
Watson, Peter S-1514, 1515
Webster, Rudi Valentine-1738
Werlein, Ewing, Jr.-1711
West, Dottie-1396
Whichard, Jordan-1680
White, Byron R.-1465, 1702
White, George C.-1674
White, Paul-1708
Whitman, Marina V.N.-1434
Whittlesey, Eunice B.-1435
Wilkie, Laverna-1472
Williams, Ernest Wilson-1410
Williams, Gwendolyn-1571

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. B-4 1991



Name Index to Issues 40-49

Williams, Jerre S.-1433
Williams, Kenny Jackson-1675, 1710
Williams, Polly-1717
Williams, Ted-1677
Wilson, Francis-1408
Winters, J. Sam-1474
Wiss, Robert E.-1408, 1411
Woerner, Manfred-1435, 1613

Wofford, Harris-1593, 1595, 1649
Wurst, Dian-1362

Yakovlev, Aleksandr-1683, 1684
Yeltsin, Boris-1370, 1375, 1539, 1778
Yeutter, Clayton K.-1768
Yilmaz, Mesut-1703

Zarb, Frank G.-1410

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. B-5 1991



HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. B-6 1991



Document Categories List

Administration of George Bush, 1991

Addresses to the Nation

Daily Points of Light program-1357
Thanksgiving-1736
Veterans Day-1617

Addresses and Remarks

See also Addresses to the Nation; Meetings
With Foreign Leaders and International Offi-
cials

Alice Deal Junior High School, meeting with
students and faculty-1375

American Business Press Association, Points of
Light awards ceremony-1453

American Enterprise Institute-1752
American Gas Association, teleconference with

meeting in San Diego, CA-1517
Andrew Mellon Dinner-1437
Arlington National Cemetery, wreath-laying

ceremony-1626
Asia Society, dinner in New York City-1639
Associated Press Managing Editors, teleconfer-

ence with convention in Detroit, MI-1455
Beacon Council, annual meeting in Miami,

FL-1366
Central Intelligence Agency, swearing-in of Di-

rector Gates in Langley, VA-1628
Civil justice reform, Executive order signing

ceremony-1484
Civil Rights Act of 1991, signing ceremony-

1699
Columbus Day, proclamation signing ceremo-

ny-1425
Country music awards, 25th anniversary cele-

bration in Nashville, TN-1396
Crime Stoppers International, annual confer-

ence in Louisville, KY-1383
Daily Points of Light celebration in Orlando,

FL-1361, 1364, 1365
Education community, meeting in Columbus,
OH-1714

Energy Department and Advanced-Battery
Consortium agreement, announcement-
1502

Environmental Youth Awards, presentation
ceremony-1588

Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation, swear-
ing-in of Chairman Taylor-1554

Fortune 500 Forum, teleconference with meet-
ing in Charleston, SC-1667

Future Farmers of America, meeting in Kansas
City, MO-1645

Addresses and Remarks-Continued
German-American Day, proclamation signing

ceremony-1389
Justice Department, swearing-in ceremony for

William Barr as Attorney General-1731
Kiwanis and Rotary Clubs, meeting in Ontario,

CA-1773
Mag Instrument, meeting with employees in

Ontario, CA-1771
Marlow Industries, meeting with employees in

Dallas, TX-1581
Middle East peace conference, opening session

in Madrid, Spain-1543
National Adoption Week, proclamation signing

ceremony-1733
National Basketball Association champions,

meeting with Chicago Bulls-1378
National Endowment for the Humanities,

awards presentation ceremony-1671
National Fraternal Congress of America, annual

convention-1393
National Italian-American Foundation, fund-

raising dinner-1413
National Law Enforcement Officers Memorial,

dedication ceremony-1448
Netherlands, meeting with the American com-

munity in The Hague-1624
Peavey Electronics, meeting with employees in

Meridian, MS-1747
Presidential Elementary Award for Excellence

in Mathematics and Science Teaching, meet-
ing with recipients-1397

Presidential Medal of Freedom, presentation
ceremony-1677

President's Commission on Educational Excel-
lence for Hispanic Americans, meeting-
1665

President's Environment and Conservation
Challenge Awards, presentation ceremony-
1549

Public administration groups, meeting-1495
Religious Alliance Against Pornography, confer-

ence-1429
Republican congressional leadership, meet-

ing-1548
Republican Party campaign events

Kentucky-1385
Louisiana-1369
Missouri-1656
New York-1634
Texas--1557, 1565

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. C-1 1991



Administration of George Bush, 1991

Addresses and Remarks-Continued
Ronald Reagan Presidential Library, dedication

ceremony in Simi Valley, CA-1586
Southern Newspaper Publishers Association,

teleconference with meeting in Boca Raton,
FL-1679

Supreme Court of the U.S., swearing-in cere-
mony for designate Clarence Thomas-1464

Thanks-Giving Square, dedication ceremony in
Dallas, TX-1584

Thanksgiving Day, proclamation signing cere-
mony-1713

Travel and tourism, meeting with chief execu-
tive officers-1520

Tropicana Products, Inc., meeting with em-
ployees in Bradenton, FL--1744

Vatican City, American Seminary-1604
Veterans of the Office of Strategic Services

Dinner-1492
World Series champions, recognition ceremony

for the Minnesota Twins-1555

Announcements

See also Addresses and Remarks; Digest, Nomi-
nations Submitted, and Checklist at the end
of each issue

Points of Light Recognition Program-1408,
1432, 1472, 1513, 1571, 1612, 1673, 1707,
1738, 1781

Appointments and Nominations

See also Digest, Nominations Submitted, and
Checklist at the end of each issue

Agriculture Department, Assistant Secretary
(Administration)-1393

Defense Department
Assistant Secretary (International Security Af-

fairs)-1587
Deputy Under Secretary (Acquisition)-1381
Director of Defense Research and Engineer-

ing-1380
Energy Department

Assistant Secretaries
Congressional and Intergovernmental Af-

fairs-1585
Environmental Restoration and Waste

Management-1585
Fossil Energy-1585

Health and Human Services Department
Assistant Secretary (Management and

Budget--1645
Deputy Secretary-1491

Justice Department, U.S. Marshals Service, Di-
rector-1699

Management and Budget Office, Deputy Di-
rector-1699

National Drug Control Policy Office, Associate
Director-1479

National Museum Services Board, member-
1547

Presidential campaign advisory group
Campaign manager-1760

Appointments and Nominations-Continued
Presidential campaign advisory group-

Continued
Chairman and chief political strategist-1760
General chairman-1760
Senior adviser-1760

State Department
Ambassadors

Albania-1575
Denmark-1626
El Salvador-1380
Finland-1678

Transportation Department
Deputy Secretary-1699
Federal Aviation Administration, Administra-

tor-1705
Treasury Department, Assistant Secretary

(Management)-1393
U.S. Information Agency, Associate Director

(Management)-1452
U.S. International Development Cooperation

Agency
Agency for International Development

Assistant Administrator (Asia Bureau)-
1392

Associate Administrator (Operations)-
1704

White House Office
Chief of Staff to the President-1760
Deputy Assistant to the President for Nation-

al Security Affairs-1685
Special Assistant to the President for Ad-

vance-1413
Special Assistant to the President for Inter-

governmental Affairs-1673
Special Assistant to the President for Nation-

al Security Affairs-1543

Bill Signings

Bulgaria, most-favored-nation trading status-
1643

Civil Rights Act of 1991-1701
Continuing appropriations for fiscal year

1992-1525, 1667
Czechoslovakia and Hungary, trade with U.S.-

1757
Department of Transportation and Related

Agencies Appropriations Act-1526
Departments of Commerce, Justice, and State,

the Judiciary, and Related Agencies Appro-
priations Act-1529

District of Columbia Mental Health Program
Assistance Act of 1991-1575

Foreign Relations Authorization Act-1526
Intelligence Authorization Act, Fiscal Year

1992-1758
National Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal

Years 1992 and 1993-1769
Treasury, Postal Service and General Govern-

ment Appropriations Act-1525

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. C-2 1991



Bill Signings-Continued
Tribal Self-Governance Demonstration Project

Act-1758
Veterans' Compensation Rate Amendments of

1991-1632

Bill Vetoes

Departments of Labor, Health and Human
Services, and Education, and Related Agen-
cies Appropriations Act, memorandum of dis-
approval-1684

Emergency Unemployment Compensation Act
of 1991, memorandum of disapproval-1432

Communications to Congress

Argentina, Treaty on Mutual Assistance in
Criminal Matters, message-1547

Bahamas, extradition treaty, message-1524
Budget deferrals, message-1365
Bulgaria, beneficiary country under the Gener-

alized System of Preferences, letter-1756
Crime legislation, letter-1725
Cyprus conflict, letter-1703
Export controls report, message-1459
Haiti, Executive order prohibiting certain

transactions, message-1553
Iran, continuation of the U.S. national emer-

gency, message-1632
Jamaica, Treaty on Mutual Assistance in Crimi-

nal Matters, message-1517
Mexico, determination not to impose trade

sanctions, message-1479
National Highway Traffic Safety Administra-

tion, annual report, message-1548
Nuclear warhead dismantlement and special

nuclear defense controls, verification of,
letter-1416

Panama
Panamanian Government assets held by the

U.S., message-1392
Treaty on Mutual Assistance in Criminal

Matters, message-1500
Pelagic driftnet fishing, deferral of sanctions,

message-1462
Regulatory Program of the U.S. Government,

message-1591
Small business, annual report, message-1523
Soviet Union, trade with U.S., letter-1423
Strategic arms reduction agreement, possible

effects on the Trident submarine program,
letter-1416

Strategic Arms Reduction Talks (START)
Treaty, message-1726

Travel, transportation, and subsistence reduc-
tions-1735

Uruguay, Treaty on Mutual Legal Assistance in
Criminal Matters, message-1644

Communications to Federal Agencies

Czechoslovakia
Emigration policies, memorandum-1455

Document Categories List to Issues 40-49

Communications to Federal Agencies-
Continued

Czechoslovakia-Continued
Trade with U.S., memorandum-1780

Hungary, trade with U.S., memorandum-1780
Poland, trade with U.S., memorandum-1781
Senegal, U.S. assistance, memorandum-1644
Soviet Union, employment of Soviet nationals

at U.S. diplomatic and consular missions,
memorandum-1501

Executive Orders

Civil justice reform-1485
Delegation of Functions and Authorities, De-

velopment of Requirements and Regulations,
and Correction of Title-1696

Federal Agency Recycling and the Council on
Federal Recycling and Procurement Policy-
1551

Federal Water Pollution Control Act, as
amended by the Oil Pollution Act of 1990,
implementation of Section 311-1466

Haiti, U.S. prohibition on transactions-1406,
1532

National Defense Service Medal, extension-
1418

President's Volunteer Action Award amend-
ment-1702

Interviews With News Media

Exchanges with reporters
Columbus, OH-1717, 1720, 1723
Houston, TX-1562, 1576, 1578
Ijamsville, MD-1438
NBC Television stations-1686
Rome, Italy-1597
St. Louis, MO-1648, 1650, 1652, 1654
White House-1381, 1396, 1428, 1431, 1444,
1452, 1483, 1589, 1683, 1706, 1730, 1770

Joint news conferences
European Community, President Delors-
1620

Netherlands, Prime Minister Lubbers-1620
Soviet Union, President Gorbachev-1534
Spain, Prime Minister Gonzdlez-1540

News conferences
October 4 (No. 105)-1399
October 25 (No. 106)-1503
October 29 (No. 107)-1534
October 29 (No. 108)-1540
November 6 (No. 109)-1592
November 8 (No. 110)-1604
November 9 (No. 111)-1620
December 5 (No. 112)-1760

Joint Statements

Czechoslovakia-U.S. cooperation-1481
Libyan indictments resulting from the bomb-

ing of Pan Am 103-1735
NATO summit in Rome, Italy

Peace and cooperation-1599

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. C-3 1991



Administration of George Bush, 1991

Joint Statements-Continued
NATO summit in Rome, Italy-Continued

Soviet Union-1598

Letters and Messages

Hanukkah-1744

Meetings With Foreign Leaders and
International Officials

Angola, Jonas Savimbi-1417
Argentina, President Menem-1661, 1674
Austria, Chancellor Vranitzky-1435
Bahrain, Amir 'Isa Khalifa-1446
Benin, President Soglo-1589, 1590
Costa Rica, President Calder6n-1426
Czechoslovakia, President Havel-1479, 1514
Denmark, Prime Minister Schliter-1473
European Community, President Delors-1620
France, President Mitterrand-1613
Germany, Chancellor Kohl-1613
Guatemala, President Serrano-1380
Haiti, President Aristide-1396
Hungary, Prime Minister Antall-1406
Iceland, President Finnbogad6ttir-1421
Israel, Prime Minister Shamir-1709
Italy

President Cossiga-1613
Prime Minister Andreotti-1613

Kuwait, Amir Sabah-1372
Mexico, President Salinas de Gortari-1571
Netherlands

Prime Minister Lubbers-1617, 1620
Queen Beatrix-1613

North Atlantic Treaty Organization, Secretary
General Woerner-1435, 1613

Norway, Queen Sonja-1421
South Africa, Nelson Mandela-1760
Soviet Union

Foreign Minister Kozyrev of the Republic of
Russia-1731

Moscow Patriarch Alesky 11-1675
President Akayev of the Republic of Kyrgys-

tan-1514
President Gorbachev-1534, 1572
President Ter-Petrosian of the Republic of

Armenia-1665
Senior Adviser Yakovlev-1683, 1684

Spain
Deputy Prime Minister Serra-1572
Prime Minister Gonzdlez-1540, 1572

Thailand, Queen Sirikit-1571
United Kingdom, Prime Minister Major-1597,

1613
United Nations, Secretary-General-Elect

Ghali-1760
Vatican City, Pope John Paul 11-1613
Western Samoa, Prime Minister Tofilau Eti

Alesana-1421

Notices

Iran, continuation of the U.S. national emer-
gency-1632

Proclamations

Canada-U.S. Free-Trade Agreement, Harmo-
nized Tariff Schedule-1358

Child Health Day-1415
Columbus Day-1425
Community Center Month-1490
Country Music Month-1451
Crime Prevention Month-1461
Dutch-American Heritage Day-1666
Federal Civilian Employees Remembrance

Day-1750
Generalized System of Preferences, amend-

ments-1756, 1769
Geography Awareness Week-1742
German-American Day-1391
Hire a Veteran Week-1633
Mental Illness Awareness Week-1420
National Accessible Housing Month-1728
National Adoption Week-1734
National Alzheimer's Disease Month-1631
National American Indian Heritage Month-

1546
National Breast Cancer Awareness Month-

1500
National Children's Day-1430
National Consumers Week-1465
National Disability Employment Awareness

Month-1419
National Down Syndrome Awareness Month-

1477
National Family Caregivers Week-1729
National Family Week-1698
National Farm-City Week-1697
National Firefighters Day-1418
National Home Care Week-1743
National Hospice Month-1591
National Law Enforcement Memorial Dedica-

tion Day-1450
National Military Families Recognition Day-

1705
National Pearl Harbor Remembrance Day-

1741
National Philanthropy Day-1672
National Poison Prevention Week-1627
National Radon Action Week-1407
National Red Ribbon Month-1642
National Red Ribbon Week for a Drug-Free

America-1511
National Women Veterans Recognition Week-

1630
Polish-American Heritage Month-1424
Refugee Day-1522
Soviet Union, trade with U.S.-1422
Thanksgiving Day-1713
United Nations Day-1477
Veterans Day-1388
White Cane Safety Day-1374
World Food Day-1445
World Population Awareness Week-1512

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. C-4 1991



Resignations and Retirements

Chief of Staff to the President-1751

Statements by the President

See also Addresses and Remarks; Bill Signings
Central Intelligence, confirmation of Robert

Gates as Director-1592
Credit, efforts to ensure the availability of-

1421
Middle East peace conference-1464
Release of hostages from Lebanon-1759
Soviet Union, Presidential mission-1374
Supreme Court of the U.S., confirmation of

Clarence Thomas as an Associate Justice-
1452

Statements Other Than Presidential

See also Meetings With Foreign Leaders and
International Officials; Resignations and Re-
tirements

Anti-narcotics summit-1524

Document Categories List to Issues 40-49

Statements Other Than Presidential-Continued
Budget, continuing appropriations-1380
Bulgarian-American Enterprise Fund-1612
Cabinet meeting-1417
Condemnation of terrorism on the West

Bank-1531
Congressional adjournment-1736
Conventional Forces in Europe Treaty, ratifica-

tion-1725
Family planning legislation-1685
House Republican economic growth package-

1731
Kuwait, extinguishing of oil well fires-1597
Middle East peace conference-1491
Nobel Peace Prize winner-1445
Nuclear arms reduction talks-1452
Pacific nations, postponement of President's

trip-1592
Release of hostages from Lebanon-1483, 1679,
1685, 1742, 1750, 1759

Soviet Union, food assistance-1695

HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. C-5 1991



HeinOnline  -- 27 Weekly Comp. Pres. Docs. C-6 1991


